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Where’s 
Stevie? 
By David Gans 

FANTASY ISLAND. Ca.—On the 
kitchen table in Mick Fleetwood’s 
Malibu mansion sits a model of the 
stage design for Fleet wood Mac's up¬ 
coming American tour. In between 
the tiny amplifiers, drums and pi¬ 
anos stand cardboard cutouts repre¬ 
senting the five members of the 
band. There's a Lindsey Bucking¬ 
ham doll, a John Me Vie doll, etcet¬ 
era. Why does the Stevie Nicks doll 
have a cigarette burn where her 
heart is supposed to be? And why is a 
hand crumpling the fat, white ex¬ 
pressionless thing into a little ball 
and tossing it into a trash can? 
MALIBU, Ca.—This scenario is en-

I tirely fictitious. It is a product of a 
¡demented writer’s imagination, 
¡fueled by observations of Stevie 
¡Nicks’s apparent hostility towards 
I the rest of Fleetwood Mac, encour¬ 
aged by a sadistic editor, and 
¡starved by the brain-damaged ille-
Jgals who run the hotel where I or¬ 
dered a room-service burger that 
never came and attempted to write 
about what really happened at Mick 
Fleetwood’s house that afternoon. 

Continued on page 12 

Quarterflash 
Working On 
New Album 
NEW YORK—You expect the 
leader of a hot new band to come on 
a bit confident and cocksure of him¬ 
self— after all, how many new 
bands can actually say they broke 
through in 1981? You can count 

Hilly Zoom, John Doe, Exene, D.J. Bonehrake: Rock in the American mode. 

: Poised For The Breakthrough 
By Eric Flaum 
NEW YORK—X is honest and 
American and wants to sell lots of 
records and be successful. Not that 
these qualities are interconnected, 
but each one’s important when the 
discussion concerns a band on the 
verge of a breakthrough. Little 
more than two years ago, X was 
just another L.A. new wave group 
recording for an independent label, 
Slash Records, under the produc¬ 
tion guidance of a familiar name in 
rock circles, former Doors keyboar¬ 
dist Ray Manzarek. 
Then the press accolades started 

pouring in for the band’s two Slash 
albums, Los Angeles and Wild Gift 
(the latter was named by several 
publications as 198 l’s top album). 
When sales of Wild Gift topped the 
100,000 mark, the big companies 
suddenly took notice; one, Elektra, 
proffered a contract. Now X’s first 
major label LP, Under The Big 
Black Sun (also produced by Man¬ 
zarek), has been duly acclaimed as 
one of 1982’s finest releases, and the 
band suddenly finds itself inching 
ever closer to mainstream accep¬ 
tance without having to compro¬ 
mise its musical standards. 

All this commotion, plus a rigor¬ 
ous touring schedule, is emotionally 
and physically exhausting, but bass¬ 
ist-vocalist John Doe at least puts it 
in the proper perspective when he 
allows as to how “it’s a lot more fun 
being in a successful band that’s so 
busy you never have any time than 
it is having an unsuccessful career, 
a lot of time on your hands and no 
money to do anything." 
X is justifiably in demand. And 

more people are being given a 
chance to see the band in its natural 
element as the current tour takes it 
into larger venues, such as the 
3000-seat Palladium in New York 
City. That these shows equal the in¬ 
tensity of the club performances 
proves X belongs at this plateau. 

In concert, guitarist Billy Zoom 
stands practically immobile, posi¬ 
tioning himself in a considered 
stance, with a thin smile plastered 
onto his face. When he rips out an 
infrequent solo, the crowd cheers 
but the smile never broadens. 
Drummer D.J. Bonebrake is anoth¬ 
er case entirely. He works on his 
relatively small drum kit with sub¬ 
dued ferocity; as the band launches 
into “The Hungry Wolf,” he un¬ 

leashes a relentless assault that 
gives backbone to the song’s rhyth¬ 
mic thrust. 
Doe and his wife, Exene Cer¬ 

venka, are the visual center of X’s 
show. Trading off lyrics with fur¬ 
tive smiles and knowing glances, 
Doe shuffles back and forth across 
the stage with his bass, while Exene 
floats about in a slow, surrealistic 
dance. She assumes the spotlight 
naturally; but unlike, say, Blondie, 
you can’t imagine X having to ham¬ 
mer home the point that it is a 
band: Exene, Doe, Bonebrake and 
Zoom function too consciously and 
too sympathetically as a unit. 

Offstage, Doe and Exene remain 
X’s focal point and its most verbal 
members. Exene is about five feet 
tall, with streaks of blonde dyed 
into her black hair. She looks like a 
new wave Raggedy Ann with a 
touch of the Bride of Frankenstein. 
First and foremost. Exene considers 
herself a poet, and her abiding phi¬ 
losophy is that “people should ex¬ 
perience as many different things as 
possible.” She propogates this no¬ 
tion in the lyrics of her songs, but 
her politics, she is quick to point 
out, are strictly of the sexual kind. 

“We don’t rant and rave about poli¬ 
tics,” she declares, “and we don’t 
rant and rave about what’s wrong 
with society. It’s obvious, and peo¬ 
ple don’t go to gigs or listen to re¬ 
cords to hear that.” 
Though soft-spoken, Doe speaks 

openly about any subject that pops 
to mind, and turns out to be articu¬ 
late and often brutally honest. He 
has, for example, alienated many of 
Los Angeles’ hard-core new wave 
fans by labelling the more extreme 
ones “Nazis.” Doe admits he might 
be better off keeping his mouth shut 
sometimes, but says he believes it’s 
more important “to be as honest as 
you can if you feel something at a 
particular time and someone asks 
you about it.” 

X’s honesty may have caused 
trouble on occasion—and Exene, 
apparently cognizant of this, has 
been known to jump into conversa¬ 
tions and steer them off onto a dif¬ 
ferent tangent or simply stop them 
dead in their tracks—but it’s also 
been the basis for the band’s pro¬ 
gress. As committed as they are to 
new music, the musicians realized 
after the release of Wild Gift that 

Continued on page 21 
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Rindy Ross 

them on the fingers of one hand. So 
say hey, Marv Ross, how did Quar¬ 
terflash handle having a hit record 
first time out? 
“We’ve been scared to death for a 

year” is Ross’s straightforward, 
somewhat disarming reply. He goes 
on to explain that this particular 
state of mind applied even before 
Quarterflash began recording its de-

Continued on page 7 
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letters 
Heart 
NEVER BEFORE HAVE I SEEN 
a writer give a more accurate ex¬ 
amination of a band or an album as 
Mark Mehler did in your July issue 
(“Heart’s Biggest Gamble”). I 
think it’s about time writers gave 
Heart a break, rather than devoting 
an entire article to their personal 
opinions of the band. 

Heart is just about my favorite 
band, and I really was shocked to 
hear about the personnel changes. I 
hope the new players are good re¬ 
placements, because I just spent 
$120 for second row center seats to 
their concert at the L.A. Forum. If 
you think that doesn’t clean out a 
teenager, you are so wrong! 

KELLEY PARK 
Fountain Valley, Ca. 

“I WONDER WHAT PEOPLE 
are thinking,” Ann Wilson pon¬ 
dered in your July Heart feature. 
Well, I’ll tell ya, Ann. It’s nice to 
hear about this musical change of 
Heart, but it’s saddening to think 
about what caused the change. In 
’76, Heart was a breath of fresh air 
in the “stuffy” world of rock ’n’ roll 
“stars” and business Barracudas: a 
band that cared more about their 
music and their fans than about liv¬ 
ing out their star roles. Just like one 
of us—KIDS, living and loving 
rock ’n’ roll. It’s too bad they had to 
grow up. 

Fine. Well, keep in touch. Next, 
please ... 

HEART FAN #728 
Tacoma, Washington 

Ozzy Osbourne 
OZZY FAN DAN ROBBINS (“A 
reader Stands Up For Ozzy Os¬ 
bourne,” Hit Man, July issue) must 
come from a town something like 
the one I live in. When I moved to 
New Brighton in February of ’81, 
I’m sure the stores couldn’t keep 

Back In Black in stock. Then came 
Dirty Deeds. If it wasn’t very good 
in ’76, why is it so great now? Then 
came sacred Ozzy Osbourne. I’ve 
memorized all of his songs—and I 
don’t even like him. I was at a party 
two nights ago with all of these mu¬ 
sically aware people. And I said, “I 
think Ozzy sucks.” I knew it would 
hit a nerve. I also said something 
about how I thought all modern 
guitarists patterned themselves af¬ 
ter guys like Eric Clapton, Jimmy 
Page and Jimi Hendrix. I asked, 
“Didn’t you ever hear of the 
Yardbirds?” 
Someone said, “That sounds like 

fairies.” I left. 
Anyways, what I wanted to write 

about was all of the over-synthe¬ 
sized music now. Asia is a disgrace 
to all of the groups this “super¬ 
group” ’s members came from. An¬ 
other one that’s pretty sad is Aldo 
Nova. For shame! I only mentioned 
two groups, so here’s some more: J. 
Geils, Foreigner, Journey (too com¬ 
mercial, always), Tommy Tutone— 
you know, the thing that bums me 
out is that I’m starting to listen to 
this crap. Even some of the older 
groups are adopting that “sound”: 
CSN, Jethro Tull, Heart, Pete 
Townshend (yea, Pete!), Paul 
McCartney. My faves are the 
Doors, Cream, Bad Co., Deep Pur¬ 
ple, Beatles, Uriah Heep, Steely 
Dan (just recently)—all groups I’ll 
probably never see. I wish I was 
born earlier than ’65. Hey, keep up 
the good work. 

CINDY KRESTAUT 
New Brighton, Pa. 

LIKE DAN ROBBINS, I'M FROM 
Connecticut, but I have a different 
impression of Ozzy Osbourne. 
To begin with, he’s just a fad. His 

fans will soon get sick of his un¬ 
amusing stunts with animals and 
people. Anyone who does the things 
he does isn’t normal. And the fans 
who get a kick out of it are really 
sick, too. I think we have to stop the 
jerk. 

In the March issue of Record 
there was a six-paragraph section of 
Ozzy’s quotes on Black Sabbath, 
himself, Billy Graham, his ex-wife, 
family and life. Maybe he was tell¬ 
ing the truth, but the way he word¬ 
ed everything was the worst. 
My friends call him a dick, ass¬ 

hole and other words that describe 
him to a T. And as you might have 
guessed, we love him just as much 
as we love homework. 
Dan Robbins might like to know 

that the newspapers said that the 
concerts in New Haven and Hart¬ 
ford were terrible. And for his in¬ 
formation, the Rolling Stones are 
pure rock ’n’ roll—not a fad. Pure, 
stick-to-it, speaker-shaking rock! 

RONDA HODGE 
Coventry, Connecticut 

EARLIER THIS YEAR I HAD 
the misfortune of being “kid¬ 
napped” and taken to an Ozzy Os¬ 
bourne “concert.” I have never 
heard such noise being passed off as 
music. 
The only vocal phrasing I could 

hear was Mr. O’s numerous pleas of 
“raise your hands.” We left after 30 
minutes, due to fear of eardrum 
damage. 

I can only add that Mr. Robbins 
must be between the ages of 12 and 
16 and almost deaf. Anyone deriv¬ 
ing any enjoyment from Mr. O 
would probably have enjoyed Hit¬ 
ler’s antics. 

DON MILLIKEN 
Ft. Smith, Arkansas 

I ONCE HAD THE HONOR OF 
being front row center at an Ozzy 
Osbourne concert and can state un¬ 
equivocally my admiration for his 
skill as a showman. I do hope, how¬ 
ever, that on his next visit to T-
town, he will see fit to kiss my ass. 

GARY HAMILTON 
Tulsa, Oklahoma 
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New Artists 
— 

American 
Grandstand 
By Dave Marsh 

TheOnlyRockThat Matters 

Early in July, I saw Dan Daley play at the Bottom Line, as 
the opening act for the estimable Marshall Crenshaw. 
Crenshaw’s musical vision is so precisely focussed that it 
immediately and unavoidably drew attention to the limi¬ 
tations of Daley’s more scattered presentation. But in a 

way, all this contrast between crafty stylization and awkward enthusi¬ 
asm only made Daley’s potential seem more impressive. At least he 
wasn’t afraid to stand before a gaggle of hipsters and play heartland 
rock ’n’ roll. 

Daley is blond and lanky, and he still wears t-shirts and jeans on¬ 
stage, the last sort of rocker you’d expect to find in Greenwich Village 
these days (Crenshaw may be from Detroit but his horn rims provide 
an immediate stylistic connection to the new wave). Daley’s stage 
presence is grounded more in intensity of desire than charisma, and 
his band, which played fairly well, looked as if the members had not 
known one another long enough to feel polite in suggesting appropri 

Marshall Crenshaw: too old to he a punk. ” 

TheTraditional Mr. Crenshaw 
By David Gans 
SAN FRANCISCO—After Mar¬ 
shall Crenshaw’s performance at a 
local night club here in early June, 
punkers could be seen sulking and 
slouching around as if they’d sud¬ 
denly realized that this might be the 
next fashion for them to follow and 
that they might have to put smiling 
back into their emotional reper¬ 
toires. Dancers on the floor and 
scene-watchers lining the room all 
shared in the exuberance of Cren¬ 
shaw’s show; I can’t remember the 
last time a club set—or an album by 
a new artist—left me so breathless 
and hungry for more. 

Offstage, Crenshaw seems as 
blithe as the Eisenhower/JFK years 
his musical persona evokes. He 
spins platters and makes with the 
chatter at a college radio station in 
Berkeley, seguing with an impish 
grin from Eddie Cochran to “Lara’s 
Theme” by Ray Conniff to a track 
by Slade. Ask him about musical in¬ 
fluences and you’ll feel as though 
you’ve entered a time warp: Les 
Paul and Mary Ford, Phil Spector, 
Brian Wilson, Little Richard, 
and—above all—The Beatles. “I 
like the early Beatles best by far,” 
he says. “I’m sure not too many 
people agree with me, but I think 
they said as much with four instru¬ 
ments on songs like ‘Please, Please 
Me’ and ‘I Want to Hold Your 
Hand’ as they did later on when 
they added everything else.” 

It’s the sound of those records— 
as well as the strength of the materi¬ 
al and the way the instruments were 
recorded in the days before technol¬ 
ogy began influencing style—that 
has held Crenshaw in thrall 
through the years. The 28-year-old 
Detroit native picked up the guitar 
at age eight and absorbed Buddy 
Holly’s style just in time to be 
knocked over by The Beatles. 
Through the usual spate of school¬ 
years bands, playing a little of this 
and a little of that style, from surf 
music to country & western, Cren¬ 
shaw always found his attention re¬ 
turning to the music that first 

captured his heart. “I followed rock 
music sort of day-to-day until 
around 1972, when I just couldn’t 
latch onto very much contempo¬ 
rary rock music at all,” he explains. 
“I didn’t like any of it, so I just 
completely blew it off and got really 
interested in old rock ’n’ roll. 

“If you listen to the FM radio for 
an hour, you’re going to hear most¬ 
ly stuff that was made between 
around ’69 and ’74. I don’t under¬ 
stand what’s so good about that 
music. It’s not so good that people 
have to hear it over and over again, 
year after year. Rock ’n’ roll in gen¬ 
eral is too good and has too much 
depth and too much variety for any¬ 
one to be obsessed with one little as¬ 
pect of it.” 

Interestingly, it was the Sex Pis¬ 
tols that pulled Crenshaw back into 
present-day music. “I heard the Sex 
Pistols, Nick Lowe, Elvis Costello 
and Dave Edmunds all in about the 
same week, and it was a real treat,” 
he says. “To hear all that stuff at 
once and have it all be something 
new that I really liked was a real de¬ 
parture for me. I thought the Sex 
Pistols were great, and funny and 
interesting and cool. I still think 
their record is great. 

“That’s what got me back into 
listening to contemporary rock mu¬ 
sic at all,” he concludes. “I’m too 
old to be a punk, but I like diversi¬ 
ty—I’m not going to throw all my 
eggs in one basket.” 

Following a brief and fruitless 
trip to Los Angeles and an 18-
month stint as John Lennon in a 
road company of Beatlemania, 
Crenshaw set out to try his luck as a 
songwriter and performer in New 
York City. He worked up his songs 
on a four-track tape recorder in his 
apartment, deliberately going for a 
sound that emphasizes spirit and 
character over smoothness, and 
then he and his brother, Robert, a 
drummer, turned their attention to 
putting a band together. 

“I didn’t know exactly what kind 
of band to have when we first start¬ 
ed. I thought in the beginning about 

getting a pedal steel guitar player, 
because I’m a big Hank Williams 
fan and I love really raunchy steel 
guitar. Then I thought for a second 
about getting an accordion player, 
or something like that that would 
give our show a weird sound . . 
He pauses to picture it in his mind, 
then laughs and says, “And besides, 
people might get violent, you 
know?” 
The group came together, Cren¬ 

shaw notes, when bassist Chris 
Donato stepped in. “When I saw 
what he could do I said, ‘This is it; 
the three of us can really take this 
somewhere.’ ” 
Crenshaw says that the trio for¬ 

mat kept the band’s overhead low 
enough that they could afford to 
work for next to nothing, “just to 
get out in front of people, without 
draining anybody’s resources. Once 
we proved to ourselves that people 
liked what we were doing, we con¬ 
centrated on developing our ap¬ 
proach to the songs, and the labels 
started coming around to see us.” 

Richard Gottehrer (Go-Go’s, 
Robert Gordon, etc.) and Cren¬ 
shaw co-produced the album, Mar¬ 
shall Crenshaw, but the record 
sounds remarkably similar to the 
four-track demos that Crenshaw 
made at home. “It wasn’t easy to 
achieve the intimate feeling in a 24-
track studio,” Crenshaw observes. 
“It’s much easier at home, alone, 
but I used the same basic approach 
in the studio. Sometimes I had to 
work on Richard a little bit to get 
him to take the sound into left 
field—I like to garbage the sound 
up more than he does. 
“I’m out to have a good time 

when I record,” Crenshaw contin¬ 
ues. “I like not getting hung up on 
little details. The only things about 
records that matter are the feel, the 
atmosphere—that the overall sound 
has some quality that stirs the 
imagination. I don’t want to sound 
too dramatic about it, but I want to 
give some feeling of the human spir¬ 
it at work—and I want records to 
be fun to listen to.” 

In the end, the only proper 
response to industry propa¬ 
ganda about the loss of 
profits is: ‘Why don’t you 
record something somebody 
needs to hear?’ 
ate remedies in one another’s garb. Their arrangements are rather 
elastic, heavy on guitars (which we owe more to Gary Rossington 
than Robert Fripp), and Daley’s songs tend to be terse proclamations 
of faith and stories of conventional rock ’n’ roll citizens, rather than 
parables of metaphysics, ethnology or ideology. That is, there’s not 
much about Daley or his music that’s hip, except that he happens to 
have written some very good music, including “Still In Saigon,” the 
only great song about Vietnam, and one of the most powerful songs 
I've heard in the past five years. 
When Charlie Daniels released his version of “Still In Saigon” a 

few months back—and came close to having a hit—one Cleveland 
disc jockey burst into tears over the air after playing it. When’s the 
last time you heard a deejay act like a human? But “Still In Saigon” is 
that kind of song; it wrenches humanity from unsuspected corners. If, 
for Bruce Springsteen, the legacy of Vietnam is “like some dark 
street,” in which the worst shadows lurk, “Still In Saigon” is the mo¬ 
ment in which the demons dwelling in those shadows spring to life, re¬ 
minding each of us how little recovery we have made. “Still In 
Saigon” speaks not only for the Vietnam combat veterans about 
whom it was written, but for all of us who were torn apart by the war: 
the sense Bobby Muller of the Vietnam Veterans of America has in 
mind when he refers to an entire generation of Vets. “Nowhere to run 
to that I didn’t feel that war,” as the lyrics say. 
And this comes across more clearly in Daley’s version; Daley never 

served in the military but listening to him sing, you realize he never 
needed to. His demo is a simply shattering piece of music, and when 
he comes to the bridge—“Every summer when it rains/I smell the 
jungle, I hear the planes/Can’t tell no one, I feel ashamed ...”—the 
horror of what we visited upon ourselves in that conflict comes home 
with tearful power. 

Daley’s “Still In Saigon” remains only a demo, because no record 
label will make a commitment to recording him. As I hope Eve made 
clear, Daley’s music is ragged right now; it needs a great deal of devel¬ 
opment. But when record labels try to justify price increases and 
blank tape taxes, their argument is that they develop talent, and that 
this is expensive. 

This is a lie, and it has been a lie Tor some years. Once, performers 
like Dan Daley worked out their problems in the course of making 
albums and singles, with the aid of professional advice. No more. To¬ 
day, the performer develops him or herself, without any label assis¬ 
tance; and when that development is nearly complete, the labels step 
in to reap the fruits of the artist’s labor, while singing their “talent 
development” song. 

Labels used to provide such guidance, and also had the patience to 
stick with a performer through many false starts. This is the process 
that gave us Bob Seger, Bruce Springsteen, the J. Geils Band—the 
cream of American rock, and some of its most profitable performers. 
Today, all of these artists would either remain unsigned or be 
dropped from a major label artist roster after their first two albums 
failed to “produce.” And these artists would also be coerced into 
signing shamefully exploitative deals—barely livable advances, scan¬ 
dalous publishing arrangements—merely to obtain the chance to 
record. 
Dan Daley isn’t alone; I could name a half dozen other cases almost 

as outrageous. But when I think of the refusal to get such an impor¬ 
tant recording as Daley’s own “Still In Saigon” onto vinyl, the temp¬ 
tation to fling the moneychangers from the temple grows especially 
great. Because “Still In Saigon,” with its broad-based musical ambi¬ 
tions and lyric concerns, might put us back on the track of what made 
rock great in the first place—which was not hummability but com¬ 
mitment, passion, relevance and soul. 
What goes on now in the record business is not only gutless but 

stupid. Well-bred cultural values weren’t what made rock into a profit 
gusher—the biggest rock in history was among the most deeply felt 
and involved stuff- ever written. In the end, then, the only proper re¬ 
sponse to industry propaganda about the loss of profits is: “Why don’t 
you record something somebody needs to hear?” 
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London Calling 
By Chris Welch 

Stones Storm Wembley 
The Rolling Stones held court as heads of rock ’n’ roll royalty 

when they played their first London concerts in six years on June 25 
and 26 at Wembley Stadium. Backstage, the Stones’ organization 
swung into action, with myriad passes controlling each section, al¬ 
lowing a free flow of celebrities, VIPs and photographers. Comedian 
Billy Connolly and Police guitarist Andy Summers were among 
those spotted hobnobbing with the Stones between sets. Earlier, the 
group rehearsed at the old Shepperton film studios, starting at mid¬ 
night and jamming until 9 a.m. Keith Richards can only play after 
dark, or so legend has it, and the rest have to lose their sleep to keep 
up with him. There was also time for medical checkups, as each 
member of the band is insured for two million dollars. Keith passed 
with flying colors, and was in high spirits, chatting cheerfully about 
his Ferraris, while Charlie Watts mulled over his 15-year-old 
Gretsch drum kit, with its ancient, blackened cymbals, and resisted 
all attempts to get him to buy a new setup. 
The Stones played at their best at Wembley, bringing the mixture 

of old hits, blues and modern material to 70,000 fans. Upset that 
London’s local government banned their projected firework display, 
they released thousands of balloons over the city instead. Despite 
claims of a sellout, there were still a few empty seats at the back of 
the stadium, and ticket touts were selling 10 pound tickets for five 
pounds each after the show started. The group is estimated to have 
made 500,000 pounds alone from the sale of t-shirts and souvenirs. 

The Copeland-McCartney Jam 
Stewart Copeland is writing the music for a new Francis Ford 

Coppola movie titled Rumble Fish. Says the drummer: “It’s basically 
a percussive concept.” He has also been heard jamming with Paul 
McCartney, and the results were so good that Paul has reportedly 
written some lyrics to fit the riffs. Expect another blockbuster forth-

Richard Butler: Fusing punk energy with 60’s ideas. 

The Psychedelic Furs Retool 
For An Assault On The U.S.A. 

lan Anderson 

with . .. Trouble brewing in the ranks of Jethro Tull? After long-
serving drummer Barriemore Barlow left the group, he was replaced 
by Mark Cramey, who in turn was succeeded by Jerry Conway. Now 
Jerry has left after completing the recent European tour and Ian An¬ 
derson is looking for a replacement . . . Billy Idol, ex-Generation X 

Billy Idol 

singer, and until recently a New York City resident, has released a 
solo album. I called Chrysalis Records here and asked how it was 
doing. There was a pause. “In what sense?” came the reply from a 
rather haughty press lady. I understand that William may put a 
band together in an effort to promote the record. Then, of course, he 
may not. 

Ian Gillan’s Hairy Situation 
The Ian Gillan Band is heading for the Far East on one of the 

first-ever Malaysian government-approved tours. In this part of the 
world they are not too keen on Western decadence and try to make 
the trains run on time and keep the sidewalks free from litter. Thus, 
there are stringent conditions attached to any tour by hairy rockers. 
Rule number one in the contract says: “All band boys, including Gil¬ 
lan, must tie their long hair back or wear a hat. They should not let 
their long hair be on their shoulders on stage, or anywhere in pub¬ 
lic.” The Malays are so hung up about hair that they even turned 
back Cliff Richard at the airport once, when he allowed a wisp to 
curl over his collar. None of this should bother Gillan’s bass player 
John McCoy. He is totally bald . . . The band that many are expect¬ 
ing to cause riots and other commotion in the closing months of the 
year is Lords of the New Church. Currently on a U.K. tour and 
scheduled to visit the U.S. in August, the Lords have Brian James, 
formerly of the Damned, on guitar, and Stiv Bators of Dead Boys on 
vocals. Kermit of Sham 69 is on bass and Nicky Turner, ex-Barra¬ 
cudas, is on drums. They’re being called “the new Doors”by their 
producer, Paul Rothchild, who, after all, did produce the Doors 
himself. And so the world trembles. 

By Chip Stern 
NEW YORK— Critics and fans 
have been playing pin-the-tail on 
the donkey with the Psychedelic 
Furs since they first hit the United 
States, probably because their mu¬ 
sic incorporates so many genres it’s 
hard to nail down what bag they’re 
coming out of. The sound of Psy¬ 
chedelic Furs and Talk, Talk, Talk 
was a Spectorish garage melange, 
bathed in echo and reverb until ev¬ 
erything surged together into a sin¬ 
gle rush of anthemic hooks and 
bittersweet vocal sentiments—as if 
Johnny Lydon and Roger 
McGuinn got hooked up in a back-
alley brawl (with David Bowie 
holding their coats). 

“Yeah,” admits Richard Butler, 
singer-lyricist for the Furs, and the 
group’s conceptual lightning rod. 
“We were going for a wall of sound 
then. Definitely. And although I do 
like Phil Spector, that’s not the rea¬ 
son for it. I was really into the Vel¬ 
vet Underground, and a lot of 
bands that used that big sound with 
a lot of force behind it. When we 
started out, it was all punk rock 
over here in England, and we called 
ourselves Psychedelic Furs partly 
as a rebellion against the fact that 
bands were called all these heavy 
names like the Stranglers and the 
Sex Pistols; also, all these bands 
were putting down the music of the 
’60s, which seemed a little narrow¬ 
minded to me, seeing as how I was 
very influenced by them. So there 
was no point in me going along with 
the fashion and saying, ‘Yeah, I 
agree, all those old hippie bands 
were useless,’ when, in fact, I liked 
them a lot. Given those influences 
from the ’60s, what was interesting 
about the punk thing was the ener¬ 
gy it had. And the Furs, I guess, 
fused the energy of punk rock with 
the ideas of the ’60s.” 
For Butler and the Furs, who’ve 

been plugging away since 1977, an 
American audience now beckons 
like the faint glimmers of light and 
romanticism that occasionally flick¬ 
er through the dark, gnarling haze 
of their songs. One can hear the 
rapprochement beginning with 

Talk, Talk, Talk, where if Butler 
doesn’t exactly sound tender (“Inte 
You Like A Train”), he at least 
seems reconciled to the ambiguities 
of life and loss. “The second album 
is mainly just love songs," says But¬ 
ler, “whereas the first wasn’t about 
any one thing in particular—it sort 
of darted here and there. When you 
make a first album and get in the 
studio, you sort of go, ‘Wow, let’s 
try this!’ and T want to sing that,’ so 
it becomes a little bit jumbled.” 

Certainly the results were unified 
by the Furs’ waves of sound and 
emotion, yet more often than not 
any distinctions between fore¬ 
ground and background, music and 
vocalist, were obscured; and the 
content of the lyrics and the ar¬ 
rangements tended to contradict 
each other. “You’re right about 
that,” Butler concurs. “We feel 
songs work best when the feeling of 
the music works in with the feeling 
of the words, as opposed to the 
sound of the first two albums where 
there were a lot of songs that were 
very heavy musically that needn’t 
have been that way.” 
Which is part of the reason why 

Butler and the Furs decided to 
make significant personnel changes 
and seek out an American producer 
(Steve Lillywhite had worked on 
the band’s first two LPs) for their 
third album, ending up by making 
Forever Now with Todd Rundgren 
behind the board at his Bearsville, 
New York studios. “That wall of 
sound still comes through in a cou¬ 
ple of places—it’s almost a trade¬ 
mark, if you like—but we’re not 
doing it to the same extent. We just 
thought it was time we got a little 
cleaned up—bring out more of the 
melody. 

“That was part of the reason for 
using an American producer, be¬ 
cause we’d like to do well in Ameri¬ 
ca. People over here tend to listen 
to music through much higher 
quality systems; even the car stereo 
systems sound really good. Todd’s 
drum sound is even bigger than 
Steve Lillywhite’s. Steve goes for 
much more—I don’t mean to insult 
him—of a mushy sound; the snare 
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is a bit trebly, and the bass drum 
and toms are a bit muddy. Steve 
wants things felt as much as heard, 
and the bass went very much in 
with the drums. That’s his sound 
and he does it on purpose. Todd 
goes for a much rounder, deeper, 
fuller tom sound—much more sep¬ 
arated—and the bass is much clean¬ 
er sounding, which can actually 
make the music sound more power¬ 
ful. Todd said that when the album 
came out people might think it was 
he who’d augmented and directed 
the change in our sound, but we’d 
already done all the arrange¬ 
ments—with cellos, marimbas and 
things—before we came to him. 
There were some horn section ar¬ 
rangements Todd helped us with, 
but because the material was sound¬ 
ing exactly like the first two al¬ 
bums, we figured we neededto 
change, which is why we got rid of 
the saxophonist (Duncan Kilgore) 
and the other guitarist (Roger Mor¬ 
ris). We'd gone along long enough, 
and it just didn’t work anymore.” 
The release of Forever Now marks 

the first stage of an extended foray 
into the United States, designed to 
take advantage of the Furs’ support 
with the college market, so the 
touring band (including Butler, 
brother Tim Butler on bass, guitar¬ 
ist John Ashton and drummer 
Vince Ely) will be criss-crossing the 
country from mid-October through 
December, with tentative plans to 
flesh out the studio sound with 
some additional musicians. The 
new album’s songs (like the piss-
take on right wing politicians, 
“President Gas,” and the dreamy 
“Sleep Comes Down”) represent a 
distillation of the Furs sound, not a 
fashionable about-face. And with 
the continued exposure to Ameri¬ 
can audiences, the music and the 
subject matter can only get deeper. 
“With the Clash,” Butler observes, 
“they’d been singing songs that 
were specifically British, and when 
they got over to the States, they saw 
that the issues were a lot wider than 
they were in Britain. I think that 
did their writing a lot of good. And 

Continued on page 21 
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Looking In On Ted Nugent: 
‘Let ’Em Think I’m Crazy’ 
NE W YORK—When you’re given 
to making statements like “ ‘Wang 
Dang Poontang’ is a rock ’n’ roll 
classic,’ ” then you’ll invariably 
find yourself without many allies in 
an argument. Which accounts, at 
least in part, for the overriding cir-
cle-the-wagons mentality on Ted 
Nugent’s latest LP, titled simply 
Nugent. Nearly every tune is a hard 
rock ode to self-reliance, physical 
and emotional toughness and out¬ 
right hostility. Flying in the face of 
pacifism (and reason), Ted urges 
Americans to “fight” because 
“fight is right,” on the jingoistic 
“Bound and Gagged;” “Can’t Stop 
Me Novy,” “Don’t Push Me” and 
“Tailgunner” are similar examples 
of.in-your-face rock ’n’ roll. 

Yet the artist, relaxing in the of¬ 
fices of his new label, Atlantic Rec¬ 
ords, appears to be anything but 
angry or suspicious. 

A Full-Scale 
Tribute To 

“I’m a very self-protective per¬ 
son, for myself and my family,” he 
states with a smile. “And I know 
what I want and how things 
oughtta get done. Before this rec¬ 
ord, I took a good look at where my 
career was going, and I made a lot 
of changes. I’m producing myself, I 
dropped my management, I got a 
new record company. There was 
too much waiting around, conflicts 
of interest, disagreements. I’ll take 
some verbal abuse if it’s necessary, 
but I’m gonna make my stand when 
I have to. That’s what the album’s 
all about, making your stand.” 

“There’s a natural tendency for 
maturity to subdue an individual, 
but that will never happen to me,” 
he says. Nugent, who hasn’t had a 
legitimate hit record in more than 
four years, states further: “I got all 
the money any white man could 
ever want. I don’t gave a damn 
about sales. I like my music, that’s 
the bottom line.” 
How seriously then do we take 

any of this? Remember, the man 
rates "Wango Tango” with “Light 
My Fire” and calls himself the 
“best damn guitarist in the world.” 

Ted Nugent 

Still, he apparently believes it, and 
that’s worth something. 

“I want all my senses to be acute, 
I want to never stop rocking my ass 
off. People think I'm crazy—fine, 
let ’em. Everybody’s got to sweat. I 
got the intelligence, the experience, 
the authority. I’m settin’ my sights 
on the elimination of compromise.” 

—Mark Mehler 

In Case Of A Broken Heart, 
Take ATip From Haircut 100 
NEW YORK—Many’s the musician 
who’ll claim to have joined a rock 
band so he could get along with the 
beautiful girls. For the founding 
members of Haircut 100, though, it 
didn’t quite work that way. 

Just over a year ago there was no 
Haircut 100. Nick Heyward, Les 
Nemes and Graham Jones formed 
the group one day in the wake of be¬ 
ing ditched simultaneously by their 
respective girlfriends. It’s not as 
though they’ve re-formed Our 
Gang’s He-Man Woman Haters 
Club or anything, but Jones talks 
like they’re all better off today. 
“When you go out with girls you 
tend to lose your mates,” he says. 
“So we re-discovered each other and 
started playing together.” Three 
months later. Haircut 100 (“It was 
the silliest name we could come up 
with,” explains Heyward), with per¬ 
cussionist Mark Fox, drummer Blair 
Cunningham and saxophonist Phil 
Smith added to the lineup, had a hit 
single in England. 
The words most often used to de¬ 

scribe Haircut 100 are clean, nor¬ 
mal, cute and young. They don’t 
smoke or drink and one of them 

still lives with his parents. When 
the group arrived here to begin its 
American tour, each musician wore 
a tie and knee socks, and tended to 
act like a playful kid. Interviews of¬ 
ten lapsed into a madcap exchange 
of one-liners reminiscent of the Bea¬ 
tles’ press conferences. 
While England has gone ga-ga 

over the sound of Haircut 100 (a 
blend of dance rhythms and pop 
melodies, with some jazz-influ¬ 
enced soloing), the country has be¬ 
come even more enamored of the 
band’s concept. Nemes says the 
group knows full well that they owe 
much of their appeal to an ultra¬ 
positive image. Heyward adds: 
“People think that because bands in 
England come out with gloomy lyr¬ 
ics that that is representative of 
what goes on in England. Average 
teenagers don’t want to hear about 
the country’s problems—they just 
want to listen to good music.” 
And what, pray tell, does Pelican 

West, the title of Haircut 100’s de¬ 
but album, mean? 

“It’s in the grooves,” says 
Nemes. “Look for it.” 

—Laurie lænnard 

Bloomfield 
NEW YORK— Mike Bloomfield, 
the influential blues guitarist who 
was noted for his work with the 
Paul Butterfield Blues Band, Bob 
Dylan, the Electric Flag and others, 
will be remembered on record and 
in print come fall. On September 
15, Columbia Records will release a 
two-volume set of Bloomfield’s re¬ 
corded work entitled Bloomfield, to 
be followed on October 1 by the 
publication of Michael Bloomfield: 
The Rise and Fall of An American 
Guitar Hero, a biography written by 
veteran rock journalist Ed Ward. 

Bloomfield died of an apparent 
drug overdose in February of 1981. 

g 
: 

Mike Bloomfield 

“I’ve done this biography be¬ 
cause I believe that if somebody 
doesn’t get onto his story pretty 
quick the contributions that he 
made are going to be ignored,” 
Ward explains. “They’re going to 
be lost. Another thing is to' tell the 
story of somebody who was good, 
but not successful, so that people 
realize that commercial success is 
not the only arbiter of determining 
the worth of a musical performer. 
Michael Bloomfield knew the dif¬ 
ference between music that’s real 
and music that is manufactured.” 

Highlights of the LP include short 
interview segments with Bloomfield 
conducted in the early ’70s in San 
Francisco by blues aficionado Danny 
McCloskey, as well as unreleased ver¬ 
sions of “Got My Mojo Working” 
and “East-West” by the Butterfield 
Blues Band; “Killing Floor” and 
“Texas and Wine” by the Electric 
Flag; an unreleased Flag version of 
“Going Down Slow” and, from the 
Super Session album (which teamed 
Bloomfield with Al Kooper and Ste¬ 
phen Stills), “Shuffle” and “Stop.”— 

Helene Podziba 
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‘But Gary, Don’t You Have 
Anything To Say About This?’ 
NEW YORK—“My epitaph? You 
mean something to be written on 
my gravestone?” Gary U.S. Bonds 
hesitates before answering the ques¬ 
tion. “I don’t know,” he says at last. 
"How about, ‘He’s not in!’ Or, ‘Out 
to lunch!’ ” 
Thus did the once and future 

Gary Anderson inadvertently sum 
up his participation in two Bruce 
Springsteen/Miami Steve Van 
Zandt-produced albums that have 
helped lift him off the oldies/disco/ 
Holiday Inn treadmill. Although 
Bonds gets co-credit (with his 
daughter) for writing two songs on 
his latest LP, On The Line. Spring¬ 
steen and Van Zandt wrote eight of 
the 11 tunes, and put their stamp all 
over the instrumental and vocal 
sound of the album. That much 
more control being centered else¬ 
where might bother some, but Bonds 
wouldn’t have it any other way. 

“It’s basically like Motown,” he 
offers. “After a while you get tired 
of hearing Holland/Dozier/Hol-
land working with the Four Tops, 
right? No way—it didn’t happen to 
me and it didn't happen to millions 
of other people, so I can't see it hap¬ 

pening with Bruce and Miami. 
They are exactly what Holland/ 
Dozier/Holland were: writers and 
producers.” 
Beyond this, Bonds has curiously 

little to offer about the working re¬ 
lationship between himself, Spring¬ 
steen and Van Zandt. To wit: 

Q: Did you learn anything from 
working with Bruce and Steve? 

A: I’m not a musician like they 
are, so it didn’t do much for my 
writing. I have to write to what lit¬ 
tle piano I can play. 

Q: When you saw Bruce and 
Steve working out half-formed 
ideas, did that help you in your own 
songwriting? 

A: I don’t think it did anything. 
Okay. Nevertheless, Bonds can 

still stir up a crowd, as he demon¬ 
strated recently at New Jersey’s 
Byrne Arena on a co-headlining 
date with Southside Johnny. Still, 
when a guy makes the major mis¬ 
calculation of including in his rep¬ 
ertoire a Miller Beer commercial he 
cut last year (it had him “going 
down to the river” just like you-
know-who), one wonders where it’s 
going to end up for Gary Bonds. 

Gary U.S. Bonds 

Asked if he wonders about his 
place in rock history. Bonds shrugs. 
“I’ve had a good life,” he answers. 
“I’ve rocked.” 

Haven’t we all. 
—Wayne King 

Patrice Rushen Urges Radio 
To ‘Give People A Choice’ 
LOS ANGELES— The cloudy L. A. 
skies have now cleared, and 
through a window of the spacious 
conference room at Elektra-Asylum 
the sunlight sparkles on dozens of 
laboriously-beaded braids dangling 
against Patrice Rushen’s shculders. 
“It takes four days to do these,” she 
sighs, looking at the braids. And 
that’s about the only downbeat mo¬ 
ment of the day. Her seventh al¬ 
bum, Straight From The Heart, has 
jumped from the R&B charts into 
the top 40 of the pop charts; once 
again Patrice Rushen has crossed 
the boundaries of “black radio” 
that she asserts are restricting her 
and other black artists. 

“Because of the way records are 
marketed,” Rushen explains, “if 
you’re black you’re either classified 
as doing R&B or jazz. But that 
doesn’t mean that the only people 
who buy that music are black. They 
should start dropping these titles 
and categories. Give people a 
choice. They may say, ‘Well, I don’t 
listen to jazz.’ If you’ve ever teen to 
a movie, you do—you hear jazz all 
the time. Or, T don’t like classical 
music.’ Well, what are you listening 

to when you watch soap operas? Do 
you know what you’re listening 
to?” 

Rushen’s ’74 debut, Preclusion, 
on the Prestige label, and its follow¬ 
up, Before The Dawn (both all-in¬ 
strumental) were praised as 
imaginative fusions of jazz and clas¬ 
sical ideas. However, subsequent 
LPs incorporated more R&B ele¬ 
ments and resulted in some cross¬ 
over pop hits (notably “Haven’t 
You Heard” and “Look Up”). 
Straight From The Heart retains all 
of these influences, and incorpo¬ 
rates a prominent pop beat in the 
current hit single, “Forget Me 
Not.” 
A child prodigy who was classi¬ 

cally trained as a pianist, Rushen 
says her music reflects an attitude 
she grew up with—one that she be¬ 
lieves simply doesn’t exist in this 
day of “pure” formats and market 
research. “I’m a product of a lot of 
different music,” she explains. “My 
parents always listened to the R&B, 
pop and jazz of their day. I’ve al¬ 
ways lived in a multi-racial and 
multi-ethnic environment. I don’t 
know whaf it’s like to be locked into 

"Lexicon Prime Times 
aren't just an effect for 
...they're an integral 
part of my sound." 

Por Metheny 

to 

me 

one particular way of doing things. 
“Your music has to be such that 

people from various backgrounds 
can get into it,” she continues. 
"There’s got to be some common 
denominator within the music that 
hooks up the dancers, the listeners, 
the old people, the little kids from 
the midwest, the east, the south— 
all of that. (Categories) limit an art¬ 
ist's creativity and keep them from 
opening people up to something 
new—not something black or 
white, just something else.” 
Does she really think radio will 

respond? 
“It had better happen. People 

think they’re listening to one kind 
of music, but that music is influ¬ 
enced by other things. The music it¬ 
self has become an amalgamation of 
all the different elements. You just 

i can’t draw those lines anymore.” 
—Vicki Greenleaf & Stan Hyman 

Pat Metheny records for ECM Records 

"I felt I needed a bigger guitar sound, and the 
sound engineer at Talent Studios in Oslo where I was 
recording told me to wait while he plugged in a box. 
What came over rhe monitor was the greatest guitar 
sound I'd ever heard, something I'd been seeking for 
many years. The box was a Lexicon digital delay.” 

"I’m amazed at the guitar sound I ger from 
Prime Time. No other delay has its warmth. Prime Time 
creates a space around rhe sound which in a lot of ways 
is as important as the sound itself. Knowledgeable 
listeners soy our concerts sound like our records. Much 
of that con be attributed to 
rhe Lexicon Prime Time.” 

"Today, I use five Lexicon systems on a typical 
concert, of which I do about 300 a year. On stage at my 
right hand is a Prime Time; another Prime Time is or rhe 
board that mixes rhe drums and piano. A third Prime 
Time is used on rhe PA line. We also use a Model 92 
and rhe new 224 digital reverb.” 

If you’d like to experience the sound 
enhancement that's made Lexicon's Prime Time rhe 
favorite of Par Metheny and dozens of top touring and 
recording groups, circle reader service number or write 
to us. We ll orange to get you into Prime Time. 

lexicon 
Lexicon, Inc., 60 Turner Street, Waltham, MA 02154 • (617) Ô91-6790/TELEX 92346Ô 

Is The CEN 
APipe Dream? 
NEW YORK—“'Ne don’t want to 
look as if we’re just another group 
of rock promoters coming onto a 
college campus to do a show, take 
the money and run.” So says Bob 
Skinner, director of corporate com¬ 
munications for the Campus Enter-
tainment Network (CEN), a 
satellite-delivered service with 
plans to broadcast to the nation’s 
smaller colleges live concerts fea¬ 
turing the top names in rock. To 
date, 26 colleges have signed up 
with CEN. 

However, CEN has yet to sign an 
act for the series, although Skinner 
asserts the first concert will be aired 
in October. CEN’s plans call for 
four to six events during the up¬ 
coming school year, with Pat Bena¬ 
tar, Billy Joel, the Go-Go’s and the 
Rolling Stones on Skinner’s list of 
headlining possibilities. 

In exchange for the right to 
broadcast at the affiliated colleges, 
CEN will lend schools the use of its 
video equipment and technical ex¬ 
pertise, along with signal decoding 
equipment and promotional materi¬ 
als. Each school will receive five 
percent of the gate (all tickets are 
five dollars) to cover other ex¬ 
penses, such as hall rental. At the 
University of Nevada at Reno, the 
first school to sign with CEN, Ac¬ 
tivities VP Alan Hopper is hoping 
to book the unused Jai Alai Fron¬ 
ton at the MGM Grand Hotel, 
which has staggered seating for 
2100. Hopper feels CEN is a con¬ 
siderable plus for college entertain¬ 
ment. “This is a great idea,” he 
says. “Schools have little bargain¬ 
ing power when it comes to major 
acts, and CEN can be a big help in 
that respect.” —David Abels 
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Oblivious To The Modem Age, 
The Stray Cats Hit The Road 
NEW YORK—“We’re young, and 
we’re playing teenage rebel music,” 
boasts Brian Setzer, singer and gui¬ 
tarist for the Stray Cats. Looking at 
him sitting there with his blonde 
hair piled high and tattoos running 
the length of his arms, it occurred 
to me that perhaps I’d stepped 
through a time warp into the year 
1958. Certainly the Cats (including 
drummer Slim Jim Phantom—pre¬ 
sent for the interview—and bassist 
Lee Rocker, who was absent) could 
have been cast as toughs in Grease 
II. Their music, which worships at 
the shrine of Presley, Cochran, Vin¬ 
cent and Wray, also reeks of a by¬ 
gone era of tail fins, chrome and 
raw rockabilly sounds. But rather 
than being nostalgic for a time 
they’re too young to remember, the 
trio says its image is simply a way of 
aligning themselves a bit more dra¬ 
matically with the music they 
adore. 

“If you really like the music, you 
look like this as well,” Setzer 
asserts. 
“Rock ’n’ roll is obviously not a 

fad” is Slim Jim’s pertinent 
observation. 
Though the Stray Cats’ lack of 

concern with current fashion and 
the strictures of radio playlists— 
Setzer states, “When I write, I can’t 
worry, ‘Well, is WFART gonna 
play this?’ ”—is admirable, it’s also 
a bit naive for native Americans. 

The band’s success in England, a 
country still mad for rock ’n’ roll 
roots, shouldn’t obscure the fact 
that these guys hail from Long Is¬ 
land. And unlike British revivalists 
such as Matchbox, the Stray Cats 
should know that the American 
rock system is a little more en¬ 
trenched in its ways. 

In case their initial U.S. release, 
Built For Speed (a combination of 
the Cats’ two British LPs, plus 
some new material) doesn’t receive 
much airplay, the band has been 
getting some exposure in a time-
honored way: by hitting the road 
for the summer with the same show 
that was hot enough to mesmerize 
the Rolling Stones, who invited the 
Cats to open some dates on last 
year’s American tour. Judging from 
a recent performance at New 
York’s venerable Roseland Ball¬ 
room, the unique lineup of guitar/ 
standup bass/standup drum kit 
(Jim’s simple explanation for this 
oddity: “I feel more comfortable 
with it.”) provides more than 
enough firepower onstage to con¬ 
vert the uninitiated. And if there 
are still doubters, then the band’s 

Stray Cats 

next record, to be produced by 
Dave Edmunds in London, might 
be a strong argument in its favor. 
Should that fail, Setzer says the 
group won’t lose hope. “Maybe 
we’ll go back to England,” he 
muses. “All I know is, we’re going 
to give these old fart bands a kick in 
the ass.” 

—Wayne King 

Franke And The Knockouts 
Are Following That Dream 
CHICAGO—Be happy for Franke 
Previte. Things are tough all over, 
but Franke’s dream—part of it, 
anyhow—is coming true. 
“We did that Jersey bar band 

thing for a lot of years, separately 
and collectively,” he says of his 
band, Franke & the Knockouts. 
“Under different names. We’d get 
together every six months and put a 
band together and try to get a re¬ 
cord deal. It’d always be the same 
bunch of guys. But I refused to 
learn somebody else’s material—I’d 
go home and do whatever I could to 
make a living and write songs.” 

Last year’s debut album, Franke 
& the Knockouts, was a major suc¬ 
cess, complete with two hit singles. 
The current follow-up LP, Below 
The Belt, shows signs of doing just 
as well. And the band is being well-
received by audiences around the 
country. 

Naturally, Previte and his long¬ 
time collaborator, guitarist Billy 
Elsworthy, have their own view on 
how it happened, and just where 
they are now that it has. 

“Billy and I were in a group 
called Bull Angus, back in the early 

'70s: A heavy meta^,riff-rock band. 
And we stayed toother, writing 
tunes, after it broke up. But eventu¬ 
ally, he said, T gotta go play rock 
’n’ roll.’ And I said, T gotta stay 
here and write songs.’ ” 

Today, they compare themselves 
with Ted Nugent, Bob Seger, even 
Alice Cooper—“beating around the 
Midwest rock ’n’ roll circuit,” as 
Elsworthy puts it, “until they got a 
deal.” 

“There’s two sides to the 
band,” says Previte. “We come up 
with that mellow groove, and it 
feels good—we can’t fight the feel¬ 
ing. And that’s our roots— I lis¬ 
tened to a lot of Rascals growing 
up, all that R&B shit.” 

Unfortunately (because he is a 
nice guy, deserving of better), 
Franke Previte seems unaware the 
Knockouts are already typecast. 
The brass ring he’s clutching is 
worth a lot at the bank. But it’s not 
likely to admit him to the club he 
thinks he’s joining. 
“Our main plan,” he says, “is to 

be a mainstay rock ’n’ roll band.” 
Dream on, Franke. 

—Bruce Meyer 

Quarterflash 
Working On 
New Album 
Continued from page 1 
but album for Geffen Records. “Ev¬ 
erything made us nervous and inse¬ 
cure. When we were making the 
first album, we had no idea we’d 
even get a chance to make another 
one, let alone get a hit. We were 
scared to death about warming up 
crowds for Elton John on our last 
tour, but that worked out okay, 
too.” 
To celebrate their recent escape 

from paranoia, Quarterflash’s next 
album will be “lighter, more up¬ 
beat, more major chord-oriented,” 
according to Ross, who adds: “The 
first record was all about the prob¬ 
lem of maintaining relationships, 
very serious stuff. I think we’re 
ready to do a fun record this time.” 
Working once again with pro¬ 

ducer John Boylan, the band will 
begin sessions in Los Angeles in 
November with an eye towards a 
January release. Among the tunes 
currently slated for the record is 
“Take Another Picture,” which the 
band used as its closing number on 
the Elton tour. 

“It’s a rock tune about two 
events in my childhood,” explains 
Ross. “I wrote it back in 1978 and 
I’ve just rewritten the music. The 
first verse describes a picture of my 
father squinting into the camera. As 
a kid, I remember I was impressed 
that this guy was my father. The 
second verse is about a dirty book I 
found under some of my father’s 
ties. It had a woman in a black slip. 
She was smiling and I wondered 
why. Really, ‘Take Another Pic¬ 
ture’ is about catching a moment in 
time.” 
Other tunes on the new LP, 

which might also be titled Take An¬ 
other Picture, are Jack Charles’ 
“Party Down, Party Down,” and 
Ross’s “Lonely.” The former is a 
tongue-in-cheek look at the fast 
lane, the latter a typical Quarter¬ 
flash rocker, featuring vocalist 
Rindy Ross on sax. 
“We may be a lot more relaxed 

and sure of ourselves now than we 
were a year ago,” concludes Ross, 
“but we still have some things to 
learn. Being on the road with El¬ 
ton’s band was a good lesson in ba¬ 
sic professionalism. It was a nice 
difference from the normal crazi-
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Only The Strong Survive x 
teve Miller has been making music, he is quick to tell anyone interested, for 26 of his 38 years. From 
high school dances in Dallas, Texas, to the frat circuit around Madison, Wisconsin, to blues bars in Chicago. 

In the late ’60s, when the underground music scene stationed itself in San Francisco, Miller checked 
it out, sent for long-time partner Boz Scaggs, and within a week the Steve Miller Band was a 
mainstay at the Fillmore Auditorium and Avalon Ballroom. While A&R men were flocking to 
the Bay area waving contracts, Miller demanded, and got, a degree of artistic control with Capitol 
Records that changed forever the concept of a rock band’s record deal. Capitol’s investment didn’t 
really begin to pay off until 1974 when Miller’s LP, The Joker, crossed over to AM radio. By 1976, 
the guitarist had found a seemingly foolproof formula for catchy three-minute hits with Fly Like 
An Eagle (which included “Take The Money And Run,” “Rock ’N Me,” and the title track) 
and its followup, Book of Dreams (containing “Jungle Love,” “Jet Airliner” and “Swingtown”). 

In 1978, though, Miller decided to take some time off; he didn’t return to the active list until 1981. His comeback release, Circle 
of Love, was anything but auspicious, with the single “Heart Like A Wheel” making a brief appearance on the charts and the 
album selling a disappointing 500,000 units (as compared to the quadruple- and double-platinum figures of its two predecessors). 

Early this year Miller took a new young band into the studio to record Abracadabra, sort of an ’80s version of the old Miller 
hit factory. “It’s going to be a blockbuster,” he promised before leaving for a European warm-up tour prior to his fall tour of the 
States. Three weeks later, the album’s title tune had penetrated the top 10 of the singles chart. 

This interview, which took place in Lake Tahoe, Nevada in the wee, small hours of the morning following the start of the first 
leg of his U.S. tour, finds Miller in feisty form: his remarks about punk rock, the old San Francisco scene, his development as an 
artist, and the frustration of dealing with recalcitrant industry executives are strictly of the bare-knuckles variety. If Jerry Butler 
hadn’t already cut it. Miller might well use “Only The Strong Survive” as his theme song. The author, too, for that matter. Read 
on, and you’ll understand. 

Rock radio is aimed at younger and 
younger kids it seems. Is it harder, 
as you get older, to write songs di¬ 
rected at that audience? 

Oh, sure. Absolutely. You get far¬ 
ther and farther away from it. One 
of the things I was trying to do with 
Circle of Love and “Macho City” 
was get out of that, and get into 
this. See, the real problem is, where 
is my audience? Where is the audi¬ 
ence that bought Book of Dreams'! 
They’re all 25 years old now, with 
kids, buying dental work, trying to 
buy a house. And they don’t go to 
record stores at all. So you go from 
selling five million copies to selling 
500,000 or something. Now what 
we have to do is we have to find a 
new place for our audience to come 
see us. Because I’m not through ex¬ 
pressing myself as a musician by 
any means. When I was in Chicago 
the guys I was learning from were 
all in their 50s. Muddy Waters is 65 
years old now and still playing. At 
my age I’m not through writing. 
It’s hard for me to write a tune for a 
14-year-old kid. I think the lyrics 
on Abracadabra are a lot more so¬ 
phisticated than on my previous al¬ 
bums. I think it’s a good blend of 
everything. So I want to find where 
my audience will come to see me 
play. I’m trying to express myself 
on a more mature level now. And it 
doesn’t bother me at all to come out 
and play to 1000 people. It works. 
I’m having a good time. See, I’ve 
got to play. 

At various stages you’ve been lump¬ 
ed in with San Francisco rock, sta¬ 
dium rock, middle America/ 
Fleetwood Mac/platinum rock— 

Chicago blues-rock, underground 
rock. “The most far-out creative 
band ...” The horrid establishment 
rock. I’ve been in every one of 
them. 

Did you ever feel like you really be¬ 
longed to any of those categories? 
In terms of San Francisco rock, it 
seems like Quicksilver, the Air¬ 
plane and the Dead had more of a 
common bond with each other than 
Journey, REO and Styx do today. 

Yeah, I had a lot more in common 
with those guys than everybody else 
because we were all in an area 
where we were surrounded by other 
artists and other kinds of people 
who were helping make the scene 
happen. So it was a real unusual 
scene. We played for free in the 
parks and did all that stuff. That’s 
what makes us different from all 
these other people. I mean, the 
punks will never get their trip to¬ 
gether like we got our trip together, 
because there’s not enough energy 
and not enough help around it; it’s 
too negative, too sensationalistic. 
Guys want to make it now so they 
can get money. They’re misguided. 
They want to make money and get 
laid and buy houses and lord it over 
everybody else, whereas I went to 
San Francisco because I was look¬ 
ing for a place to express myself and 
play other than in a bar. 

Do you think there’s any carryover 
of the San Francisco atmosphere 
and musical style into the material 
you’ve done since then? 

Oh yeah, sure. When you see our 
show you’ll think, ‘How’s he still 
doing this? How’s he getting away 
with this?’ The second song in the 

set is “Space Cowboy.” It’s a car¬ 
ryover from high school. I was do¬ 
ing “Gangster of Love” when I was 
16 years old in Dallas. I’m still do¬ 
ing it now. And they still love it. It 
just works. But San Francisco is a 
real important part of my develop¬ 
ment; the Beatles were a real impor¬ 
tant part of my development; 
Stockhausen was real important. I 
was listening to Stockhausen in 
1960. Just recently a friend of mine 
who recorded my first sessions ever, 
when I was 15, sent me those tapes. 
You’d be amazed at how good they 
are. Our first recording session, 
1959 or whatever. It was recorded 
by Jack Maxon, who now runs 
Showco, who did the Rolling 
Stones’ sound. All these people 
have played big parts in my devel¬ 
opment, right from Les Paul at the 
very beginning. Les Paul was a 
friend of my father’s and showed 
me my first chords. I knew what 
multi-track recording was in 1948. 1 
was five years old, but I understood 
that Mary Ford could sing with 
herself because Les Paul had eight 
tape recorders that had these little 
electric motors that made them all 
run at the same time. My dad had 
one of them—a Magnacorder. I was 
playing when I was twelve-and-a-
half. And there’s nothing unusual 
about that. People should not think 
that that is unusual. The truth of 
the matter is, that’s when you want 
to take kids and teach them and put 
them in a studio. 

When you came to San Francisco 
had you already written material 
along the lines of Children of the 
Future? 

Children of the Future was put to¬ 

gether in 1964. You have to under¬ 
stand something: a lot of what 
happened in San Francisco hap¬ 
pened in Texas first. Chet Helms 
and Janis Joplin and all those peo¬ 
ple were hippies from Austin. And I 
was in Chicago and then went to 
California from Austin. California 
was ready to happen, but if Chet 
Helms hadn't come out there with 
Janis and some artists and that pey¬ 
ote vision, that peace, love, happi¬ 
ness kind of thing—it wouldn’t 
have happened the way it hap¬ 
pened. That’s why it was such an 
unusual scene, because so much en¬ 
ergy came from so many different 
places. It wasn’t just a bunch of 
snotty kids who wanted to be rock 
’n’ roll hotshots a la today. It was a 
bunch of people who were literally 
having religious visions. And a lot 
of it came from Texas. But San 
Francisco was the only place that 
would allow that to happen, the 
only place in the whole United 
States. If they tried to pull that off 
in Texas, they would’ve killed 
them. Or else we’d just be getting 
out of jail now. 

You were recently quoted as saying 
that the punk scene was “fast and 
quick and negative.” Don’t you 
think there were also some positive 
things that came out of that 
movement? 

Oh, yeah. When you talk about 
punk, it's like talking about rock 'n' 
roll. Everywhere I go people think 
I’m going to be like Black Sabbath 
or Led Zeppelin. “Well, you’re a 
rock ’n’ roll band.” There’s a lot of 
hucksters, man, in the punk scene 
who have no integrity and who are 
using the musical scene for their 
own self-aggrandizement and are 
really selling a lot of trash. At the 
same time there are a lot of other 
people who are good. One of the 
goofiest things about the punk 
scene is there’s a lot of bands sort of 
like the Monkees, who’ve been put 
together by older people and are be¬ 
ing totally manipulated and pushed. 
Musically, I think what’s happened 
in the punk scene has been real in¬ 
teresting rhythmically—like disco 
was for bass players. Seemed to me 
like disco finally got us some really 
good bass lines, after the same old 
bass lines forever. Now, I think 
with new wave, the interest has 
come from the programmed 
rhythms; it’s really a percussion 
revolution more than anything else. 
As far as lyrics about murder and 
soft-worm vinyl and stuff like that, 
there’s a lot of trash, a lot of non¬ 
sense. But I think it’s a new energy, 
and what you have is a bunch of 
young people who want their own 
music. Just like I don’t want to go 
see Dean Martin—I don’t like it, 
I'm not interested in his TV specials 
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from Zoo Land and Fish Land—I 
think it’s real natural that there’s a 
rejection of all the rock ’n’ roll that 
went in front. It’s interesting to lis¬ 
ten to. When I was down in L.A. 
making Abracadabra I listened to 
new wave a lot, and found that it 
was more interesting than listening 
to the Eagles sing the same old stuff 
one more time. 

How much of your criteria for lik¬ 
ing a band has to do with their tech¬ 
nical ability? Can you appreciate a 
band than can’t necessarily play 
their instruments? 

I can’t appreciate a band that can’t 
really play their instruments, that 
doesn’t really have anything to say, 
that’s just copping an attitude. 
Anything that detracts from the 
music, that deteriorates music, is 
harmful. That bothers me when I 
see things like that. Some of these 
bands have had some ability, some 
integrity, some social conscience. 
I’ve liked the new wave bands that 
could play. If it’s just guys bashing 
their instruments, singing, “I’m not 
gonna, I don’t wanna, I’m gonna 
commit suicide, but not in front of 
you,” I think they ought to be held 
by the nose and kicked in the ass 
and moved off the stage. Wearing 
Nazi insignias and being outrageous 
just to be outrageous—basically, 
what you’ve got is a bunch of mal¬ 
contents who aren’t doing the mu¬ 
sic scene any good, who are 
providing a lot of sensationalism for 
the press to cover. And the press is 
so easily manipulated by that. 
They’ll go see some band kill dogs 
onstage and throw them at the audi¬ 
ence before they’ll go listen to good 
music. The press in its weakness for 
that kind of stuff has really helped a 
lot of nonsense go on. Even a group 
like Adam & the Ants—you know, 
it’s just like the Monkees—com¬ 
mercial shuck and jive. 

When you were first signed to Capi¬ 
tol Records at the peak of the Fill-
more/San Francisco scene, you 
pretty much revolutionized the con¬ 
cept of a rock band’s first contract 
by demanding and receiving a spe¬ 

cific royalty and a high degree of 
artistic control. In what ways have 
you, as your own manager, changed 
the structure of the original deal as 
you’ve become more successful? 

When I sold a million copies of The 
Joker, Capitol had a great deal. I 
think they were paying me about 45 
cents an album. So they were mak¬ 
ing a lot of money. They never of¬ 
fered to upgrade my contract. So I 
went to them and said, “Hey, I just 
sold a million records. I'm going to 
go out and do this and this. Why 
don’t you give me a new contract? 
Why don’t you encourage me like a 
capitalist should? Instead of trying 
to screw me out of six cents or 
something, why don’t you give me a 
nickel raise?” (Capitol president) 
Bhaskar Menon’s response to that 
was, “Because I'm an anti-hero, 
Steve. I’m not here to be a hero and 
make you feel good.” So I said, 
“Bhaskar, you’re going to sit there 
and wait for two years to get my 
next record. You’re going to wait 
until you give me a new deal. I’m 
going to outwait you, pal.” They’re 
just not used to having anybody 
talk to them like that. He waited 
two years and eight months till he 
got my next record, and when I 
handed him that one I told him it 
was going to sell four-and-a-half 
million copies. He looked at me like 
I was nuts—but it sold four-and-a-
half million copies. They didn’t un¬ 
derstand it. I went out and 
promoted that whole goddamn al¬ 
bum myself at my own cost, and 
they, of course, think they made it 
happen. Not that they didn’t do a 
good job of printing records and 
moving them and being a distribu¬ 
tor later, when it was real obvious 
that it was selling. And right when I 
was hot, in the middle of that, I had 
to grab them by the throat and say, 
“I’m not giving you Book of 
Dreams till you give me a new con¬ 
tract." I already had finished most 
of Book of Dreams. And he fought 
and fought and still wouldn’t up¬ 
grade my contract. And I’d taken it 
from 45 cents with The Joker to 75 
cents with Fly Like An Eagle. And 

at the same time they gave Carole 
King a contract for a buck and a 
quarter a record. I mean, they’re 
just stupid in the way they deal. 

You must have thought long and 
hard about why Circle of Love was 
so poorly received. 

I didn’t have to think too long or 
too hard about it. I think it was 
poorly received because the people 
who reviewed it didn’t even listen to 
it. The comments made about the 
lyrics in “Macho City” were obvi¬ 
ously made by people who didn’t 
even know what the lyrics were 
about. All it is is just an atmosphere 
piece—something to put on and to 

I told them "Macho City” was the 
single, the most important piece on 
the album. I gave them a three-min¬ 
ute edited version of it. They took it 
and cut all the offensive lyrics about 
El Salvador and the war. They sent 
me a copy and said, “Can we re¬ 
lease it like this?” I was so offended 
by what they did; I said, “No, 1 
want you to put this out this way.” 
And a bunch of middle-aged guys 
are saying, “No, ‘Heart Like a 
Wheel’ sounds real familiar, it’s the 
single. I figured if they were that 
fired up, let them go, and then do 
“Macho City” next. I made a mis¬ 
take. They never released "Macho 
City.” Capitol Records is like any 

there and push it." But it wouldn’t 
matter if it was Capitol or Warner 
Bros, or CBS or Elektra or David 
Geffen. They’re all the same. They 
don’t take chances, and they don’t 
understand. You have to remember 
that Capitol Records is the same 
company that would not release 
more than three singles off Fly Like 
An Eagle because they felt it 
pressed their credibility with radio. 
They stopped advertising the album 
when it was selling 140,(XX) copies a 
month—because it had been going 
so long and they want to put out an¬ 
other record, and they didn’t know 
how to advertise Fly Like An Eagle 
and Book Of Dreams at the same 

(The Who) really haven’t done much. I don’t think 
Pete Townshend is much of a guitar player, 

and I don’t think much of their music or their 
writing. They’re just that gi-gan-tic Bri-tish hype. 

roll through the room, to listen to. 
In L.A. I got a really ugly review, 
and they kept running it, over and 
over—they ran that review five 
times in the L.A. Times. At first, 
you know, my feelings were hurt, 
and then I went back and listened 
to the record. And then I just start¬ 
ed playing it like one of my favorite 
albums. I really enjoy the record. 
And it will be a success probably by 
this time next year; it will probably 
be double-platinum. When I served 
my record up, (the critics) were just 
looking for somebody from the ’70s 
to take a chance. All the other guys 
who sold 14 million records just 
disappeared and never did any¬ 
thing. They wouldn’t come out and 
take a chance. The Eagles, Fleet¬ 
wood Mac—they just stopped. So 
everybody just wanted to tear us up. 
It’s like students making fun of the 
teacher—we were the guys who 
they wanted to say, “This is the 
decadent, mindless platinum rock 
of the '70s, slash, slash, slash.” And 
they’re listening to the Waitresses. 
So what happened was, my record 
company completely chickened out. 

other corporation. They’re slow, 
and they have their formulas, and 
they don’t understand anything but 
their formulas. For example, I 
called them up and said, “Okay, 
guys, I’m going to do a major na¬ 
tional tour. What are you going to 
do?” They said, “We’re going to do 
this and this.” “Wait a minute. This 
tour is going to cost me a million 
three, and I’m going to go to 45 cit¬ 
ies for you and sell records. And 
you’re going to spend $66,000 for 
some radio ads and a couple of ads 
in Billboard two weeks later? That’s 
what you’re going to do? Last time 
I did a thing like this you guys 
grossed sixty million dollars! Wake 
up.” We’re still arguing. I think Ab¬ 
racadabra is going to be a block¬ 
buster, and they’re just being real 
stupid about it. It’s not even a ques¬ 
tion of cold feet, it’s just a question 
of Dumb. They don’t know when to 
break their rules. They’d rather 
wait seven or eight months to see if 
a record is going to do anything, in¬ 
stead of being aggressive and say¬ 
ing, “This is a good record, Steve 
Miller is a major artist, let’s get out 

time. You look at these kind of guys 
and you wonder how they’re in 
business. 

What would have been the fourth 
single? 

“Wild Mountain Honey.” They 
would have played it forever. Capi¬ 
tol wouldn’t release it. It’s crazy. 
It’s just corporate funk. They suc¬ 
ceed by default. 

When you have to go up against the 
record company, do you battle with 
the Capitol execs yourself, as your 
own manager? 

Yeah, which they don’t understand 
very well. It’s hard for them to deal 
with artists. And I have to do this 
to them all the time. We’ve been ar¬ 
guing and fighting for twelve or 
thirteen years now, and it astounds 
me how little protection they do 
give you as an artist and how dumb 
they are. They seem perfectly con¬ 
tent to let this record fall apart and 
to lose the kind of business I’m ca¬ 
pable of doing. And if I didn’t fight 
for it, they would. Artists, you 
know, aren’t supposed to last more 
than three years anyway. 

Did you purposely go right back 
into the studio to put out a new al¬ 
bum because Circle Of Love had 
been panned? 

No. Here’s what I’m doing; it’s real 
simple, and it’s the same thing I did 
last time. When I made The Joker, 
all of a sudden I got my first chance 
to go do big gigs, right? I did a zil¬ 
lion of them and I was so burned 
out I couldn’t follow it up with any¬ 
thing. So I learned that if you go 
out and you’re hot, the smartest 
thing you can do is have another 
record ready in the can. I learned 
that when I met the Beatles in 1969. 
They were working on Let It Be, 
something else was out, and they 
had another one in the can. They 
were always a year-and-a-half 
ahead of themselves as far as re¬ 
leases. This is another example of 
how dumb Capitol Records is. 
What’s the worst thing that can 
happen to a record company? They 
get a real big hit and then never get 
another record. Once they’ve got 
everybody paying attention, the sec¬ 
ond album you just release it and 
say, “It’s out.” When you’re hot, 
you don’t have to spend $65,OCX) on 
ads; you spend $250 and all the 
tickets are sold. That’s what I 
learned a long time ago. So I had 
Book Of Dreams ready when Fly 
Like An Eagle was delivered; I de¬ 
liberately held tunes off Fly Like An 
Eagle to put them on Book Of 
Dreams. It was three-quarters done 
already. By the time you get your¬ 
self cranked up writing songs and 
you’re good in the studio, you al¬ 
ways quit. But that’s the time to 
stay for three more months and do 
it good. You’ve got the engineer 
who knows what the hell you’re 
talking about; the room’s tuned in; 
the guys are writing. That’s the 
time to do a lot of work. 

Most bands would be so insecure 
they’d probably cram every possi¬ 
ble hit and hook onto the first 
album. 
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Steve Miller 
Twenty-six years of playing, man. 
That’s why I get away with what I 
get away with; that’s why I’m the 
way I am onstage; that’s why I can 
come into this club here and knock 
them on their ear. It’s just hours, 
it’s just experience. You finally 
learn. I mean, three hit singles on 
an album sells a lot of albums. If 
you’ve got six hit singles, you’re 
throwing three of them away when 
you put them all on one record. If 
I’d had Joker, Part II, I’d have sold 
3,000,000. So this time it’s not go¬ 
ing to be Fly Like An Eagle and 
Book Of Dreams, it’s going to be 
Number One, Number Two, Num¬ 
ber Three. The advantage of this is, 
if you’re really popular and every¬ 
thing’s hot, you’ve got no problem. 
You just sit there and you hold that 
record. Like they sat on Book Of 
Dreams for a year before they re¬ 
leased it. Then they were finally 
able to use their expertise and say, 
"Fly Like An Eagle is moving this 
way. Now let’s come with Book Of 
Dreams.” And we never even 
blinked. And when it came out, it 
sold I don’t know how many mil¬ 
lion copies in six weeks, then anoth¬ 
er two million in the next six 
months. And when Greatest Hits 

came out it was a million-four in six 
weeks. So when Circle Of Love 
didn’t happen, and stopped selling 
at a certain level, then it was time to 
come out with something else. And 
I was holding Abracadabra back for 
the next record. The smartest thing 
I can do is not break the flow of 
product. 

As successful as you’ve been in 
terms of records sold and that sort 
of popularity, you never made the 
transition from rock musician to 
celebrity. 

nipulated. Not that I didn’t go 
through that—what does it really 
mean? You know, what kind of mu¬ 
sic has he done? The Who, to me, 
have always been kind of a goofy 
group anyway. I remember when I 
first saw the Who on television, and 
Townshend had on his little red and 
yellow and black hot-shot mod 
coat, and the band stunk—they 
couldn’t play for shit—and he start¬ 
ed smashing his guitar. It was just 
like what’s happening right now— 
assholes who can’t play music. Ev-

think Townshend finally opened his 
mouth too much. And I like Pete 
Townshend (laughs). After saying 
all that stuff about him, you know, 
I like the guy, but I wish he’d just 
get his shit together and write some 
good music. Which he has done. I 
think his solo albums have been 
much better. The one with Ronnie 
Lane {Rough Mix), I thought, was 
great. 

If you really think the Who are so 
bad, then which groups do you feel 

“Twenty-six years of playing, man. That’s 
why I get away with what I get away with; 
that’s why I’m the way I am on stage. It’s 

just hours, it’s just experience.” 
Did you see the Pete Townshend in¬ 
terview in Rolling Stone? That’s 
shtick. And I feel sorry for him. I 
saw that. I mean, there was a time 
when I wanted to be real famous. I 
watched the Beatles in A Hard 
Day’s Night, and I just went, 
“God!” It was star fever for a while. 
Then I started watching what hap¬ 
pens to people who are stars. 
They’re lonesome, egocentric, sick, 
unhappy, screwed-up people. They 
travel with accountants and get ma-

erybody thinks the Who are one of 
the greatest bands in the world. 
They really haven’t done much. I 
don’t think Townshend is much of 
a guitar player, and I don’t think 
much of their music or their writ¬ 
ing—never have. They’re just that 
Gi-gan-tic Bri-tish Hype. I feel sor¬ 
ry for people who have to live that 
way, and I really feel sorry for 
somebody like Townshend who 
doesn’t think Little Richard has 
anything to do with rock ’n’ roll. I 

have played great rock ’n’ roll? A 
lot of people would put Townshend 
on that kind of pedestal. 

Yeah, but you see the reason people 
think Townshend is of that stature 
is because Townshend has spent zil¬ 
lions of dollars on his press. It’s like 
when Roy Rogers has himself 
crowned King of the Cowboys at 
the end of his movie. Townshend’s 
always having himself crowned 
King of Rock ’n’ Roll until every-
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body believes he’s King of Rock ’n’ 
Roll, and they don’t even know 
what rock ’n’ roll is about. To me, I 
still look at people like B.B. King, 
man. I saw him just the other day 
and thought he was brilliant. On 
the other hand, I thought Billy Joel 
wrote some great things. I thought 
there was a good example of some¬ 
body who really finally came out 
and wrote some brilliant rock ’n’ 
roll pop music and got just beat up 
(by the press) because he didn’t 
know how to handle himself—just 
ended up being attacked by every¬ 
body. I think he’s a really fine writ¬ 
er; he’s written some standard 
songs that will still be around when 
we’re all old. People will still be do¬ 
ing his tunes. I doubt if they’ll be 
singing Tommy (laughs). General¬ 
ly, I don’t take rock ’n’ roll that se¬ 
riously anyway. I think Jimi 
Hendrix wrote some great stuff and 
played some great things; Led Zep¬ 
pelin’s written some great things; 
Paul Butterfield did some great 
stuff. I did like the Specials. I 
thought the Specials were really a 
special group. There was something 
about them that rejected everything 
and yet had a positive feeling and a 
good blend of music. 

How tight a grip do you keep on 
your finances? With your studio 
costs, tour expenses, and the salary 
for a seven-piece band, you must be 
spending a lot of money. 

I made a lot of money. I made a lot 
of money. I sold 14,000,000 records 
and was getting paid $60-70,000 a 
night. And I was the manager— 
didn’t have to give fifteen or twen¬ 
ty-five percent cut to anybody. 

But doesn’t controlling your art get 
more and more complicated the 
more money is involved? 

Yeah. That’s why each time I’ve 
had a big success I’ve had to stop 
and become a businessman for 
awhile. I’ve been very lucky, busi¬ 
ness-wise. It’s the most boring thing 
in the world—I hate it. But you 
can’t go to someone and say, 
“Here’s a check for $9,000,000. 
Take care of it for me, will ya?” Of 
course they’ll steal you blind and 
screw you. So you literally have to 
take it and put it in the bank. My 
philosophy is, I pay my taxes. So I 
pay humongous taxes. You know, 
three and a half million dollars one 
year in taxes. Hell, I paid $500,000 
in state taxes in the state of Oregon 
one year. But I got to keep that 
much, too. You can simplify your 
life if you pay your taxes. You want 
to get fucked, try and save $800,000 
of the $3,500,000, and then you’ll 
have assholes bugging you for the 
rest of your life. Fortunately, I 
learned that when it was like a 
$400,000 deal instead , of 
$10,000,000. I used to have a lot of 
tax attorneys, and all they did was 
complicate my life, make me ner¬ 
vous. And there was enough money 
for me to pay my taxes and do the 
things I wanted to do. I’ve invested 
my money wisely and very conser¬ 
vatively—tax-free bonds and a big 
fat allowance forever. It’s sort of a 
trust fund kind of thing. 

You laid out for four years and 
could have just as easily retired to a 
life of leisure. What was your moti¬ 
vation to come back? 

If you start playing for money, you 
really lose it. Sometimes you’re not 
sure why you do things, once you 
get real successful. But I’ve been 
playing since 1956, professionally 
since then. I started out when I was 
twelve-and-a-half and I was getting 
paid for it, and I worked re-gu-lar-
ly, all the time. And I have from 
then till now. Why do it? I certainly 
don’t need to. This is the hippie in 
me still: I really felt like coming out 
and playing again because I felt like 
I had to put something positive 
back into the music scene. I didn’t 
want to just roll over and say, “Oh 
yeah, I was a big star in the ’70s. 
Yes, it’s true, I sold millions of rec¬ 
ords and now I’m going to go do 
Tic-Tac-Dough on TV and be a ce¬ 
lebrity.” That’s just not where it’s 
at. I like to play music. And it 
wouldn’t matter to me if I had two 
trillion dollars and a stack of cars 
and all that monetary stuff—I like 
playing music, and playing for people. 
And I will be playing as long as I can. 
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Toto: Mercenaries Or Band? 
Jeff Porcaro Has An Answer 
By Mark Mehler 
NEW YORK—"We are the elite 
mother ftakers of the world. ” 

Jeff Porcaro 
No, it’s not a parody of “We Are 

The Champions.” The “We" here 
refers to the session musicians of 
the music business, who, according 
to Porcaro, represent a cadre of 
highly-skilled professionals con¬ 
stantly seeking new challenges in 
studios throughout the land. But 
there is the other side of the popular 
myth—the session musician as the 
restless, cynical mercenary without 
rock ’n’ roll conviction, willing to 
prostitute his craft and his art for a 
few pieces of silver. 

It is the latter image that has dog¬ 
ged Porcaro’s band, Toto, since the 
release of its first LP four years ago. 
Co-founded by Porcaro and David 
Paich, when both were still in high 
school, Toto is composed of six vet¬ 
eran sessionmen who have worked 
on albums by Boz Scaggs, Randy 
Newman, Paul McCartney and 
Steely Dan, to name the most 
prominent. Porcaro himself came 

around for the star fringes.” 
At the end of the current tour, 

Toto will take a short break and 
then re-enter the studio (Montser¬ 
rat in the West Indies) in early ’83 
to begin work on a new LP. “We’ve 
got some material written already,” 
says Paich. “We’ve been closing our 
shows with two tunes of mine 
which'll be on the fifth album. 
‘Where The Sun Doesn’t Shine’ is a 
flat-out rocker with some sort of 
where-the-grass-is-greener theme. 
The other cut is ’Runaway,’ which 
is similar to Rod Stewart’s ‘Stay 
With Me.’ It’s about falling in love 
with a girl and kicking her out in 
the morning.” 

Meanwhile, all six Toto members 
are keeping busy with studio work. 
Paich, Porcaro (Jeff, that is) and 
Steve Lukather recently played 
some dates on Randy Newman’s 
next LP (“Newman’s great, a west 
coast version of Fagin,” says Jeff). 
The three Totoites also pitched in 
on Quincy Jones’ production of the 
Michael Jackson-Paul McCartney 
single, “The Girl Is Mine,” de¬ 

scribed by Paich as a "beautiful, 
slow, shuffling R&B ballad." Lewis 
Johnson of the Brothers Johnson is 
also featured on the tune. 

"But Toto is still the thing with 
all of us,” Paich stresses. “The con¬ 
cept in putting the band together 
was not having session men who 
work efficiently in the studio; it was 
getting a bunch of writers to do 
their thing as individuals and help 
each other out in the process. It's a 
good concept, because none of us 
feels frustrated; we all get our stuff 
on every album.” 

Jeff Porcaro agrees, and adds 
that the original description of To¬ 
to’s music remains unchanged: ba¬ 
sic pop-rock as played by “a bunch 
of normal people. 
“The sessionman and the guy in 

the band both like to play music ev¬ 
ery day, because that’s the life. The 
rest of it, the fringes, it’s boring. 
That’s why we want to record in the 
West Indies. Get up at 6 a.m., work 
all day, sleep at 8:30. Just air and 
water and music. What else do you 
need?” 
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to prominence in the mid-’70s as 
the 19-year-old drummer on Steely 
Dan's Katy Lied. 
“Nobody considered me a session 

player back then,” he recalls. “They 
said, ‘Hey, let’s bring in that little 
rock ’n’ roll asshole to play drums 
for us.’ Now I’m tired of all the mis¬ 
conceptions about playing sessions. 
They’re damn hard to do, and I’m 
proud to say I’ll be playing sessions 
for the rest of my life.” 
At this moment, though, that 

choice is more a matter of personal 
preference than of necessity, for 
Toto—which many thought would 
go the ignominious way of most so-
called session bands—has a major 
hit on its hands. Toto / Khas been in 
the top 10 for several weeks, and a 
single, “Rosanna,” has been steadi¬ 
ly climbing the charts—as of this 
writing it is number two and look¬ 
ing like an odds-on favorite to 
knock the Human League’s “Don’t 
You Want Me” out of the top spot. 
The group is also about to finish the 
first leg of a headlining tour of the 
U.S. before heading overseas for 
three weeks of dates in September. 
More Stateside concerts are 
planned for late fall. In short, this 
group appears to have a future. 

Porcaro emphasizes this fact 
when he speaks—only half in jest— 
of how IV’s success has bought 
Toto “two more years as a band. 

“We’ve been playing for 10 years 
or so,” he says, “and we’ll go on 
playing together regardless of rec¬ 
ord sales—in other words, for our¬ 
selves, if nothing else. But let’s face 
it: a hit album allows you to get 
gigs. You can’t put two sixteen-foot 
semis on the road without having 
something on the radio. We get bet¬ 
ter equipment this way, and some of 
the fringe benefits are nice.” 

Paich, whose major credit prior 
to Toto was as an arranger and 
backup musician for Boz Scaggs, 
feels IV shows a band returning to 
form after having been through a 
bad patch following its first LP’s 
strong chart showing. “On the sec¬ 
ond and third records, we did a lit¬ 
tle soul-searching,” he says. “This 
new record gets us into a more pro¬ 
gressive sound, closer to the pop 
roots of the guys. We’ve matured 
lyrically, harmonically, and emo¬ 
tionally, which more than anything 
accounts for the good luck we’ve 
had lately.” 

Recently, Toto underwent its 
first personnel change, but it caused 
barely a ripple within the sextet. 
Bassist Mike Porcaro—brother of 
group members Jeff and Steve Por¬ 
caro—replaced David Hungate fol¬ 
lowing the release of IV. Hungate, 
according to the band, left to spend 
more time with his family in 
Nashville. Explains Jeff: “It’s good 
to get fresh blood, particularly when 
it’s a relative. But we miss David. I 
think he was the one most excited 
and proud of the new record, 
but he figured there were more 
important things than sticking 
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Continued from page 1 
Certainly Mick Fleetwood, Lind¬ 

sey Buckingham and Christine 
McVie, who were all present for the 
interview, did nothing to suggest 
the above fantasy; but all three did 
speak somewhat wearily of the con¬ 
stant speculation on the part of the 
press and public about the future of 
the band. They also acknowledged 
that there is more grist for the ru¬ 
mor mill than ever before: The roar¬ 
ing success of Nick’s solo album, 
Bella Donna, and her absence from 
recording sessions, interviews (at 
least those concerning Fleetwood 
Mac) and tour preparations seem 
ample evidence to support the no-' 
tion that the singer has reached the 
point of self-sufficiency. 
Whether the topic was songwrit¬ 

ing, recording or personalities, the 
conversation kept drifting back to 
the subject of Stevie Nicks, while 
the equally-absent John McVie was 
discussed only briefly and in the 
most benign of terms. The bassist, a 
road animal and an acknowledged 
studiophobe, was sailing in the Vir¬ 
gin Islands at the time of the inter¬ 
view and was due to join the band a 
few days later to rehearse. Nicks, 
on the other hand, was scheduled to 
show up only for the last ten days of 
work prior to the start of the tour. 

“She phones her part in,” says 
McVie without a trace of irony. 
“She asks what songs we plan on 
doing and what songs we want her 
to do. The rest of it will be decided 
between Mick, Lindsey and me.” 

“I'm not that excited about tour¬ 
ing myself," admits Buckingham, 
who frequently expresses his prefer¬ 
ence for working in the recording 
studio. “But it’s something we 
should do, so I’m definitely going to 
do it. If you do an album, you might 
as well complete the cycle—other¬ 
wise, why do the album? 
Fleetwood notes that "for the 

better part of six years, we all had a 
huge commitment to Fleetwood 
Mac. All we did was tour, make al¬ 
bums, tour, make albums, and tour. 
I think that if after this much time 
there isn’t some sort of base that 
can withstand a certain amount of 
pounding from the people who 
helped create it, then it’s pretty 
useless. 

"People have been waiting for us 
to break up for years, and the sub¬ 
ject’s coming up again. The most 
likely one to disappear is Stevie, but 
there’s absolutely no way of telling 
whether she will or not. I’m sure at 
times she wants to go off and not be 
a part of the band, and at other 
times it’s the opposite.” 

But there’s more to it than that. 
In arranging this interview, it was 
apparent at nealy every turn that 
Stevie Nicks has set herself apart 
from the rest of Fleetwood Mac in a 
way which is not exactly in the spir¬ 
it of commitment. She has a record 
company virtually all to herself— 
Modern Records has released no 
product other than Bella Donna— 
and she alone among the Mac is 
represented by the industry’s most 
grudgingly-respected hardballer. Ir¬ 
ving Azoff. Azoff, it should be not¬ 
ed, owns no piece of Fleetwood 
Mac’s action; and though his inter¬ 
est in this matter is solely Stevie 
Nicks, there’s no evidence to indi¬ 
cate that he’s responsible for push¬ 
ing her away from the band. 
No one in the Fleetwood Mac or¬ 

ganization seems to know for sure 
what Nicks’s intentions are with re¬ 
spect to the band, and when asked if 
she would respond to specific issues 
raised in the interview with the oth¬ 
ers, a representative of AzofTs com¬ 
pany said, “She just wants to work 
on her record.” 

It's not hard to understand why 
Nicks might be reluctant to return 
to the enforced democracy of a five-
piece band after having established 
herself as a triple-platinum act with 
her own material and musicians— 
both in the studio and on the 
road—whose defined role is to play 

her music her way. But would 
Fleetwood Mac survive her 
departure? 
"Why not?” asks Fleetwood 

from the vantagepoint of one who's 
seen some key personnel losses in 
his time: Fleetwood Mac numbers 
among its alumni Peter Green, Jer¬ 
emy Spencer, Danny Kirwan and 
Bob Welch, all of whom were seen 
(by outsiders at least) as vital com¬ 
ponents of the Mac’s music. "I 
don't think there'll be any reason to 
madly look for someone else. If 
someone disappears, then that’s 
what happens. Who knows? The 
whole thing might blow up.” 

“I might leave,” McVie chimes 
in. "How about that?" 

Fleetwood then offers the ulti¬ 
mate scenario: "When it's all totally 
finished I’ll probably still be stand¬ 
ing there, totally deluded and think¬ 
ing that everyone was still around 
me, waiting to go on stage.” 
Touché. 

Fleet wood seems less concerned 
with the prospect of another per¬ 
sonnel change than with maintain¬ 
ing an emphasis on musical growth. 
"I respect the fact that we’re still 
being creative and enjoying our¬ 
selves. The reason why we’re still 
here is that there is an underlying 
commitment to respecting the 
band, no matter how many times 
you might get fed up with it." 

“There is definitely a chemistry 
that transcends everything else that 
might happen before or after we’re 
on stage," McVie elaborates. "We 
play well together and sing well to¬ 
gether. That side of Fleetwood Mac 
I really enjoy. And I feel very com¬ 
fortable working with Lindsey. 
Dare I say this with him present?" 
She casts an affectionate wink his 
way. "I have a lot of respect for this 
man; I don't really imagine any¬ 
body else being able to do what he 
does with my songs. 

“There have been many rough 
times,” she continues, "but we've 
always ended up on some high note, 
standing around and jamming, or 
whatever, just really getting a 
charge out of playing together. It’s 
a joyous situation, and that takes 
over the bad points." 

"That may have something to do 
with why Stevie is the way she is 
now," Buckingham suggests. “Be¬ 
cause she is not a musician, she 
doesn't share in that thing with us. 
She can feel totally out of her 
depth—which she is, on some lev¬ 
els—and you can understand why 
she doesn’t want to come down to 
the studio or be involved in certain 
things.” 

In spite of the overwhelming 
commercial success of her solo al¬ 
bum, there is a certain, well, ama¬ 
teurish quality to Nicks's songs. 
The way she lays a lyric across a 
melody sometimes makes for awk¬ 
ward phrasing and contributes to 
the spaciness of her musical perso¬ 
na, as does her rather childish lyri¬ 
cal point of view regarding life and 
love. 

Buckingham, Nicks's former lov¬ 
er and a bandmate of hers since the 
late '60s, when both were members 
of a Bay Area group called Fritz, 
admits to having always considered 
her songs "a little flaky." But, 
"there’s obviously something about 
her material that people relate to. 
She’s always been a little bit hard 
for me to take seriously, because I 
really appreciate a beat, having 
been weaned on Elvis and Little 
Richard and Chuck Berry. 

"There’s something emotional 
that gets through, though," he says, 
“and her voice is so recognizable. 
I’ve been listening to Stevie sing for 
years and years, and when you’re 
that close to it, it's easy to overlook 
certain aspects of anything." 

"Stevie’s very prolific," McVie 
notes. "She writes constantly, and 
all her songs are like babies to her, 
even though some of them are rub¬ 
bish. When I write, I sit down and 
work on an idea until it’s finished, 

but Stevie cranks out songs ail the 
time.” 

Between her songs and the way 
she appears to be conducting her 
life, Stevie Nicks comes off as a 
modern-day equivalent to the mov¬ 
ie queens of the ’30s, reaching in¬ 
side herself for some ill-defined 
personal misery to fuel her creative 
machinery. Buckingham says that 
in all the time he’s known her, “Ste¬ 
vie has never been very happy, and 
I don’t think the success of her album 
has made her any happier. In fact, 
it may have made her less happy. 

“She's flexing some kind of emo¬ 
tional muscles that she feels she can 
flex now that she’s in a more power¬ 
ful position. There’s a certain 

amount of leeway in how you can 
interpret Stevie's behavior. I’d say, 
but at the same time there’s no de¬ 
nying that her success is making her 
feel that she can pull things that she 
wouldn't have felt comfortable pull¬ 
ing before. And most of them aren’t 
particularly worthwhile, but she’s 
venting something—loneliness, un¬ 
happiness or something.” 
When a band member chooses 

not to participate fully in the pro¬ 
cess of making an album, it puts a 
certain kind of pressure on the peo¬ 
ple who do the work. Given the 
unique approach that Buckingham 
takes to record-making, it’s easy to 
see how an artist as moody as Stevie 
Nicks could second-guess what he 

does to her material. 
It’s in discussing the musicians' 

studio relationship that the most 
complete picture of Fleetwood Mac 
emerges. Here, egos collide and co¬ 
alesce for months on end; the pop 
magic that results has, ultimately, 
little to do with technology or tech¬ 
nique, and everything to do with 
talented artists following the late 
sportswriter Red Smith’s dictum on 
how to do your best work: "Open a 
vein and bleed." 

“There’s an exquisite sense of 
checks and balances in Fleetwood 
Mac, and that’s one of the things 
that makes the band work," Buck¬ 
ingham observes. “Everybody's al¬ 
ways checking each other out to a 

certain degree, not only i 
the material but on eve 
our creativity. Maybe th 
utes to the albums taking 
they do—it’s not the m< 
way to do things. But it 
effective in the end." 

While it’s not unusual 
member to walk into t 
criticize the music and 
out again, Buckinghan 
sophical about it. “It’s 
thing you expect to ha 
time to time," he says. “ 
with the territory." 

Fleetwood agrees. “W 
have a problem sometimi 
vie and John, but if they 
in the studio then thej 
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Buckingham extended his Tusk ex¬ 
perimentation on his solo album. 
Law and Order, and brought the 
fruits of his labors to bear more sub¬ 
tly on Mirage. 
“One of the reasons Tusk hap¬ 

pened the way it did was because I 
wasn’t doing any solo work," Buck¬ 
ingham says. “On Tusk I was doing 
a lot of things at my house, playing 
a lot of instruments myself, just like 
I did on Law and Order. That’s a 
valid approach to making records. 
But this time I wanted all my songs 
to be band songs, and the result of 
that is an album that is a little less 
bizarre. Tusk had things that were 
good artistically, but it wasn't good 
for the whole band, and I thought 
that I should limit that to my solo 
albums. If I want to be in a band, 
we should play as a band—and 
maybe the result of that is that Mi¬ 
rage is a little more traditional in 
some senses.” 

Traditional in every respect, one 
might say, except that 14 months 
passed between the first sessions (at 
Le Chateau in Herouville, France, 
later switching to Larabie Sound 
and the Record Plant in L.A.) and 
the album’s release. Buckingham 
quips that "Fleetwood Mac albums 
take about five years off your life," 

work with that are just as much 
fun, but not quite in the same way, I 
dare say, just because of the amount 
of years we’ve had together." 
"When you play with other peo¬ 

ple, of course, it's a lot of fun," 
Fleetwood states, “but I would say 
it’s very unlikely—certainly for my¬ 
self—that this situation will ever 
happen again in the reference of a 
musical combination. That commit¬ 
ment's really the reason why the 
band is still here." 
With the mention of the word 

“commitment,” the talk again turns 
to Stevie Nicks. The disinterested 
observer can'-t help but question her 
contribution at this point, but the 
musicians who work with her are a 
bit more charitable in their analyses 
and deductions. 

“There’ve been many times when 
she might come out in the studio 
and try and sing along, and we’d 
tend to say, ‘Don't do that right 
now, let us work this out first,'" Says 
McVie- "Now she’ll just go to 
the studio and go, ‘There’s no need 
for me to be here.’ She does feel left 
out.” 

Fleetwood’s take on the whole 
situation is that the process Fleet¬ 
wood Mac goes through from day 
one in the studio through to the fin-

Mick Fleetwood: “The 
reason we’re still here is 

that there’s an underlying 
commitment to respecting 
the band, no matter how 
many times you might get 

fed up with it.” 

with a scale model of the band's new stage design; Buckingham and John McVie; Mick Fleetwood 
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have less right to complain about 
what's done. That's just a matter of 
fairness—and that’s why I hate be¬ 
ing away from the studio. There are 
usually two or three poignant mo¬ 
ments during the making of an al¬ 
bum where there are hurt feelings 
walking around—'What have you 
done to my songs?' or that sort of 
thing. But there’s also a lot of stuff 
which is appreciated by the others." 
“Having a producer’s kind of 

mind, I might take something too 
far," concedes Buckingham, "but 
it’s better to have too much on a 
track and prune it back than to not 

have enough.” 
“Lindsey’s never that adamant 

about keeping a track a certain 

way," comments McVie. "If every¬ 
one says that they think it's caca, 
then obviously he’s not going to feel 
happy about it being on there 
anyway.” 

Buckingham has been referring 
to Mirage as a "a reconciliation of 
opposites” from the time of the first 
sessions. "There are some aspects of 
Tusk and some aspects of Ru¬ 
mours," he explains, “but Mirage is 
much more of a band album than 
Tusk was. After Rumours sold 16 
or 17 million copies, we had the 
freedom—and the courage—to try 
some other things. 

“I got a lot of support from the 
band during the making of Tusk, 
but when it became apparent that it 

wasn’t going to sell 15 million al¬ 
bums, the attitudes started to 
change. That was sad for me in a 
way, because it makes me wonder 
where eveyone's priorities are. To 
me, the point of making records is 
to shake people’s preconceptions 
about pop." 

Fleetwood says that making 
Tusk was crucial from a strategic 
standpoint. “It was no big master 
plan, really, but Tusk may be the 
most important album this band 
will ever do—strategically, apart 
from the music. 

“If we hadn’t done Tusk, Lindsey 
would have a problem expressing 
himself within Fleet wood Mac,” he 
continues, pointing out also that 

but is stumped when asked to ex¬ 
plain why. 
McVie jumps in. "Well, this par¬ 

ticular one wouldn’t have taken 
quite so long had it not been for all 
the other albums (meaning Lind¬ 
sey’s, Stevie’s and Mick’s solo LPs) 
that were being made as well.” 

It’s fitting that McVie came to 
Buckingham's aid when he was at a 
loss for words: although it’s not 
generally recognized, the two share 
a mutual respect for each other as 
musicians that pulls the band to¬ 
gether in a special way. "I'm a mu¬ 
sical stylist,” Buckingham states 
“I’m not really a writer. That's 
not my strong point, lyrical or me¬ 
lodywise. ‘Trouble’ (on Law and 
Order) is a good melody, ‘Go Your 
Own Way.’ I’ve had my moments, 
but I don’t consider that to be my 
strong point at all. It’s the style 
involved.” 

Says McVie: “I don't tell Lind¬ 
sey, for example, ‘I want you to 
play such-and-such kind of guitar, 
that lick,’ That’s why Lindsey has 
got the (additional production) 
credit on the album—he's been 
largely responsible for helping to 
bring across on the record the at¬ 
mosphere that I want to come over 
on a song that I write.” 

“She and I have a real valid kind 
of rapport between us," Bucking¬ 
ham continues, “something that 
was there before we even met. It's 
like she can play the piano and I 
can play the guitar just wonderfully 
along with her. It's almost like par¬ 
allel lines during our formative 
years of music until we met, and it 
gave us a lot of common ground.” 
For McVie, the bottom line is 

that "we play well together, we sing 
well together,” referring to the en¬ 
tire band. “A lot of parts of Fleet¬ 
wood Mac are really fun and 
rewarding. Of course, there are oth¬ 
er people that we all play with and 

ished product is a highly-disci¬ 
plined one, and that "Stevie doesn’t 
have that appreciation. She just 
emotes and goes into something, 
which is exactly her forte. But she 
does that all the time rather than 
being able to control and place 
where she does it—which is not a 
fault, it’s just the way it is.” 

But the key to understanding 
Fleetwood Mac in 1982 is not in 
wondering so much about its future 
without Stevie Nicks, but in under¬ 
standing that the point is, was and 
always has been to make good mu¬ 
sic, and have fun doing it. Maybe 
that's why Fleetwood himself can 
seem so unconcerned when discuss¬ 
ing Nicks—the band plays on, re¬ 
gardless:“ That notion is the most 
important thing: appreciating in a 
non-belabored way that the key ele¬ 
ment with all the people in Fleet¬ 
wood Mac is that you're not 
involved in making an album which 
is a bloody bore! A lot of people 
make the mistake of being very bor¬ 
ing, and realizing all too late that 
they are fucking boring. Then the 
magic’s gone; whatever’s there has 
long since passed you by. 

"I consider myself very lucky to 
have been involved in a situation 
which had a lot of groundwork that 
led you to being able to make very 
objective, humorous analogies to 
what you’re doing, and having no 
puffed-up illusions about how im¬ 
portant you are.” 
And at that point, the question of 

whether or not Mirage is the end of 
Fleetwood Mac as we now know it 
is moot. In fact, McVie says “it def¬ 
initely isn’t. 

"This band has lived from day-
to-day for seven years or so,” she 
points out, “and there’s always been 
some kind of turmoil from within— 
that’s common knowledge. I'm 
quite sure we’ll go on for another 
seven years doing the same thing." 
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On Stage 

The Stones Wicked At Wembley 
By Allan Jones 
LONDON—Fortified by a swift 
beer, I was on duty in the Royal En¬ 
closure at Wembley Stadium wait¬ 
ing for the Stones to troop out of 
the players’ tunnel and spread it 
about the park. 

I was also thinking that I’d prob¬ 
ably have more fun at home pulling 
out my toenails with a pair of blunt 
pliers. 

At Earl’s Court in '75, the Stones 
had been a pathetic disappoint¬ 
ment. Keith Richards had spent 
most of that evening grappling with 
a sense of misplaced gravity that 
found him flat on his butt for much 
of the show, and Jagger looked like 
he’d just fallen off the top of a sec¬ 
ond-hand Christmas tree. 
You couldn’t even hear them for 

the echo and they had the old eye¬ 
lids meeting in the middle faster 
than anything this side of a Pete 
Townshend interview. 
More recently, friends had re¬ 

turned from the Scottish shows 
with a disillusioned report and 

much huffing about their redun¬ 
dant, anachronistic, tediously con¬ 
trived performance. 

I was prepared to believe it all, 
despite some glowing accounts of 
the band’s display of musical mus¬ 
cle during its guerilla raid on the 
100 Club. 
And now I’m eating dick. 
If the scale and presentation of 

the Wembley shows was gross and 
grasping, it should be eagerly ac¬ 
knowledged that the music on Sat¬ 
urday was at least carried off with a 
delirious wallop, and buzzed with 
an energetic conviction that left me 
with my heart rattling against my 
teeth. 
"Under My Thumb” was a shaky 

opening shot, but “When The Whip 
Comes Down” was on: bristling 
with seething clout, it lit the fuse. 

Rowdy, loose and exciting, there 
was just nothing about this perfor¬ 
mance that was tired, lifeless or jad¬ 
ed: not even Bill Wyman, who was 
good naturedly cheered every time 
he came into close-up on the video 

screen high above the stage. Clown¬ 
ing, hamming it up with hilarious 
cheek, Jagger's athleticism was gen¬ 
uinely astonishing, while Keith 
Richards was content to lurk like a 
legend behind him. 

Whistling through “Shattered” 
and “Neighbours” with a sporting 
zeal, this was the Stones and rock 
’n’ roll at maximum crank, with 
Charlie Watts’ mulekick backbeat 
urging on the frontline with deliber¬ 
ate glee. 

There was a marvelous moment 
during a raging “Beast of Burden" 
when Jagger and Ron Wood were 
falling around on an elevated plat¬ 
form to the left flank of the stage. 
Shrugging off an early reluctance to 
seize the spotlight, Richards saun¬ 
tered down the opposite catwalk. 
Whipping the tune to a furious 

climax, he suddenly dropped to one 
knee, killed the song with a lethal 
little guitar flourish and punched 
the air with a clenched fist salute. 
He knew he was hot and the band 

was burning. ... creating intimacy under the most ludicrous circumstances 

Later, taking a solo stroll down 
the left wing, he gratefully accepted 
a bottle from someone in the audi¬ 
ence, quickly checked the label, evi¬ 
dently decided it was the business 
and took a thirsty slug. 

In turning every expectation on 
its head, the Stones were closing the 
gap; creating an impossible intima¬ 
cy under the most ludicrous and 
possibly despicable circum¬ 
stances. 

Jagger was sometimes trite, but 
never really embarrassing; God 
knows, he just seemed to be enjoy¬ 
ing himself. And anyone who didn’t 
feel righteously stirred by his ring¬ 
ing vocal on “Let It Bleed” would 
be best advised to keep it to them¬ 
selves within earshot of this hack. 

After that, he could be forgiven 
any amount of showbiz puff and 
buffoonery (although waving a 
Union Jack like some British Le¬ 
gion drummer boy at the end of the 
set was calling the shot a little 
close). 

Yet what can you do but cheer 
till your lungs hurt when you’re 
confronted with a final, heady blast 
that included a blistering “Miss 
You,” a simply cracking “Honky 
Tonk Women” (introduced with a 
slovenly “Okay, Keef” from Jag¬ 
ger), an exhausting dropkick in the 
direction of “Brown Sugar,” a vol¬ 
canic “Start Me Up” and a boister¬ 
ous “Jumpin’ Jack Flash.” 

Richards seemed so damned ea¬ 
ger to get on with the show that he 
could barely keep himself backstage 
with the rest of the chaps while the 
crowd roared its demands for an en¬ 
core. He was down at the front of 
the stage giving it an enormous 
amount of stick, well into “Satisfac¬ 
tion" before the curtains were even 
half way back towards the wings: 
the band had to double up quick to 
catch up with him. 

Carried out above the crowd on a 
crane, Jagger still couldn’t wrestle 
the attention from Richards’ 
slumping twirls and grinning 
scurries. 

Hell, I was impressed; knocked 
completely out of my stride. That’s 
all I can say. 
The Rolling Stones may be mor¬ 

ally derelict, arrogant rock ’n’ roll 
flunkies, perilously conceited, and 
their wealth may remove them from 
the kind of drudgery most of us 
have to endure; they may be playing 
out the final chapter in rock’s long¬ 
est-running charade; they may be 
conning everyone in sight, giggling 
up their bank rolls at their infinite 
capacity to capture and engage our 
attention; they may be an inflated 
myth that should years ago have 
been wrapped up and dispatched 
into more ordinary perspecti¬ 
ves ... I really don’t care. 

I just know they can party it up 
something wicked. 

Reprinted from Melody Maker by IPC 
Magazines Limited. All rights reserved. 
¿1982 
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Sound Signature 

Tom Verlaine’s Rock Time Warp 
By Chip Stern 

om Verlaine is frag¬ 
ile, like some an¬ 
cient piece of pre¬ 
cious porcelain. The 
hairline fractures 
around his eyes 
make it appear as if 

he’s just waking up, or is it that he’s 
.imply trying to get back to sleep? 
Verlaine (nee Tom Miller in Dela-
are) is a natural guitarist, a home-
•own Bohemian artist who’s 

lashioned a melodic signature and 
songwriting style that is a throw-
back to the fledgling days of tube 
amps and solid-body electric gui¬ 
tars. Wonder if he spends a lot of 
time staring at those long, expres¬ 
sive hands or does he simply face 
what’s never there? 

Tough break, that new wave tag, 
but then Verlaine literally built the 
stage at C.B.G.B.’s with his own 
hands, led one of the scene’s most 
incendiary bands (Television), and 
paved the way for groups like the 
Talking Heads, Blondie and the Ra-

means you have to pull it out of 
yourself, otherwise, what are you 
doing? You end up playing a lot of 
noise or scale exercises.” 

Because the Jazzmaster needs 
some help to beef up the sound (“I 
like the high end tone, and there’s a 
mellow sound that has a richness to 
it, but there’s a certain fullness of 
tone that’s not easy to get.”), Ver¬ 
laine has scoured old guitar and 
electronics shops when on tour to 
find vintage tube equipment, like an 
old Fender tube reverb unit he used 
on “Days On The Mountain,” clos¬ 
ing up the springs by putting a ciga¬ 
rette box in between the lock, for 
just a touch of twang and slap to 
produce that pearly Jimi Hendrix 
“Rainy Day, Dream Away” sound; 
or a pair of tube compressors and 
an old German tape delay with a 
tube pre-amp. “I crank all this tube 
equipment before the amp, and the 
sound that comes out is like (makes 
exploding sound); I don’t use it on 
everything, but for a louder lead-
type sustain it’s great, because when 

tubes heat up there’s a whole differ¬ 
ent kind of sustain and distortion 
you get. Lindsey Buckingham does 
that, too, and Pete Townshend as 
well, I think. They use some kind of 
tube tape deck. A lot of old guitar¬ 
ists do that.” 

Yet for all the nuances of Ver¬ 
laine’s dusty old equipment and 
dedication to past technologies, it is 
his musical attitude that dominates. 
“When I first started playing, I 
found I was so wound up, I couldn’t 
even hear what was coming out of 
my amp. There was just the joy and 
excitement of it—like getting some¬ 
thing out of your system, and that 
was all that mattered. I don’t think 
you can forget about that. You 
can’t get so interested in just mak¬ 
ing sounds. The point of it all is 
some kind of expression.” 

Fair enough, putting ends before 
means. So what does one practice to 
keep that spark alive? “Practice?” 
Verlaine blurts out with an uncom¬ 
fortable laugh. “I never practice. I 
just write songs and take solos.” Tom Verlaine 
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mones. Haughty and detached, yet 
bemused and unassuming, Verlaine 
has the air of a man just doing his 
work—rock ’n’ roll guitar. Perhaps 
the oblique, goofy, poetic airs of his 
singing and writing—songs that re¬ 
veal themselves only in layers—dis¬ 
suades casual listeners, yet anyone 
with more than a passing interest in 
the future of electric guitar can dis¬ 
cover inspiration by entering his 
time warp. 
The sounds he gets on albums 

like his most recent Words From the 
Front—generally underscored by a 
Stones-like rhythm guitar chug and 
punctuated by mysterious Dylanes-
que narratives and parables—range 
from bell-like crystal tones to reac¬ 
tor meltdowns where notes stutter, 
scream, expand and evaporate be¬ 
fore one’s eyes. Yet for his own part 
Verlaine characterizes his style as 
simply “trying to play in tune, with 
mixed results . . . although some¬ 
times a little out-of-tuneness is a 
good thing. A good piano tuner will 
tune the high notes sharp so it’s off, 
because of the way the ear perceives 
upper frequencies—you get more 
brightness out of it. So often a little 
bit of sharpness way up the neck on 
high notes is appropriate. The ear 
hears it as pleasing, whereas if it 
was right in tune the ear might pick 
it up as slightly flat.” As for his 
famous vibrato “that’s like digging 
in fairly heavy from fret to fret, 
rather than across the neck. The 
other one is is mostly up to the ceil¬ 
ing on the frets. Once in a while it's 
bending it up, then hitting it and 
bringing it back down with a shake 
for a backwards sound.” 

That’s the how of things. What he 
plays is a product of his fascination 
with the best of ’60s free jazz and 
rock, and an approach that de¬ 
mands as much from the player as 
from his ancient (often, cheap) 
equipment—in a word, character. 

Verlaine’s main guitar is a Jazz¬ 
master (he also uses a Jaguar and 
Danelectro), now discontinued 
from the Fender line, but still the 
key to that Ventures surfing sound; 
a noisy, temperamental guitar with 
a totally unique sound. “I’ll tell you 
what I really liked about it is when I 
went to put a band together I didn’t 
have any money, and those were 
$90 on 48th St. back in 1972. The 
body contour was really comfort¬ 
able, and the necks are a little dif¬ 
ferent than the other Fenders. 
Jazzmasters aren’t hard to find— 
but good ones are. I just got a real, 
real old one in California, like from 
the first six months, with a copper-
iodized pickguard. 

‘T’ve seen a lot of people getting 
into Jazzmasters because of me, 
and, well, people don’t know what 
they’re in for. I mean, if you’re 
looking for endless sustain, you’re 
going to have to get it out of your 
hands (laughs). Which I think is a 
good thing. Because a saxophonist 
gets it out of his breath. You’ve got 
to work for it on the guitar— it 
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Mith Epipfamt U.S.A. 
Win aTrip-For-Two to Kalamazoo and Nashville 

If you love making music with a guitar, here’s 
your ticket to Mecca — to the two homes of 
Gibson/Epiphone Cl.SA, America’s premier 
guitar maker. 

You and a friend will get the VIP tour of 
Gibson/Epiphone’s famous guitar 
works in Kalamazoo. You’ll spend 
some time with Gibson’s research 
and development team and see how 
the new America Series of Epiphone 
guitars is being made. 

Then it’s on to three days in Nashville, 
Music City (ISA You’ll spend a night 
at the Grand Ole Opry and meet the 
stars backstage, get an inside look at 
Gibson’s impressive new facilities, 
and even sit in on a Music Row record¬ 
ing session. 

But hey. That’s just the Grand Prize. If 
you’re the second name out of the hat, 
you’ll win two of rock’s most electrify¬ 
ing new guitars—the Epiphone Spirit 
and the Epiphone Special, plus a 
pair of 100-watt amps to put you in 
business. 

GRANDPRIZE 
1 Day in Kalamazoo, Michigan, the 
All-American City.” 
Tour the Gibson/Epiphone factory. 
See how the Epiphone America 
Series is made. 
Spend a half-day with Gibson's 
Research and Development team. 

3 Days in Nashville, Tennessee, 
Music City Ü.S.A.” 
Tour the new Gibson factory. 
Sit in on a professional recording 
session on Music Row. 
See the Grand Ole Opry. 
Meet the stars backstage. 
Enjoy the sounds and sights of 
America's recording capital. 

Third prize? Your choice of either a Spirit 
or a Special with a 100-watt amp included. 

And 50 more winners will be wearing our 
Fourth Prize, official Epiphone (J.S.A. Touring 
Jackets. 

Stop by your local Epiphone dealer and try one of 
Epiphone’s incredible new America Series 
guitars. While you’re there, pick up an official 
"Epiphone Ü.S.A. Contest” entry form. Just fill it 
out and mail it in before January 31, 1983 

No purchase necessary. Void where prohibited by law. 

SECOND PRIZE 
Two Epiphone (J.S.A. guitars— 
the Spirit and the Special, plus two 
100-watt amps. 

THIRD PRIZE 
Either an Epiphone Spirit or a 
Special, plus a 100-watt amp. 

FOURTH 
PRIZE 

50 Official Epiphone 
(J.S.A. Touring 

Jackets. 
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Imperial Bedroom 
Elvis Costello 
Columbia 

By Dave Marsh 

This album represents something 
more than the most successful 

pop music Elvis Costello has made 
since Armed Forces; it’s the first al¬ 
bum by any of the original British 
new wavers to fully reckon with re¬ 
cording technology in a pop song 
context. Though claims are now be¬ 
ing made for Costello as a great pop 
writer in the tradition of Cole Por¬ 
ter and Noel Coward, such compar¬ 
isons both underestimate and miss 
the point of this record’s achieve¬ 
ment. The proper antecedents of 
Imperial Bedroom are Abbey Road 
and Sgt. Pepper’s Lonely Hearts 
Club Band, recordings in which the 
craft of composition is inseparable 
from the craft with which they are 
recorded, so much so that it is diffi¬ 
cult to say where one process begins 
and the other leaves off. 

There’s a simpler way to put it: 
with a couple of exceptions (“Al¬ 
most Blue,” “You Little Fool”) you 
need not expect many cover ver¬ 
sions of these superbly constructed 
songs, because Costello’s method of 
writing them isn’t limited to staff 
paper. Like all the greatest writers 
of the rock era, he makes use of ev¬ 
ery technological facility available 
to him (kudos here to producer 
Geoff Emerick—one shudders to 
think what Nick Lowe’s sonic inep¬ 
titude might have done to such so¬ 
phisticated music): Steve Nieve’s 
marvelous piano and organ playing; 
Costello’s nasal vocal delivery; 
Emerick’s mixes in which the voice 
and keyboard float around one an¬ 
other, like characters in dialogue; 
and the full orchestral scoring on 
several numbers are part of the bed¬ 
rock conceptions of the songs. 

Additionally, there is Costello’s 
use of aural montage—not just se¬ 
gues between songs, as on East Side 
Story, the Costello-produced 
Squeeze LP, but fade-ins and -outs 
within songs, the most intelligent ex¬ 
tension of such ideas since the afore¬ 
mentioned Beatles albums. There’s 
nothing radical about what Costello 
is doing here—which may signify 
one of his limitations—but he’s pick¬ 
ing up the threads that have been left 
dangling for the better part of a de¬ 
cade. In its ability to fuse pop struc¬ 
ture and aural ambition, without 
sinking to the cliches of Asia-level 
art-rock, Imperial Bedroom is just 
this side of awesome. 

Nevertheless, Costello remains 
on the far side of paradise. His am¬ 
bitions may be the equal of the Bea¬ 
tles, but his abilities aren’t. Most 
insurmountably, where the Beatles 
were blessed with two great singers 
and a competent one, Costello has 
taken a half-dozen albums to per¬ 
fect a style that’s more-or-less lis¬ 
tenable. Secondly, where the 
Beatles' (or any great artist’s) vision 
is expansive—always extending the 
personal—the essence of Costello’s 
style is contraction, spotting the 
personal elements in universal situ¬ 
ations and proceeding to pore over 
these details obsessively. One rea¬ 
son my favorite Costello record re¬ 
mains Armed Forces is that that was 
the last time he seemed prepared to 
tackle the world at large, rather 
than addressing a cult. Maybe this 
is an inherent problem for a human¬ 
ist misanthrope like Costello (as it 

Elvis’s Studio Masterpiece: 
Timeless And Trivial Music 

sometimes was for a misanthrope 
humanist like John Lennon), but in 
the end, it’s easier to excuse his lack 
of generosity than to forgive it. 
There’s something a bit mean about 
Costello—symbolized by his first-
ever lyric sheet, included with this 
album, being printed in an utterly 
unreadable form—that limits his 
work. 
There are all kinds of allusions to 

the Beatles here, from musical para¬ 
phrases to the sing-song “P.S. I 
Love You,” at the end of “Pidgin 
English” (and Emerick, of course, 
cut his engineering spurs working 
with that band), but Costello lacks 
the panoramic vision that could 
contain that ambition, and make it 
something more than a clever exer¬ 
cise. Imperial Bedroom deserves to 
be honored for its technical tri¬ 
umphs, and for its share of memo¬ 
rable songs (“Shabby Doll,” “You 
Little Fool,” “ . . .and in Every 
Home,” “Man Out of Time,” “Pid¬ 
gin English”). Yet it can’t really be 
compared fairly to Sgt. Pepper’s or 
any of rock’s other masterpieces; in 
the end, Imperial Bedroom is an 
Eighties rendition of Love’s Forever 
Changes: music that is truly time¬ 
less and unfortunately trivial. 

Revenge Will Come 
Greg Copeland 
Geffen 

By J.D. Considine 

Somewhere between the third 
and fourth eager replays of this 

stunning debut, it occurred to me 
that one of the miracles being 
worked before my very ears was the 
revitalization of the “L.A. Sound.” 
The songs were subtle but taut, bar¬ 
ing their teeth with an amiability 
that was anything but mellow; the 
singing, straightforward and as¬ 
sured, carried the easy twang and 
measured cadences of country & 
western without the slightest hint 

of compone; the perspective was 
distinctly personal yet without 
seeming to have tumbled out the 
confessional door. In short, Greg 
Copeland undoes in ten songs what 
a decade of studio flatulence has 
wrought upon the ideals of Gram 
Parsons. 
Then again, reaffirming ideals 

seems to be a principal concern of 
Copeland's. Again and again, the 
songs on Revenge Will Come tell of 
the troubles that follow the betrayal 
of right for convenience, whether 
through the profiteering of a slum¬ 
lord or the bloodlust of a vengeful 
killer. Taken as generalities, Cope¬ 
land’s harangues seem oddly moral¬ 
istic—he champions divine justice 
to the point of dismissing its mortal 
equivalent, something which initial¬ 
ly makes his outlaw sagas seem 
strangely unbalanced—but taken 
apiece, these songs form a state¬ 
ment of such unblinking power that 
comparisons to A Pilgrim ’s Progress 
are hardly out of line. 
More accurate, though, would 

be a linkage between Copeland and 
the novelist Charles Williams, for 
like Williams, Copeland is firmly 
grounded in the vagaries of modem 
living. After describing the squalor 

of life among migrant farmworkers 
in Eagleston, Texas, where drugs 
seem like the only means to free¬ 
dom in a town dominated by Air 
Force commerce, Copeland observes, 
Satan the devil 
he’s got hundreds of names 
Africa’s hungry 
Asia ’s in flames 
Nobody cares what the devil has done 
out in the trailers in Eagleston. 
The juxtaposition of scale is fright¬ 
ening, and that’s the point. To 
Copeland’s mind, it seems that the 
evils we could abate and haven’t are 
far worse than those commonly 
considered to be "major problems.” 
Where Copeland is most effective 

is in bringing this sense of personal 
morality home with a wallop. His 
plain-speaking ballad delivery al¬ 
lows him plenty of leeway for ser¬ 
monizing, but somehow his zingers 
are always given a rock and roll 
treatment. Take the way he drives 
home his notion of justice on 
“Used” by remarking that trying to 
lock up corrupt judges misses the 
point because “They’ve got to die 
sometime/And prison time moves 
slow”—then stops dead for four 
bars of pregnant silence before kick¬ 
ing back in with the basic pulse. Or 
revel in the anti-suburban, anti-ma¬ 
terialist stomp of “Full Cleveland” 
as Copeland turns one of rock’s fa¬ 
vorite cliches on its head: “You’d 
just kill to let the good times 
roll.” 

While it would be misrepresent¬ 
ing Revenge Will Come to call it a 
party album, there is a certain sense 
of release behind Copeland’s righ¬ 
teous rock, the kind of release few 
moralists can muster. Granted, a 
certain amount of that has to be 
credited to the cast of crack session 
players assembled by producer 
Jackson Browne; but the overall 
sense of purpose and unremitting 
drive seem to belong to Copeland 
alone, and it’s that energy which ig¬ 
nites the ideas he puts forth. That he 
can give his messages not only sub¬ 
stance but palpable dynamism is 
what, above all, makes Revenge Will 
Come essential listening. 

Combat Rock 
Clash 
Epic 

By Christopher Hill 

It’s been a mighty long way down rock ’n' roll for the Clash. Com¬ 
ing on in the beginning like a Lon¬ 
don bred MC5—smart and self 
aware, yet with working class con¬ 
nections that kept a sharp function¬ 
al edge on their art—the Clash have 
wandered into a world of rock star 
girlfriends, personality crises in 
Paris, “Clash Clothes” and the cos¬ 
mopolitan smorgasbord of styles 
heard ón Combat Rock. 
With Sandinista, it appeared that 

the Clash’s reach was exceeding their 
grasp. Like the Beatles at mid-career, 
the Clash -had allowed themselves to 
be made arbiters of modernism. It 
was never a question of overfed artis¬ 
tic egos: the Clash have little of the 
typical rock ’n’ roll urge toward self-
aggrandizement. Rather, one senses 
that in their earnestness and modesty, 
the “only band that matters” label be¬ 
came something to be lived up to 
rather than down. The effort to main¬ 
tain this role has withered the re¬ 
sources of the best bands, and the 
Clash unfortunately, are not immune. 
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Though the single album format 
of Combat Rock curbs some of the 
scattershot eclecticism of Sandinis¬ 
ta, the songs still reveal a band, for 
better or for worse, gone internation¬ 
al in lifestyle. Both “Shaun Flynn” 
and “Straight To Hell” take us to 
Southeast Asia, using quiet oriental 
atmospherics to—cryptically—ex¬ 
plore the price of war and peace. 
“Rock The Casbah” hides some 
ideological problems beneath its jolly 
English music hall satire of Islamic 
fundamentalists. Where the Clash 
has been known to deplore the 
world-wide spread of western cul¬ 
ture, here they make a unique excep¬ 
tion for rock ’n’ roll—using the 
broadest of stereotypes to parody the 
militant Muslims’ distaste for west¬ 
ern pop. Are the Clash aware of the 
implicit double-standard here? 

Mostly, though, Combat Rock is 
a view from the States, returning 
again and again to images of New 
York City and Hollywood. The al¬ 
bum’s confusing blend of inspira¬ 
tion and affectation is seen most 
clearly in the songs that stem from 
this obsessipn. “The Ghetto Defen¬ 
dent” may come from Brixton, but 
the feel is Harlem. The band finds 
the hypnotic, harp-haunted groove, 
and a chorus—“ ‘Ghetto Defen¬ 
dent’ it is heroin pity! not tear gas 
nor baton charges that stops you 
taking the city”—that’s both pro¬ 
vocative and, thanks to Joe Strum¬ 
mer’s poignant reading, a powerful 
hook. But then, inexplicably, they 
blow it, with embarrassing Noble 
Savage lyrics about “the ghetto 
prince of gutter poets” and a dumb-
foundingly banal rap by Allen 
Ginsberg. 
“Overpowered By Funk,” 

“Death Is A Star,” “Innoculated 
City” follow a similar pattern—a 
smattering of good ideas getting 
lost among fashionable unintelligi¬ 
ble conceits. In all this polyglot, one 
looks for a genuine Clash voice. 
You can find it in their jokes, for 

humor is still a key to this band’s 
soul. “Should I Stay Or Should I 
Go” is a high-spirited tribute to vin¬ 
tage, dumb garage-band-rock, the 
band bellowing the choruses in 
Spanish like a bunch of frat cats 
trashing Tijuana on spring break. 
“Atom Tan” highlights Strummer’s 
lovely amalgam of Cockney sputter 
and Dylanesque insinuation, as he 
leads his yowling backup singers in 
precise and rousing choruses. The 
jittery guitar and ominous piano 
rumbling of “Know Your Rights” 
are themselves wry comments on 
Strummer’s indignant delivery. 
Combat Rock documents a band 

at the nexus where radical vision 
and trend-hopping cross. Along 
with the Clash’s broader scope has 
come the danger of becoming just 
one more rootless major rock act, 
their global committedness degen¬ 
erating in dilettantism. It’s not a 
unique dilemma; and the Clash’s 
best work offers hope that they’ll 
yet meet it with a unique response. 

Robert Plant, whose astringent bel¬ 
low and blues mannerisms have 
never been successfully imitated 
anyway. 

Still, bands do not live by a voice 
alone, and perhaps the most signifi¬ 
cant point in Pictures at Eleven's fa¬ 
vor is that everything from the 
slowed-down tempi to the drum 
mix feels like Led Zeppelin. Yet at 
the same time, there’s enough dif¬ 
ference that the similarities never 
seem forced; Plant paints with large 
strokes, so that as much as “Slow 
Dancer” captures the thudding 
groove of a Zep stoned-rocker, 
there’s no attempt to approximate 
the intense detail Page would have 
given the guitar tracks or the 
sweeping breadth Jones would have 
infused. Instead, Plant sets up a ba¬ 
sic outline, defines parameters for 
the band, and lets his voice do the 
rest. 
Although to tell the truth, it’s 

really his production know-how 
that shines through. Robbie Blunt 
is no Jimmy Page, but thanks to 
similar licks and identical tone 
you’d never know; ditto drummers 
Phil Collins and Cozy Powell, 
whose pro forma thrashings roll out 
of the mix sounding like Bonzo 
Bonham himself. In fact, the illu¬ 
sion is so well-worked it’s tempting 
to resent it just on principle—ex¬ 
cept that by keeping to the rules 
Plant has turned in an album that’s 
more consistent than Presence and 
every bit as listenable as In Through 
the Out Door. Granted, such effort¬ 
less triumph of form over content 
doesn’t speak too well of Zepo-
mania in the first place, but if you 
worried about that sort of thing you 
probably never got past the first 
album. 

The Lone Rhino 
Adrian Belew 
Island 

Pictures at Eleven 
Robert Plant 
Swan Song 

By J.D. Considine 

Everybody knew that sooner or 
later one of the surviving mem¬ 

bers of Led Zeppelin would turn up 
with an album of insta-Zep to cash 
in on the unwavering devotion of 
fans who’ll probably still be writing 
John Bonham’s name in rock polls 
five years from now. Jimmy Page 
has passed on his option, choosing 
instead to turn musicianly and 
write soundtracks; John Paul Jones 
was essentially invisible in the origi¬ 
nal and therefore would probably 
never come any closer than, say, 
Detective; and that leaves us with 

By Jonathan Gregg 

Adrian Belew’s first solo album 
almost delivers on the promise 

the guitarist showed during his ap¬ 
prenticeship with Frank Zappa, 
David Bowie, the 1980’s Talking 
Heads safari and the current edition 
of King Crimson. Ultimately, 
though, The Lone Rhino too overtly 
and too often points up the debt Be¬ 
lew owes to his former employers. 

Thus, “The Momur,” “Swing¬ 
line” and “Adidas In Heat” echo 
Zappa’s quirky, fill-ridden style; 
“Stop It” is lifted from Bowie’s 
“Watch That Man;” and many of 
the vocals bear the distinctive idio¬ 
syncrasies of David Byrne. Coupled 
to a songwriting style that often 
tends towards bombastic simplicity, 
these elements sometimes fall to¬ 
gether in an uncomfortable fusion 
not as great as the sum of its 
parts. 

There are many good moments, 
though, particularly when Belew’s 
humorously offbeat lyrics explore 
the wild life of the urban jungle 
(“The Momur,” “Big Electric Cat,” 
“Animal Grace”). Best of all is the 
title track, a dignified, lumbering 
tribute to a rhinoceros in a zoo 
which has a melancholy charm un¬ 
common to the other numbers here. 
Belew’s chameleon-like guitar tex¬ 
tures inhabit every crevice, produc¬ 
ing effects ranging from bagpipes to 
rhinoceri. 

Like a skillful lighting techni¬ 
cian, Adrian Belew can conjure up 
a variety of moods. But texture is 
one thing and substance another; 
while “Naive Guitars” (a spectral 
weaving of guitar and guitar syn¬ 
thesizer) strikes a blow for the lat¬ 
ter, one is still left wishing the artist 
would stick to one sound long 
enough to make a more provocative 
personal statement. 

Wise Guy 
Kid Creole and the 
Coconuts 
Ze/Sire 

By Vince Aletti 

Kid Creole’s last album, Fresh 
Fruit in Foreign Places, was a 

wildly ambitious, typically eccen¬ 
tric bit of personal and musical 
myth-making that cast the Kid 
(producer/composer/vocalist Au¬ 
gust Darnell, formerly with the Sa¬ 
vannah Band) as a zoot-suited 
Odysseus on a knockabout, island¬ 
hopping journey in search of his 
elusive girlfriend Mimi. Conceived 
as the score for an as-yet-unrealized 
Broadway show, Fresh Fruit was a 
manic melodrama, a frenzied 
farce—and a wonderful record: wit¬ 
ty, smart, subtle, brash, and so rich 
with allusions (musical and other¬ 
wise) that it was difficult to digest 

on one hearing. Wise Guy is an at¬ 
tempt to continue this modern my¬ 
thology with a footnote and flash¬ 
back to the odyssey (what is this, 
Ulysses IP) that finds Kid and 
crew shipwrecked in B’Dilli Bay, an 
island “where crime is the only 
passport and RACE MUSIC the 
only way out.” If this intricate con¬ 
ceit isn’t distracting enough, it 
should also be noted that Wise Guy 
was originally planned as an Au¬ 
gust Darnell solo album, “Coconu-
tized” at the last minute with the 
addition of one cut by KC co-con-
spirator Andy Hernandez, and re¬ 
leased to much dissenting comment 
from within the group. Knowing 
this, and the fact that Darnell re¬ 
gards Wise Guy’s r&b slant as such 
a “compromise” that he had to con¬ 
coct the B’Dilli Bay scenario 
(“RACE MUSIC the only way 
out”) to justify it, could easily 
dampen one’s initial enthusiasm for 
the album. But listen: forget all this. 
As with nearly every other con¬ 

cept album in existence, it really 
isn’t necessary to know the theme 
to get the music. And since Darnell 
is awfully vague about the connec¬ 
tions between the eight songs 
here—as opposed to the twelve 
songs on Fresh Fruit, which were 
all clearly, if whimsically, tied to 
the tale—it’s easier to pretend a 
narrative doesn’t exist and go on 
from there. The form is, after all, as 
loose and zany as one of those Bob 

Hope Road movies and the punch 
lines zing by fast and furious. Dar¬ 
nell is one of the most consistently 
clever lyricists working in any 
genre, with a fine sense of the ab¬ 
surd and an ear for twisted cliche, 
wacky rhyme, and jazzy double en¬ 
tendre. His songs are playful and 
street smart, with a sharp satiric 
edge that keeps them biting and 
taut. Just right for his dense, allu¬ 
sive arrangements, sliding through 
musical styles with abandon and 
delight. If Wise Guy is more con¬ 
scious of pop r&b commerciality 
than previous Kid Creole albums, 
Darnell’s “compromise” would be 
barely discernible to the average 
Commodores or Rick James fan. 
His rhythm mix—from reggae, ca¬ 
lypso, big band bop and salsa to ev¬ 
ery variant of r&b—may not sound 
as startling or as radical as it once 
did, but it still sounds like no one 
else on record. Not surprisingly, the 
album’s most commercial cut, “I’m 
a Wonderful Thing, Baby,” is one 
of the freshest songs on the radio 
right now. An egotistic boast that 
never takes itself seriously, “Won¬ 
derful Thing” follows no formula, 
breaks lots of rules, and carries it off 
in an utterly idiosyncratic style. 
“Girl, I’m at my peak/And that’s a 
fact,” Darnell brags in his scratchy, 
insinuating voice. I suspect he 
hasn’t actually reached that peak, 
but Wise Guy offers a dizzying pan¬ 
orama of the ascent. 

one more dance and/leave here with 
an understanding. That might 
sound like a good old rock ’n’ roll 
story, but it’s not, because he asks 
for the soft number after being bru¬ 
talized by bass and terrorized by tre¬ 
ble. No matter— if, like Elvis 
Costello on Almost Blue, Jackson 
has used another medium to allow 
vulnerability into his work, so be it. 
What counts is that the battle in his 
heart and music rages on. 

Night And Day 
Joe Jackson 
A&M 

By Wayne King 

Joe Jackson’s been doing some 
more time travelling, it seems. 

Last year’s Jumpin ’ Jive had every¬ 
one asking that ’40s big band musi¬ 
cal question, “Where’s the action, 
Jackson?” With Night and Day, 
Joe’s gone uptown to the plush set¬ 
ting of an even earlier time. As the 
cover drawing shows, Joe is now 
coming on as a George Gershwin/ 
Cole Porter type. Yet this is no new 
sound that he’s simply dabbling in. 
Night And Day returns the man to 
his roots, takes him back to his days 
as a cocktail lounge pianist. By inte¬ 
grating this style with some solid 
modern songwriting, Jackson has 
come up with the most comfortable 
and heartfelt music of his career. 

This vaguely programmatic re¬ 
cord can be looked upon as Jack-
son’s equivalent to Gershwin’s “An 
American In Paris.” Night And Day 
shows the Big City, New York, 
from the viewpoint of a cynical ’80s 
Englishman. The first side’s songs 
run together and are linked by the 
sounds and beat (mostly Spanish, 
conveniently supplying Jackson 
with a wealth of strong piano 
rhythms) that dominate the city. 
It’s a bleak picture he paints, one 
every bit as desperate as an urban 
artist’s dead-of-night graffiti attack 
on the subway yards. Even on the 
brighter songs, there remains cir¬ 
cumscription: There’s always some¬ 
thing breaking us in two/everything 
gives you cancer. Jackson’s usual 
measure of bitterness is here, and he 
still spends too much time setting 
up and knocking down such easy 
targets as television. 

For the first time, though, he’» 
offered hope to himself (and there¬ 
fore us). The “Night” side’s closer, 
“Steppin’ Out,” is a harbinger with 
its loping, uplifting rhythm of the 
sunlight that peeks through a bit on 
the “Day” side. And with “A Slow 
Song,” he gathers all the music’s ro¬ 
mantic qualities into one majestic 
statement. The protagonist here 
begs the DJ to play a slow one so 
that he and his new love can have 

Street Opera 
Ashford & Simpson 
Capitol 

Primitive Guitars 
Phil Manzanera 
Editions EG 

By Michael Shore 

Virtually alone (John Wetton 
plays bass on one cut), Phil 

Manzanera has crafted one of the 
most challenging and satisfying of 
ambient albums. Like the best of 
genre (Steve Reich, Philip Glass, 
Eno, Robert Fripp’s guitar/tape-
loop Frippertronics), Primitive Gui¬ 
tars may be mood music suspended 
somewhere between foreground 
and background, but it’s well worth 
the listener’s attention. 
What makes Primitive Guitars 

work so well is its tension, a tingly 
contrast between the muted mood 
on the surfaces of these nine pieces, 
and the dark power brooding in the 
shadows. Much of the time, Man¬ 
zanera uses massed, percussively 
strummed acoustic guitars for both 
rhythm and texture; on “Criollo” 
and “Caracas” they take on a dis¬ 
tinct Latin flavor, harking back to 
Manzanera’s South American 
homeland. But the pastoral tone 
colors inevitably give way, through 
overlapping echo and sheer whip¬ 
lash intensity, to staggered synco¬ 
pation and edgy rhythms. At 
crucial moments (on “Ritmo de 
Los Angeles,” “Impossible Guitar” 
and “Big Dome”) the artist erupts 
into gripping, lyrical solos in his 
classic style, with a burnished fuzz¬ 
tone and keening sustain—sort of 
like Santana fried around the edges. 
Much of Primitive Guitars is cere¬ 
bral, but just as much of it is weird¬ 
ly danceable, and none of it is as 
facile as the accomplished art-rock 
on Manzanera’s solo albums. 

By Michael Goldberg 

An album of sophisticated soul 
from Nick Ashford and his 

wife, Valerie Simpson, Street Opera 
is more than just a collection of im¬ 
maculate songs that recall the Mo¬ 
town Sound of the ’60s: side two of 
this album is a concept piece, 
“Street Opera,” composed of a 
four-song love suite that manages to 
wrap romance around the trials and 
tribulations of surviving in the ’80s. 
The “Street Opera” half of the al¬ 

bum is a gorgeous showcase for 
Ashford & Simpson’s singing, song¬ 
writing and production talents. The 
story describes the plight of a 
“Working Man” played by Ashford 
who is snowed under by his job, 
can’t make enough money to sup¬ 
port the family, and believes he 
must leave them. In “Who Will 
They Look To,” Simpson, playing 
his “Woman,” counters with a 
melodramatic song in which she 
wonders just who her children will 
look up to and learn from if their fa¬ 
ther is gone. “You don’t know how 
it is,” sings a tormented Ashford. 
“You don’t know how many tears a 
man cried.” Replies Simpson: “I do 
know, I do care, I understand 
what’s out there.” 

“Street Corner,” the duo’s funky 
soul hit, describes what the “Work¬ 
ing Man” is up against in the real 
world: hookers and dope dealers 
tempt him like Sirens as they call 
from the street corner. The final 
song, a majestic piece that recalls 
“Ain’t No Mountain High 
Enough,” finds man and woman re¬ 
solved to stay together, despite their 
problems. 

This is certainly an overly dra¬ 
matic tale, yet the spectacular vocal 
blend that Ashford & Simpson cre¬ 
ate, as well as the contrast between 
Simpson’s tough lead vocals and 
Ashford’s occasional falsetto, are 
truly gripping. Though side two’s 
concept dominates this album, side 
one contains four terrific love 
songs—and as another prominent 
tunesmith once asked, “What’s 
wrong with that?” 
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Lead vocalist/guitarist Dave 
Meniketti has the vibrato to reach 
the cheap seats and enoûgh speed 
and flash to impress Jimmy Page 
fans. The rhythm section of Phil 
Kennemore (bass) and Leonard 
Haze (drums) keeps pumping, 
while Joey Alves offers some neat 
turns on acoustic guitar. 

Yesterday & Today recorded two 
LPs in the ’70s. Whether Y&T gets 
a second chance may depend on the 
public’s appetite for rock nostalgia. 

Earthshaker 
Y&T 
A&M 

By Mark Mehler 

Y&T is a 10-year-old Oakland, 
California quartet formerly 

known as Yesterday & Today. The 
current emphasis is on the former— 
it’d be hard to believe that the band 
has changed a thing since 1972. 
Y&T trods the familiar ground of 

post-Clapton, formula blues rock, 
marked by hotly mixed guitars, strut¬ 
ting, posturing vocals and heavy-
handed drumming. Though the 
group claims to be playing heavy met¬ 
al rock, the Top 40 hook is para¬ 
mount. Only three cuts— “Squeeze,” 
“Hurricane” and “Knock You 
Out”—sublimate melody and verse 
for loud, manic blasts. 

Business As Usual 
Men at Work 
Columbia 

By Mark Mehler 

On the song “Down Under,” 
Men at Work explore the 

problem of being an Australian 
rock band: “Do you come from a 
land down under?/where women 
glow and men plunder/can’t you 
hear, can’t you hear the thunder/ 
you better run, you better take 
cover.” 
The thunder is the sound of a 

hundred bar bands seeking record¬ 
ing contracts. Men at Work made it 
out of Melbourne’s inner city be¬ 
cause they did not join in the noise, 
but rather fashioned a pop sound 
unlike anything being exported 
from that continent. 

Their writing is dry and witty, 
their melodies often haunting; and 
the use of saxophone and flute to 
create mood is a major bonus. Busi¬ 
ness As Usual is an impressive debut 
from a band in only its third year of 
existence. 
Among the highlights are “Down 

Under,” a reggaeish rocker featur¬ 
ing Greg Ham’s playful flute; 
“Down By The Sea,” a rock chanty 
which tugs at the heart via Ham’s 
saxophone; and “People Just Love 
To Play With Words,” a children’s 
song with a subtext out of Elvis 
Costello’s library of pain. 

Colin Hay, vocalist and chief 
writer, guitarist Ron Strykert, and 
Ham are those most responsible for 
bringing this Tasmanian experience 
to America. Finally, an Australian 
sensibility not measured in decibels. 

Built For Speed 
Stray Cats 
EMI-America 

By Barry Alfonso 

Unlike their U.S. neo-rockabilly 
counterparts, the Blasters, 

New York’s Stray Cats seem less in¬ 
tent in keeping ’50s rock styles alive 
than in appropriating them for their 
own punkish ends. Granted, the 
likes of Gene Vincent and Eddie 
Cochran were rebels of their time, 
but a line like “Your hair’s all 
greasy and you feel like a slob” 
(from the Cats’ “Runaway Boys”) 
is a bit too raw to come from most 
traditional ’billies. I don’t think the 
Stray Cats will ever end up fat and 
playing Vegas like You-Know-Who 
did. 
The best tracks on Built For 

The EV PL80 Microphone 
When it came to designing the EV PL80, our engi¬ 
neers went far beyond traditional microphone 
design standards, measurements and technologies. 
They went all the way to the technology of the 
human voice. 

Using a computer-generated procedure called 

The tight, super-cardioid directional characteristic 
of the PL80 provides the up-close bass boost (prox¬ 
imity effect) preferred by many entertainers. At the 
same time, it also delivers high feedback resistance 
when working close to sound reinforcement 
speakers and monitors. 

The PL80 has an attractive snow gray finish 
and a contrasting dent-proof Memraflex grille with 
integral blast filter to guard against P-popping. 

“fast Fourier transform” 
(FFT), EVengineers were able BEFORE WE PUT 
S" THE EV PL80 TOGETHER, 
components WE TOOK THE HUMAN VOICE 

For an up-close and 
personal look at the EV 

of the human voice’s waveforms. The FFT 
technique allowed them to precisely pre-

PL80, get into 
action and get 

to your 
EV dealer 

A TA A T>m today And A MA I« I while you’re there, be sure to ask about 
m  A* our other PL “Sound in Action” mikes— 

diet how the PL80 would sound in real life use including our world famous PL6 and PL20 instru¬ 
as it was being designed. As a result, the EV PL80 
microphone is a precision instrument that enhances 
the performer’s voice without compromising the 
performer’s vocal quality 

Competitive mikes like Shure’s SM58 (which 
was designed with technology over a decade old) 
simply can’t match the “today” sound of the PL80. 

ment mikes. Or write for a free copy of our EV Pro 
Line Brochure. Electro-Vbice, Inc., 600 Cecil Street, 
Buchanan, Michigan 49107 

Elecfrol/bice 
SOUND IN ACTION 

Speed (largely a compilation album 
drawn from the band’s two British 
LPs) bristle with youthful ferocity. 
Vocalist Brian Setzer can sound cel¬ 
ebratory (“Jeannie, Jeannie, Jean¬ 
nie”), menacing (“Rumble In 
Brighton”) or supremely cool 
(“Stray Cat Strut”). Backing up the 
swagger is his deft guitar work, 
sounding two parts Scotty Moore to 
one part George Thorogood. The 
rhythm section of Slim Jim and Lee 
Rocker jumps with appropriate 
snap. 
Not all the tunes are up to snuff 

here—the title track, for one, isn’t 
very convincing. For the most part, 
though, this is Class A rock, with or 
without the -abilly attached. 

Pete Shelley 
Homosapien 
Arista Records 

By David Keeps 

Pete Shelley is a transformer. As 
principal songsmith for the 

now-defunct Buzzocks, he grafted 
singalong hooks and choruses onto 
noisy punk rock to create a string of 
hit singles in his native England. 
Now, on this solo debut, he blends 
’60s pop melodics with disco staples 
to forge a rock hybrid for the ’80s. 
Homosapien is a solo LP in its 

strictest definition—just Shelley’s 
twangy guitar and voice in concert 
with automated keyboards and per¬ 
cussion sounds that do more than go 
blip and whoosh in the night. Freed 
by technology, he explores a broad 
range of moods and musical genres, 
which results in a more human, indi¬ 
vidual sound than attitude-mongering 
electropoppers like the Human 
League. 
When he aims for the feet, Shel¬ 

ley conjures up compelling dance 
numbers like the propulsive “Ho¬ 
mosapien” and its vibrant sound-
alike “I Don’t Know What It Is.” 
But there’s also the wry honky-tonk 
synthaboogie of “Just One Of 
Those Affairs,” and the Eastern 
mantra-cum-yodels of “I Generate 
A Feeling.” Shelley’s nasal voice 
lacks neither soul nor conviction, 
conveying every nuance of emotion 
from wistfulness to passion. 

Although the title track has the 
classic sexual ambiguity of “Lola” 
and “Walk On The Wild Side,” 
Shelley’s aim is clearly not titilla¬ 
tion. While he often acts the roman¬ 
tic fool, he is never less than 
compassionate and humane: “I 
don’t want to classify you like an 
animal in a zoo...you’re a homosa¬ 
pien too.” 

North By Northwest 
Tom Robinson 
1RS 

By Wayne King 

Tom Robinson has always been 
easier to respect for the intelli¬ 

gence and articulation he’s shown 
in dealing with the press than for 
his artistry. North By Northwest 
does nothing to alter that impres¬ 
sion; once again, he’s failed to come 
up with a musical form as charis¬ 
matic and clever as his own person¬ 
ality. 
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Recording in Germany on an 
eight-track machine, Robinson’s in¬ 
tentions were to use simpler tech¬ 
nology and production techniques 
to come up with a self-sufficient 
style. But the record is hindered by 
these limitations; the sound is consis¬ 
tent throughout, but its impact is 
muffled. Robinson’s monotone sing¬ 
ing has appeal but can’t quite con¬ 
vey the urgency needed as counter¬ 
point to the music. The entire 
experimental tone of the project 
seems more a matter of circum¬ 
stance than artistic necessity, a feel¬ 
ing furthered by the number of 
leftover and collaborative composi¬ 
tions. There’s one cover version, 
four tunes written with members of 
his last band—Sector 27—and two 
done with Peter Gabriel, with no 
hint of any new development. Most 
of the songs are sketches—often ob¬ 
scure—of recent personal events de¬ 
livered without the kind of tran¬ 
scendent performance that might 
make them relevant or communi¬ 
cate their impact on Robinson. 

Even after repeated listenings, 
Tom Robinson’s talents cannot 
penetrate the awkwardness of North 
By Northwest. If he had already es¬ 
tablished powerful and recogniz¬ 
able stylistic concerns, the lighter, 
constricted feel of the album might 
impress one as a meaningful if mi¬ 
nor exploration. But an artist still 
searching for ways to impart more 
of himself has to outline a musical 
profile more personal and direct 
than North By Northwest. 

ford, still resolutely complex and 
precise in his pursuit of the ellipti¬ 
cal beat, shows signs of becoming 

. . .funky. The delicate per¬ 
cussive harmonies of his Simmons 
electronic drums and Tony Levin’s 
sublime, supportive presence on 
Stick in the opening section of 
“Waiting Man” is a perfect exam¬ 
ple of the incidental musical smarts 
which immediately distinguishes 
Crimson from others flatulating un¬ 
der the guise of art rock or avant-
garde music. 

Michael Smotherman 
Epic 

By Charles Paikert 

Michael Smotherman’s self-ti¬ 
tled debut album is, at various 

times, odd, touching, quirky, en¬ 
gaging, affected, rollicking and 
sometimes even rocking. 
Smotherman demands to be tak¬ 

en on his own terms. While this po¬ 
sition is admirable in an age of 
formula songs, it’s also risky. For 
this artist it’s riskier still, because 
he’s so eclectic. On some songs he 
employs Cajun-style polyrhythms, 
others come close to being simple 
folk ballads, while still others are in 
a Billy Joel pop-rock vein. 

Sometimes it works, sometimes it 
doesn’t. At his best (“Cold Burn” 
and “Fais Do Do,” for example), 
Smotherman combines original, en¬ 
gaging lyrics with a forceful, rhyth¬ 
mic underpinning; at other times, 
Smotherman can be both trite and 
pretentious, and that’s when the 
music falls flatter than a collapsed 
souffle. 

All things being equal. Smother¬ 
man’s debut is most memorable for 
one great song, “Do I Ever Cross 
Your Mind,” co-written with Billy 
Burnette. Here Smotherman ap¬ 
plies the full, rich textures of his 
voice to a haunting tale of lost love 
that’s given only minimal accompa¬ 
niment. It’s sincere without being 
sentimental, and effectively show¬ 
cases Smotherman’s strengths both 
as a writer and a vocalist. Here’s 
hoping he builds on these next time 
around. 

Three Sides Live 
Genesis 
Atlantic 

By Nick Burton 

For the most part, Three Sides 
Live is nothing more than a 

souvenir of Genesis’ 1981 tour, 
complete with many of their most 
popular tunes of the last few years 
(“Turn It On Again," “ABACAB,” 
“Follow You, Follow Me,” etc.). 
The songs are performed with Gen¬ 
esis’ usual sophistication, and Phil 
Collins does a fine job of filling out 
the vocal work. In other words, it’s 
fairly typical. 
Of the live tracks, “In The Cage” 

is without question the best mo¬ 
ment on the album. It’s a rather 
speedy version of the song (from 
The Lamb Lies Down On Broad¬ 

way) that segues into the majestic 
mid-section of “The Cinema Show” 
(from Selling England By The 
Pound) which in turn shifts into the 
instrumental break of “The Colo¬ 
ny of Slippermen” (another Lamb 
track). The way the band slips and 
slides its way through this medley is 
a marvel, with Tony Banks proving 
that there is indeed room for taste¬ 
ful synthesizer playing in pop 
music. 
The album's fourth side is com¬ 

prised of studio material, most of it 
very good. “Paperlate,” “You 
Might Recall” and “Me and Virgil” 
are outtakes from the ABACAB ses¬ 
sions which subsequently found 
their way onto an English EP called 
3x3. “Paperlate” again features 
the Earth, Wind and Fire horns, 
and the song has a pleasant top 40 
feel. Both “You Might Recall” and 
“Me and Virgil” benefit from Mike 
Rutherford’s jangling 12-string gui¬ 
tar work. The fourth side’s best 
tracks are Tony Banks’ “Evidence 
of Autumn,” and Rutherford’s 
“Open Door,” ballads from the 
Duke sessions. 

FYI: the import pressing of this 
album has a live fourth side, featur¬ 
ing “The Fountain of Salmacis” 
(from Nursery Cryme) as well as a 
medley of “It" and “Watcher of the 
Skies” with Steve Hackett and Bill 
Bruford on hand. 

Beat 
King Crimson 
Warner Bros/E.G. Records 

The most musically usable and intense effects avail¬ 
able today are housed in virtually indestructible 
Lexan" polycarbonate cases which are scratch¬ 
resistant, impervious to shock and will look new for 
years. The Commande Series' large and accessible 
footswitch lets you engage the effect smoothly and 
quietly while a high intensity LED, positioned for 
maximum visibility and protected by the shape of the 
case, tells you when you're In Commande. A new 
pop-open battery access cover with a living hinge 
design that will last indefinitely enables you to 
change the batteries in a matter of seconds without 
tools. Convenient end-located jacks for input, output 

and remote AC power simplify the hookup of single 
effects and multiple effects chains. 
The Commande Series embodies the implicit corpo¬ 
rate philosophy at MXR. From day one, we've under¬ 
stood our products to represent more than mere 
hardware in the music-making process. Our signal 
processing devices are intended as individual in¬ 
struments for the musician to use much as an artist 
uses a palette and a paintbrush. Colorations to 
enhance the music and focus a musician’s individual 
means of creative expression. Transcending the 
hard-line parameters of electronic technology where 
signal processing becomes an art form in itself. 

By J.C. Costa 

On the first pass, Beat is a cool, 
lucid shot of musical intelli¬ 

gence in a sodden summer full of 
art rock reruns and housewife 
heavy metal music. King Crimson’s 
precisely tuned instrumental gifts 
allow them to simultaneously probe 
deeper into the dark night of elec¬ 
tronic improvisation, while offering 
up several ballads (“Heartbeat,” 
"Two Hands”) that could nestle 
comfortably on any AOR playlist. 
And while Beat carries on Crim¬ 

son’s intricate signature ensemble 
passages and contrapuntal rhythms 
from last year’s Discipline, there is 
enough here for a wide cross section 
of listeners to feast on. Guitar me¬ 
chanics and the technocratic elite 
will no doubt be drawn to the blaz¬ 
ing guitar/guitar synth rave-ups be¬ 
tween Belew and Fripp on "The 
Howler” and "Requiem,” definitive 
examples of electronic meltdown 
which provide the kind of free-form 
"indulgence” that Fripp fans have 
long been calling for. 
Which brings us to a basic point 

about Beat-, everybody seems will¬ 
ing to let it all hang out. Fripp plays 
more pure guitar than he has in 
years. Belew’s lyrics, especially on 
“Neurotica” (an offhanded piss-
take on the daily blur of the modern 
world), are both light and pointed; 
on love songs like “Two Hands” 
(surreal lyrics courtesy of Margaret 
Belew) Belew is naked and vulnera¬ 
ble, his lush, occasionally overripe 
vocals supported by his glass cathe¬ 
dral Stratocaster and Fripp’s sur¬ 
prisingly sweet counter-melodies. 
Belew’s voice and guitar—not to 
mention his wonderfully direct and 
consciously innocent way of look¬ 
ing at life—plays a crucial role in 
connecting all the elemental tex¬ 
tures within the band. 
At this point, Crimson is devel¬ 

oping a healthy inner tension be¬ 
tween concept and execution, 
stretching the limits of their collec¬ 
tive potential as improvisers. Bru¬ 

Time Delay 
Providing audio delay 
times of 30 to 300 mil¬ 
liseconds, the Time 
Delay also features a 
Regeneration control 
for repeating echoes 
and hard reverb. 
Internal noise reduc¬ 
tion circuitry pro¬ 
duces a dynamic 
range greater than 
85 dB. 

Phaser 
The Phaser’s Sweep 
Control provides a 
wide range of usable 
phasing effects and 
Regeneration can be 
added for extra color 
and depth. Innovative 
switching technology 
allows higher signal 
levels without distor¬ 
tion and produces 
one of the most 
consistent phasing 
effects ever created. 

Overdrive 
The Overdrive offers 
the full range of dis¬ 
tortion effects from a 
heavy fuzz with pro¬ 
longed sustain to a 
more subtle tube sat¬ 
uration effect. Two 
controls allow ad¬ 
justment of distortion 
and output levels. 

Sustain 
The Sustain pro¬ 
duces smooth, 
natural-sounding 
compression and the 
punch of a dynamic 
attack by making 
automatic adjust¬ 
ments to the attack 
and release times 
in response to the 
rate of change of 
the input signal. 
Provides unbeliev¬ 
ably long sustain. 

Preamp 
An instrument 
and transducer 
preamplifier, the 
Preamp's unique 
equalization circuit 
provides variable 
one-knob control of 
bass and treble boost 
or cut. A variable gain 
control offers from 
0 to 20 dB of gain. 
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Daylight Again 
Crosby, Stills and Nash 
Atlantic 

By Wayne King 

It shouldn’t have to be pointed 
out that this is 1982, and a 

“group” releasing its third record in 
13 years needs to prove itself again, 
especially since the California cul¬ 
tural scene that spawned it doesn’t 
dominate the charts or hearts of to¬ 
day’s audiences as in days of old. 
But Crosby, Stills and Nash are dis¬ 
sipating the good will engendered 
by past performances by releasing a 
record which, in the here and now, 
has little relevancy and exhibits vir¬ 
tually 'no signs of life. Daylight 
Again contains a few harmless 
Graham Nash numbers, including 
the obligatory “Our House” re¬ 

write, “Song For Susan,” while a 
seemingly-spent David Crosby 
checks in with one inconsequential 
tune of his own. The only surprise 
the album holds is a revitalized Ste¬ 
phen Stills, whose contributions to¬ 
tal six, five of which are co-written. 
All are his usual assemblage of cli¬ 
ches, but just writing that many 
songs seemed beyond the man in re¬ 
cent, burned-out years. Yet even if 
these tracks had any strength of 
their own, none would break 
through the warmed-over produc¬ 
tion. Minus the spontaneity and 
quirks that a Neil Young can add, 
the end result is all studio, with the 
overdubbed construction of the 
sound working against the harmony 
that’s supposed to be the founda¬ 
tion of CS&N’s art. 
There is one poignant moment 

here. The very last lines on the rec¬ 
ord, a reprise of Four Way Street's 
“Find The Cost of Freedom," finds 
their voices joined by that of Art 
Garfunkel. Together, they ache and 
strain to produce the harmonies 
that once came, like their former 
success, so easy. If the same effort 
and honesty had appeared through¬ 
out Daylight Again, one might actu¬ 
ally believe something could have 
come from the reunion. As it 
stands, there’s simply too great a 
lack of care and thought demon¬ 
strated here to give one much hope. 

The Other Woman 
Ray Parker, Jr. 
Arista 

By Nelson George 

At his best, as on last year’s A 
Woman Needs Love, Ray 

Parker, Jr. is a suave veteran of the 
singles scene, spinning tales of lust 
and love with lecherous humor. 
Unfortunately, The Other Woman 
lacks the musical assurance and 
cutesy lyrical turns of his previous 
albums. This LP’s deficiencies are 
most apparent when contrasted 
with the strengths of its two best 
songs, “The Other Woman” and 
“Stop, Look Before You Love.” 
The title cut is infectious pop¬ 

rock with a cooing girl chorus and 
Parker’s droll phrasing giving the 
old “I fell in love with the other 

woman” routine a nice, sardonic 
edge. “Stop” features Parker’s ad¬ 
mirable mix of debauchery and 
deadpan vocalizing over an appro¬ 
priately mellow mid-tempo rhythm. 
The rest of the songs here suffer 

from the fatal combination of bad 
writing (“Street Love” is the son of 
“Other Woman”) and lousy execu¬ 
tion (“Let’s Get Off,” “Let Me 
Go”). One hopes The Other Wom¬ 
an is merely a one-night stand of 
mediocrity for this talented guitar-
ist-writer-producer, and not the 
start of a lengthy affair. 

Defying Gravity 
The Sherbs 
Ateo 

pealing singer. Mixing the vocals so 
hot, however, has the unfortunate 
side effect of accentuating the lyr¬ 
ics, which are insipid, even for mu¬ 
sic that seems equally influenced by 
Yes, Journey and Tom Jones. 
The band’s worst excesses can be 

heard on “Don’t Throw It Away” 
and “We Can Make It,” a pair of 
hand-wringing, overwrought tunes 
totally unsupported by the weight 
of the material. By contrast, “We 
Ride Tonight” is a neat uptempo 
anthem, while “I’m Alive” is a 
rather unpretentious British-style 
rocker. 

Mostly, though. Defying Gravity 
is slick mood music that defies nei¬ 
ther gravity nor pop convention. 

By Mark Mehler 

Though this is only their second 
U.S. release, the Sherbs have 

been a major group in Australia— 
under the monicker Sherbert—for a 
decade. Thus, they’ve had plenty of 
time to hone their style of melo¬ 
dramatic, heavily-synthesized pop¬ 
rock. 

Defying Gravity, a specially-
priced, six-song mini-LP produced 
by the band and the appropriately-
named Richard Lush, emphasizes 
the lead vocals of Daryl Braith¬ 
waite, an emotive, reasonably ap-

Words From The Front 
Tom Verlaine 
Warner Bros. 

ON MAXELL,ROCK’N’ROLL 
IS REALLY HERE TO STAY. 

By Roy Trakin 

Tom Verlaine’s third post-Tele¬ 
vision solo LP is a relaxed, free-

floating work in which the artist 
playfully constructs sand castles, 
then astutely observes the ocean 
tide washing them away. This may 
well be sappy solipsism, but it also 
begs an important question: are 
Verlaine’s nagging neuroses finally 
becoming unblocked, or is he trying 
to take advantage of the lack of au¬ 
dience expectations at this point in 
his career? 

Whatever the case, Words From 
The Front make it clear that Ver¬ 
laine is not the next rock ’n’ roll 
guitar hero; his music’s too sparse 
and eccentric for that, even if both 
“Postcards from Waterloo” and 
“Words From The Front” paint 
their scenarios with wrenching, 
Neil Young-styled solos. More to 
the point are “Present Arrived” and 
“Coming Apart”: both spotlight 
the rising-and-falling, overlapping 
guitar chunks which have been Ver¬ 
laine’s trademark since his 
C.B.G.B. days, but they’re closer to 
the linear, building style of jazz 
than to the circular, blues-based 
rifling of rock. 

Still further afield, “Clear It 
Away” juxtaposes single organ 
tones with short guitar notes in one 
of Verlaine’s whimsical “Yanqui 
Time” conceits, while the atmo¬ 
spheric “Days On The Mountain” 
reduces everything to a percussive 
plunk and a drum loop echoed by a 
wall-of-sound guitar orchestra as a 
lovely acoustic-type solo chimes to 
fadeout. This is Tom Verlaine at his 
most poetic. Nevertheless, as the 
artist turns ever-inward, it becomes 
obvious that he lacks the flamboy¬ 
ant spirit associated with great gui¬ 
tar communicators, though he 
remains an intriguing experimenter. 

Round 1 
Bruzer 
Handshake 

Every Maxell cassette is destined to become a golden oldie. 
Because at Maxell we build cassettes to standards that are 

60% higher than the industry calls for. 
Durable cassettes you can shake, rattle yet they keep on 

rolling. 
Precision engineered tape that even after 500 plays still 

delivers high fidelity 
So when we say, on Maxell, rock ’n’ roll 

is really here to stay... Be-Bop-A-Lu-La... 
we don’t mean maybe. 

Maxell Cotpcxatior» oí Ametica ôO Oxford Oive Moonachie, N J 07074 IT’S WORTH IT 

By David Manners 

At last, an aural argument for eu¬ 
thanasia. How bad is Round 

IT Let me count the ways. 
Whiney vocalist Paul Frank is 

without a doubt the most grating, 
most obnoxious singer to come 
down the pipe since Slade’s Noddy 
Holder, and that’s about as low-
rent as they get. As for the music, it 
runs the gamut of heavy metal/boo-
gie cliches which are so obvious 
even Molly Hatchet wouldn’t touch 
them, to uncommonly tasteless ap¬ 
propriations from the worst art¬ 
rock (Ed. note: don’t be redun¬ 
dant). As for the musicianship, all 
you need to know is that Bruzer’s 
drummer is Vinnie Appice, brother 
of the congenitally-tasteless Car¬ 
mine, who carries on the leaden, 
unimaginative style you’d expect 
from someone bearing such an illus¬ 
trious surname. 
Even the proofreader sucks! 

Right here on the back cover the 
Zildjian cymbal company’s name is 
misspelled! What a tough break, 
considering Zildjian probably do¬ 
nated its product in return for a 
credit on the album jacket. But 
then, breathes there a soul among 
us who truly wants to be associated 
with Bruzer? The hideous answer is 
in the grooves. 
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Continued from page 1 
the promotional backing necessary 
to reach a wider audience could 
come only from a major label. “We 
recorded for independent labels,” 
Doe says matter-of-factly, "and the 
point was made. And when we 
signed with Elektra the point was 
made well. We’ve showed new 
bands what can be accomplished.” 
And that, too, is the point. What¬ 

ever musical accomplishments are 
in the offing, it’s certain that any 
number of young bands have taken 
heart from the establishment’s im¬ 
primatur on X’s efforts. “The idea 
behind having a band is that you get 
the opportunity to record albums,” 
Doe points out, “and that you get 
the opportunity to make music for 
people.” Exene admits that being 
“darlings of the rock press” didn’t 
hurt X’s cause, but stresses that 
“we did a lot of touring, so I’d like 
to think that because of that and 
our music we deserve some of the 
credit for our success.” 

Undoubtedly so. While the pres¬ 
sure of recording for a major label is 
often severe (witness the Motels 
having to record two different ver¬ 
sions of their third album) and can 
often prove aesthetically debilitat¬ 
ing (at which point the music be¬ 
comes formula), X has, on Under 
The Big Black Sun, adequately 
demonstrated its abilities while im¬ 
proving on its strong point: the po¬ 
etic beauty and (here’s that word 
again) blatant honesty that make 
theirs some of the most acutely sen¬ 
sitive and observant tales this side 
of the early Bob Dylan. The entire 
record is pervaded by the gloom 
brought on by the tragic death of 
Exene’s sister Mary in a car acci¬ 
dent. “Riding With Mary” and 
“Come Back To Me” deal directly 
with Exene’s loss, and a number of 
other cuts delineate the depression 
and questioning of faith that occurs 
in the wake of such tragedies. 
The album’s diversity of styles 

has caused critics to compare X 
with a plethora of bands, new and 
old: the Clash, the Doors, the Go-
Go’s, Jefferson Airplane. “I’ve nev¬ 
er even listened to one of their 
albums,” a clearly-puzzled Doe 
says of the Airplane. He tries to fig¬ 
ure out reasons for the two bands 
being compared at all, and finally 

Exene Cervenka and John Doe: One floats, the other shuffles. 

comes up with an answer: “We’re 
both white people with male and fe¬ 
male singers, which is as close as I 
can come.” 
Comparisons with the Doors are 

easier to understand. Explains Doe: 
“We came from L.A., we were out¬ 
side the traditional music business, 

we had interesting or involved lyr¬ 
ics, Ray Manzarek produced us, 
and we talked about life in L.A. So, 
like it or not, we were the ‘New 
Doors.’ But I think the Doors were 
a blues-synthesis band, and we’re 
more rock ’n’ roll oriented.” 
And what if X’s breakthrough 

happens in a major way? Will suc¬ 
cess spoil X? The questions give rise 
to a certain macabre sense of humor 
in the respondents. 

“If this album does really good 
and gets into the top 10,” Exene 
says seriously, “we’re going to say, 
‘Let’s not take planes.’ ” 

“I think you learn from other 
people’s mistakes,” Doe suggests. 
“Like not taking twenty-six reds on 
New Year’s Eve.” 
“Or not renting a private plane in 

Clear Lake, Iowa,” jokes Billy 
Zoom. His reference to the deaths 
of Richie Valens, Buddy Holly and 
the Big Bopper, though playful and 
arguably in bad taste, at the same 
time indicates the sort of role mod¬ 
els X fancies. “We listen to every 
American music that ever had 
soul,” proclaims Doe. 
The other three are equally em¬ 

phatic in stating their love for 
American music, and particularly 
for the founding fathers of rock ’n’ 
roll, some of whom they feel have 
been unfairly slighted. Doe finds it 
ironic that "Gene Vincent and Ed¬ 
die Cochran are gods in England, 
and the Beatles and the Stones are 
gods here in America. 

“That seems really weird to me,” 
he says after a pause. “It’s like 
someone who’s forgotten their cul¬ 
ture, and that’s sad.” 
And when Doe talks about learn¬ 

ing the lessons of history, and fol¬ 
lowing in the tradition established 
by his American rock idols, you get 
the distinct feeling that, apart from 
the music, certain matters of the 
heart are in order within the band. 
That could be the biggest break¬ 
through of them all. 

Furs 
Continued from page 4 
I think the same thing applies to us. 
It probably opened our eyes and 
ears as well. There’s a lot more cul¬ 
tural diversity, and you don’t get 
quite so much prejudice about dif¬ 
ferent musics—all the bitching and 
back-biting from other bands—that 
you get over here. In America 
things take longer to get through, 
but they tend to last a longer time; 
whereas in England it’s a very quick 
flash and it’s gone. Music and fash¬ 
ion are very closely aligned in 
Britain.” 
So as Butler and the Furs refine 

their music, is it possible that the 
distance between sound and lyrics 
could be bridged so that the singer 
doesn't always seem to be disguis¬ 
ing his feelings? “It’s not so much 
disguising things,” reflects Butler. 
“I prefer to use third person when¬ 
ever I can, and use the word you in¬ 
stead of I, and things like that. 
Maybe it’s not a good idea to be ab¬ 
solutely personal. When you’re 
writing a song it’s not necessarily 
something you feel yourself—it’s 
like something you feel should be 
said. If you’re writing a book, 
you’re not necessarily all the char¬ 
acters, yet you can still recognize 
what a certain person would feel in 
a situation. All your enduring lyrics 
get a mood over. You’d probably 
stand more of a chance of people 
saying, ‘Yes, this is about me’ in 
terms of third person. It probably 
does relate slightly to my persona in 
that you can recognize something. 
And maybe if you can recognize 
something, you felt it.” 

Introducing the Princeton Reverb IL Descended from the all-time great studio 

amp, but with more power and lots of extra features. Like mid boost, presence 

control, switchable lead sound, 12" speaker, lock-joint pine cabinet, and more. 

We rate it at 20 watts, but we think it sounds more like 50. 

Before you buy any amp in this power range, hear what the world's most expe¬ 

rienced builder of tube amps can do for less than $400 (suggested retail). The 

new Champ II and Super Champ are almost as powerful and even more 

affordable. All three are built to survive years and years of grueling road use. 

THE SOUND THAT CREATES* LEGENDS 
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video 
calendar 

Fri/27_ 
1? AM The Trouble With Girls (1969) 
i Starring Elvis Presley and Sheree 
a’S0BJ North. Presley’s last film musical. 

The big production number is 
“Clean Up Your Own Back Yard." 
Is this any way to treat a King? 

2 AM Night Flight 
Take Off: Self Conscious Over You— 

Network the and politics of Northern 
Ireland 

Mon/30 
7 AM, 8 PM Elvis (1979) 
Sfioirtrne; Starring Kurt Russell as Elvis, Shel-
alw 9/2, ley Winters as Gladys Presley. Fair-
9,5 to-middling TV movie chronicling 

Presley’s career up to the Las Vegas 
comeback years. Russell's vocals are 
capably dubbed by Ronnie McDowell. 

September 

August 

Tues/24 
1? AM Viva Las Vegas <i9m> 
i aoo Starring Elyis Presley and Ann-Mar-

also 8/29 gret One of pres)ey’s better celluloid 
efforts features the excellent Doc Po-
mus-Mort Shuman title song as well 
as Presley’s red-hot version of “What 
I’d Say.” Otherwise, it’s all downhill. 

PM The Beach Boys In Concert 
”7® The sounds of summers gone by. 
also 8/26 “Good Vibrations,” “Surfin’ USA,” 

“Little Deuce Coup,” ad infinitum. 
Inspiration may have fled this group, 
but there's some special magic at 
work here that’s utterly timeless. 

Thurs/26_ 
Johnny Cash’s America 
The Man in Black performs a salute 

HBv to American history and traditions in 
a 75-minute performance taped at 
the Kennedy Center in Washington, 
D.C. Cash’s wife, June Carter, also 
appears. Guests Steve Goodman, 
John Prine and Rodney Crowell lend 
the proceedings a certain dignity. 

6 AM. 7PM No Nukes (1980) 
Starring Jackson Browne, Crosby, 

Also 8/29, sti|js an£j Nash, Carly Simon, Bruce 
V' Springsteen and others. Filmed at 

five MUSE concerts at Madison 
Square Garden and an outdoor rally 
at Battery Park. You may want to 
catch 40 winks when Browne or 
Springsteen aren’t performing. 

5:30 PM This Is Elvis (1981) 
Showtime: Uneven docudrama of Elvis Presley’s 
ateo 9/1 life. Actual footage is interwoven 
9/4,9/7 with patently-staged scenes featuring 

actors who bear only the slightest re¬ 
semblance to Presley. 

Sat/28 
8:30 AM Earth, Wind & Fire 
aiw 8/30 In Concert 

Hour-long performance taped at the 
Oakland Coliseum includes the 
group’s hits “Fantasy,” “Shining 
Star,” “Let’s Groove" and “That’s 
The Way Of The World." 

4P“' Live Dead! The Grateful 
lcA“L Dead In Concert 

Last month’s Video Highlight. A 78-
minute concert special recorded live 
at the Dead's Halloween engagement 
at Radio City Music Hall. 

«J* Breaking Glass (two» 
Snowtme The oid story—sex and ¿rugs 

and rock ’n’ roll—in a punk setting. 
Hazel O’Connor is excellent, but the 
rest of the movie is nowhere. 

5 PM Special Delivery: 
The Police 

also 8/31 ***’ new wave *n concert
100 8 J performing “Roxanne," "So Lone¬ 

ly," “Born In The 1950s" and 
"There’s A Hole In my Life." 

730 PM Country Goes To England 
Filmed at the 14th Annual Festival 

9/5 9/8 Country Music at London’s Wem-
9/13 9/17 Arena ’ special features 

' some outstanding artists performing 
before 40,000 enthusiastic fans. 
Highlights include sets by Don Wil¬ 
liams, Roy Orbison, Terri Gibbs, Jer¬ 
ry Lee Lewis and Billy Swan. On the 
downside, there’s Kris Kristofferson 
and Mel Tillis, but no one’s perfect. 

’’ PM Bob Welch and Friends 
Taped in concert at the Roxy The¬ 
atre in L.A., Welch is joined by Mick 
Fleetwood, Stevie Nicks, and Chris¬ 
tine and John McVie. 

” ™ Night Flight 
Take Off: ELO—the Electric Light 

Network Orchestra and its spectacular live 
show from England 

Fri/3_ 
"P* Journey In Concert 

Concert taped at the Houston Sum¬ 
mit in Texas in November, 1981. 
Songs include “Open Arms," “Don’t 
Stop Believing" and other tracks 
from “Escape." 

Sat/4 _ 
5 PM Special Delivery: Roger 

Daltrey-Ride a Rock Horse 
Solo performance by the Who’s lead 
singer features concert as well as 
concept footage 

n™ REO Speedwagon In Concert 
MTV Concert at McNichols Arena in Den¬ 

ver in July, 1981. Songs featured in¬ 
clude hits from Hi Infidelity. 

Sun/5 _ 
"PM RI O Speedwagon Special 
MTV Documentary featuring new video 

clips from the band’s latest LP, Good 
Trouble. Songs include “Keep The 
Fire Burnin’.” 

Mon/6_ _ 
Rock Spectacular 

MTV Exclusive MTV special featuring the 
Rolling Stones, Robert Plant, Fleet¬ 
wood Mac and other special guests. 

Thurs/9 
5™ Livewire 

The Nuts & Bolts of Rock ’N’ Roll, 
Part 1 : inside the music business with 

also 9/11 gUests sid Bernstein, concert pro¬ 
moter and manager; and Bruce Har¬ 
ris, VP of A&R, Epic Records. 

Sun/29 

Fri/10_ 
Livewire 

Nickel- The Nuts & Bolts of Rock ’N’ Roll, 
odeon; part 2: guests include Don Wardell 
also 9/12 of RCA Records, Triumph’s Mike 

Levine, and WBCN (Boston) disc 
jockey, Oedipus. 

11PM Liner Notes: Fleetwood Mac 
MTV 

Interview with members of Fleet¬ 
wood Mac about the making of the 
band's new album; also shows scenes 
from videos shot for promotional use 
with Mirage 

Sat/ll 

Outlaws 
MT* Premier showing of hour-long con¬ 

cert film shot at the Tower Theatre 
in Philadelphia on June 29, 1982 

PHOTO LYNN GOLDSMITH/LGI 

REO Speedwagon Weekend 
For those so inclined, MTV offers a weekend double-shot of REO 
Speedwagon in September. On the 4th, the main attraction is a con¬ 
cert film of REO at the McNichols Arena in Denver in July, ’81 ; the 
following night, fans will get the latest news about the band’s activi¬ 
ties via documentary footage and new video clips from REO’s latest 
release, Good Trouble. 11 PM, Sept. 4 and 5, MTV. 

Sun/12_ 
’’ PM Double Feature 
MTV Quadrophenia—a story of alienation 

and self-destruction based on the 
Who’s album of the same title. The 
Who’s original music, plus oldies by 
Booker T„ The Cascades, James 
Brown, The Bonnettes and others 
power the story in a way no other 
rock soundtrack ever has. The Po¬ 
lice’s Sting appears briefly in a cam¬ 
eo. Also on the bill, Roger Daltrey: 
Ride A Rock Horse—solo perfor¬ 
mance by the Who’s lead singer fea¬ 
tures concert as well as concept 
footage. 

“Just Between You and Me." Fol¬ 
lowed by the premier of “Profiles in 
Rock," featuring an interview with 
April Wine’s Miles Goodwin, who 
discusses the band’s new LP, Power 
Play. 

Sun/19 
Pete Townshend Special 

MTV Interview filmed on-location in En¬ 
gland. Features new video clips from 
Townshend’s latest solo album, AU 
The Best Cowboys Have Chinese Eyes. 

Mon/20 

Sat/18 
April Wine Special 

MTV Concert taped in London and Toron¬ 
to includes on-location footage with 
members of the band. Songs include 
"Sign of the Gypsy Queen" and 

Livewire 
Nickel- Life in the Fast Lane: coping (or not) 
öd*00 with stardom. Guests include the 

Mamas and Papas; Dave Getz, 
drummer for Big Brother and the 
Holding Company; and Myra Fried¬ 
man, author of the Janis Joplin biog¬ 
raphy, Buried Alive. 

^^^^ss^sssssssss^s^SmÍU^ííí^üsssssss^sssssssss^^ 
KING OF BEERS 

Bruce Springsteen 

PRESENTS 

ROLLING STONE'S 
CONTINUOUS 

! HISTORY 
I OF ROCK & ROLL 

Alabama 

Alaska 

Arizona 

Arkansas 

California 

Birmingham 

Decatjr 
Montgomery 
Anchorage 

Dillingham 
Phoenix 

Batesville 
El Dorado 
Fayetteville 
Ft Smith 
Walnut Ridge 
Bakersfield 
Concord 
El Centro 
Escondido 
Los Angeles 

WRKK FM 
(K-99) 
WMSL AM 

Key West 

Orlando 

Connecticut 

DC 
Delaware 

Florida 

WHHY FM 
KRKN-FM 
KDLG FM 
KZZP FM 
KZLE FM 
KLBQ FM 
KKEG FM 
KISR-FM 
KCAZ-FM 
KMGN FM 

KEGR-FM 
KAMP AM 
KOWN FM 
KLOS FM 

Georgia 

Pensacola 
Tallahassee 
Tampa/St Pete 
Adel 

Atlanta 

Mammoth Lakes KM MT FM 
Marysville 

Modesto 
Needles 

Sacramento 
San Bernardino 

KMYC AM 
KRFD FM 
KFIV FM 
KSFE AM 
KZAP FM 

Hawaii 

Idaho 

Illinois 

Riverside KCAL-FM 
San Diego KPRI FM 
San Francisco/ 
San Jose KSJO FM 
San Luis Obispo KZOZ-FM 
Santa Rosa KVRE FM 
Ventura KGAB FM 
Boulder 

Denver KPKE FM 
Colorado 
Springs 

Steamboat 
Springs 
Hartford 
Westport 
Washington 
Bethany 
Beach 
Gainesville 
Jacksonville 

KILO FM 

KFMU-FM 
WPLR FM 
WDJF FM 
WWDC FM 

WWTR FM 
WRUF-FM 
WFYV FM 

Indiana 

Iowa 

Kansas 

Kentucky 

Augusta 
Brunswick 
Savannah 
Warner 
Robins 
Honolulu 
Wailuku 

Grangeville 

Orofino 
IWin Falls 
Chicago 
DeKalb/ 
Rockford 
Murphysboro 
Peoria 
Peru 

Rockford 
Springfield 
Evansville 
Ft. Wayne 
Indianapolis 
Lafayette 
Rensslaer 
Tell City 
Davenport 
Des Moines 

WKWF AM 

WDIZ FM 
WTKX FM 
WOWD-FM 
WQXM FM 
WDDQ FM 

WKLS 
AM/FM 
WYMX FM 
WPIQ FM 
Z 102 

WRBN-FM 
KDUK FM 
KAOI-FM 
KORT AM/ 
FM 
KLER FM 
KMTW-FM 
WMET FM 

WDEK FM 

WTAO FM 
WWCT FM 
WIVQ-FM 
Y 95 
WDBR FM 
WYER FM 
WMEE FM 
WIKS FM 
WXUS FM 
WRIN AM 
WTCJ AM 
WXLP FM 
KBLE 
KGGO FM 
KKRQ FM 
99 KG 
KICT FM 

Louisiana Hammond 
Lafayette 
Monroe 
New Orleans 

WHMD-FM 
KSMB FM 
KNOE FM 
WRNO FM 

Nevada Las Vegas 
Reno 

New Hampshire Claremont 

Maine Bangor WACZ-AM 

Presque Isle WEGP AM 

Maryland Baltimore WIYY FM 
Cumberland WCMD AM/ 

WJSE-FM 

Havre De Grace WH0G-AM/ 

Massachusetts Boston 

Holyoke/ 
Chicopee/ 

Michigan 

Minnesota 

Mississippi 

Missouri 

Montana 

Nebraska 

Springfield 
Cadillac 
Detroit 
Escanaba 
Flint 
Grand Rapids 
Ironwood 
Kalkaska 
Lansing 

Marquette 
Albert Lea 
Ojluth 

Minneapolis/ 
St. Paul 
Sauk Rapids 
Cleveland 
Mendian 
Kansas City 
St Louis 
Sedalia 
Springfield 

Butte 
Kalispell 

Missoula 

Columbus 
Hastings 
Lincoln 
Omaha 

FM 
WBCN FM 

WAQY FM 
WKJF FM 

WLLZ FM 
WFNN FM 
WWCK FM 

WLAV-FM 
WIMI FM 
WKLTFM 
Q 106 
WDMJ AM 

KCPI FM 
KQDS FM 

KDWB FM 
WHMH FM 
WQAZ FM 

WJDQ FM 
KY 102 
KWK FM 
KCBW FM 
KRFG FM 

FM Y 95 
KFXZ FM 

KZOQ-FM 

KTTT FM 
KICS FM 
KFMQ FM 
Z 92 FM 

New Jersey 

New Mexico 

New York 

North Carolina 

Ohio 

Oklahoma 

Oregon 

Pennsylvania 

Atlantic City 
Dover 
Manahawkin 
Princeton 

Alamogordo 
Albuquerque 
Carlsbad 
Albany/ 
Schenectady/ 
Troy 
Binghamton 
Buffalo 
Montour Falls 
Nassau/ 
Suffolk 
New York 

Poughkeepsie 

Syracuse 
Utica/ 
Rome 
Ahoskie 
Charlotte 
Wanchese 
Whiteville 

Athens 
Cleveland 
Columbus 
Dayton 

New Lexington 
Portsmouth 
Toledo 

Altus 
Tulsa 

Eugene/ 
Springfield 
Portland 

Allentown/ 
Bethlehem 

KOMP FM 
KOZZ FM 

WECM FM 

WGRF FM 
WDHA FM 
WJRZ FM 
WPRB FM 

KYLO FM 
94 ROCK 
KATK FM 

WPYX FM 
3WT FM 
97 ROCK 
WXXY FM 

WRCN FM 
WNEW FM 
WPDH FM 

WSYR FM 

WOUR FM 
WRCS-AM 
WROQ FM 
WOBR AM 
WQTR FM 

Q 105 
WMMS FM 
WLVQ FM 
WTUE FM 

WWJM-FM 
WIOI AM 
WIOT FM 
(FM 104 
KWHW FM 
KMOD-FM 

KZEL FM 
KGON FM 

Z 95 

Clearfield WQYX FM 

Harrisburg FM 104 
Philadelphia WYSP FM 
Pittsburgh WDVE FM 
Scranton ROCK 107 
State College WXLR FM 

Rhode Island Providence WHJY FM 
Westerly WERI FM 

South Carolina Beaufort 

South Dakota 

Tennessee 

Charleston 

Greenville/ 
Spartanburg 
Kingstree 
Sioux Falls 

Chattanooga 
Huntington 

Texas 

Utah 

Vermont 

Knoxville 
Martin 
Memphis 
Nashville 
Amarillo 
Austin 
Beaumont 
Bryan 

Corpus Chnsb 

Dallas 
Houston 
Lubbock 
Odessa 
San Angelo 
San Antonio 
Sherman 
Waco 
Wichita Falls 

Cedar City 
Logan 
Moab 
Provo/Orem 

Salt Lake City 

Brattleboro 

WQLO FM 

WSSX FM 

WANS FM 
WKSP AM 
Z 93 

WSKZ FM 
WPVG AM 
FM 

WIMZ FM 

WCMT-FM 
ROCK 103 
WKDF FM 
KYTX FM 

KLBJ FM 
KZOM-FM 
WTAW FM 

KNCN-FM 

Q 102 
KLOL FM 
KSEL FM 
KRIG AM 
KIXY AM 

KISS FM 
KDSQ FM 
KNFO FM 
KKQV FM 

KBRE FM 

KBLQ-FM 
KURA FM 
KABE-FM 
KCPX FM 

WKVT AM. 
FM 

Virginia 

Washington 

Charlottesville 
Norfolk 
Richmond 
Roanoke 

Ellensberg 

Seattle 

Spokane 

West Virginia Bluefield 

Charleston/ 
Huntington 
Wheeling 

3WV FM 
WNOR FM 
XL 102 
WROV AM 

KCATFM 

KZAM-FM 

KEZE FM 

WKOY AM 

Wisconsin Appleton 

Eau Claire 
Hayward 
Milwaukee 

WKLC FM 
WOMP FM 

WAPL-FM 
Z 100 
WRLS FM 
WLPX FM 

Wyoming Cheyenne KFBQ FM 

Listen each week 
as the history 
continues . 

Aug. 16-22. 
Styx Profile 

Aug. 23-29 . 
Heavy Metal Part II 

Aug. 30-Sept. 5. 
Greatest Live Albums 

Sept. 6-12 . 
Rock Books 
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Announcements 
Promoters On-Line Listing 

_ _ THE CONCERT 

PROMOTERS 

SOURCE 
_ GET THE COMPETITIVE EDGE_ 

P O L L. IS THE ONLY COMPUTER-
ized information service that tells Promoters 
who’s hot at the box office from clubs to sta¬ 
diums, and how to reach their representa¬ 
tives. We provide a printed desk top resource 
that’s updated every week plus access to the 
only data bank of its kind. Major Booking 
Agents, Promoters, Clubs, Schools, and Are¬ 
nas already subscribe to this service which 
was founded in part by Avalon Attractions 
and Bill Graham. One year subscription $225. 
Call (209) 224-2631. 

Looking to advertise by mail? 
THEN YOU SHOULD PLACE A CLASSI-
fied ad in THE RECORD. Regular classified 
ads cost 750 per word, 16-word min. Illustrat¬ 
ed classified space is $40 per col. inch, 2-inch 
min. THE RECORD, Classified, 745 Fifth 
Avenue, NY, NY 10151. For further info., 
call Patti Fiore at (212) PL8-38OO. 

Free Hit LPs 
NEWLY RELEASED ALBUMS, ALL 
artists, at no cost. Free details. Muzik, 855-
RC8 Main, Springfield, MA 01 105. 

Free Promotional Albums 
CONCERT TICKETS, STEREOS, ETC. 
Information, Barry Publications, 477 82nd 
St., Brooklyn, NY 11209. 

POLL 

Books & Publications 
NEW AGE CARTOONS! GUTS #2 
featuring Benb. Bizarre, hilarious adventures. 
Guaranteed to rearrange your neurons. $1.50 
PPD. Steve Lafler, Box 982, Eugene, OR 
97440. 

JESUS FICTIONAL—HE NEVER EXIST-
ed! Proof Josephus created Jesus, Gospels. 
Booklet: $3—Vector, Box 6215-X, Bellevue, 
WA 98007. 

“CHUCK BERRY: ROCK ’N’ ROLL MU-
sic.” A 228-page biography & discography. 
Limited collector’s edition. $8.95 p&h includ¬ 
ed. Horizon Books, Box 3083, Freemont, CA 
94539. 

Bumpersuckers 
“SUPPORT THE E R A. - MAKE HIM 
Sleep On the Wet Spot!” bumperstickers $3 
to: Vexatious Labels, Box 55401-1, 4150 Chi¬ 
cago Ave., Riverside, CA 92517. 

BUMPERSTICKERS CUSTOM MADE 
to your order. Send $2 ea. to Stickers, Box 
0922, Kenosha, WI 53141. 

Business Opportunities 
WE GUARANTEE YOUR BROAD-
casting license. No exam! No fee! Send $2 to: 
Opportunity By Product, Box 254527, Sacra¬ 
mento, CA 95825. 

Buttons 
WORLD S ONLY BUTTON STORE— 
over 60,000 designs available! No button we 
don’t have! Design your own too, sizes 1", 
I1//, 1*4’» 1%'» 2%*! Sayings, rock, punk, 
everything! Catalog—$1, Buttonmasters, Box 
129, Dept. RD, Bridgeport, PA 19405. (2 15)-
277-1966. 

Clothing 
FANTASTIC T-SHIRTS $6.50 PPD, JER-
seys $8.50 ppd. Led Zeppelin, Doors, Police, 
Go-Go’s, Stones, Beatles, B Sabbath, Lynyrd 
Skynyrd, J. Hendrix, Joan Jett, AC/DC, Har¬ 
ley Davidson, Heavy Metal, Ozzy Ozbourne, 
Rush, The Who, Iron Maiden, P. Benatar, 
Asia, Bruce Lee, E. Presley. Send $1 for huge 
illustrated catalog over 50 pages, Imp. rec¬ 
ords, posters, t-shirts, pins. Rock House, Box 
54, Dept. R, Oakland Gardens, NY 11364. 

“THE EMPIRE STRIKES BACK!” -
beneath Union Jack. Red & blue on white t-
shirt. Limited edition $8 and $1 p&h. 
S,M,L,XL. Soundwork Ltd., 1716 Ocean 
Ave., #61, San Francisco, CA 941 12. 

Collector's Items 
Remember The Aces! 

ONLY OFFICIAL LIVE LP. 
Virgin vinyl. Carefully mas¬ 
tered. Guaranteed best-sound¬ 
ing live LP in your collection 
or money back. Double LP 
with two posters. $17.98 plus 

Aik 

$2 postage per set. Dealers inquire. Check or 
money order. Aces, Box 944, Sheffield, AL 
35660. 

Beatles Amer. Tour w/Ed Rudy 
INTERVIEW ALBUM—RARE—AUTO-
graphed on request-$12 postpaid. 
Ed Rudy (American Tour LP) 
G.P.O. Box 1981 Dept. R 
New York, NY 10001 

ROCK AND TEEN MAGAZINES (1950 
to present): Cream, Hullabaloo, Rolling 
Stone, Melody Maker, “16“, etc. Catalog $1. 
Back Issues, 28 Orchard St., Ridgefield Park, 
NJ 07660. 

Classified Advertising 
BEATLES MEMORABILIA CATALOG. 
Records, T-shirts, many items. Send $1 for 
catalog. Olympia Enterprises, Box 91153, Los 
Angeles, CA 90009. 

BEATLES CATALOG—ORIGINAL 
memorabilia, models, dolls, Yellow Subma¬ 
rine items, lots more! Send $1. Schreiber, Box 
2704 ( 186 RS), Huntington Beach, CA 92649. 
I buy memorabilia!! 

Comedy 
COMEDY WRITER'S ONE LINER FILE 
for sale, reasonable, 850 pages, 650 subjects. 
Lee Haas, Box 1062R, Hawthorne, CA 90250 

Gifts and Merchandise 
Let A Mexi-Kan Hold 
YOUR STASH! I'LL HELP PRESERVE 
freshness and taste. Sit me anywhere. I’ll keep 
things a secret. I’m bright, colorful, funny 
and they’ll send me with instructions and a 
fitted lid. I’ve been called the ultimate con¬ 
tainer. My other friends seeking work are 
Ronald Rea-Kan, Afro-Kan, Ameri-Kan, 
Itali-Kan or Ku Klux-Kan. Hire a Kan. 
We’re only $3.50 each postpaid. Kan-Co Inc., 
Box 245Z, Beverly, NJ 08010. 

Instruction 
The Music Business Institute 
A CAREER PROGRAM IN MUSIC, 
course includes recording, studio, concert and 
video production; artist representation and 
management; retailing and wholesaling; rec¬ 
ord promotion and marketing; copyright and 
music industry law; songwriters and music 
publishing; & more. Employment assistance. 
Write for free brochure & career guide. MBI, 
Suite 400-RD, 2970 Peachtree Rd., N.W., At-
lanta, GA 30305. (404) 231-3303._ 

GUITAR TRICKS: PRO SECRETS! 
Brain-rapping riffs and effects made easy. $2: 
Noah’s Publications, Box 12662, Jackson, MS 
39211. 

Miscellany 
Need Credit 
GET MASTERCHARGE. OTHERS, 
w/no credit check. Guaranteed! It’s simple, 
legal. Plus other credit secrets. Free details! 
Send SASE to: 
Inflation Reports 
RCA Box 60148 
Los Angeles, CA 90060 

Musicians 

THE HEAVY BRASS BLUSLIDE” 
Bottleneck ring leaves fingers FREE for 
rhythm & lead . . . Vibrating, biting, whining 
heavy brass! Lenny Pogan Inc., Box 353B, 
New York, NY 10025. 

Musicians—get with it! 
WHY WAIT FOR THE RIGHT GROUP 
or right musicians to find you? You can find 
them! Call us - the music industry’s largest 
nationwide referral & get things rolling now. 
Professional Musicians’ Referral TM 
Toll Free 800-328-8660 ( 612 ) 825-6848 
Or Call East Coast Ofc. (609 ) 547-7096 
Or Call West Coast Ofc. (714) 527-5611 

Musicians, free classified 
FREE SPACE IS PROVIDED IN THE 
RECORD for hungry musicians. If you need 
a gig, or additional band members, send us 
your ad (25 word maximum). All listings are 
subject to space availability. If you have 
something to buy or sell, you pay only 50? per 
word. Send your ad to: THE RECORD, Mu¬ 
sicians’ Classified, 745 Fifth Ave., New York, 
NY 10151. 

SATIN PANTS, ETC. FOR ENTERTAIN-
ers etc. Write/call for catalog. Enclose $1 re¬ 
fundable with order. Satin Sales, Dept. 4A, 7 
South 5th St., Minneapolis, MN 55402. (612) 
333-5045. 

SEEKING SERIOUS COUNTRY SINGER 
or band actively recording, desiring original 
lyrics or songs. John W. Edwards, RR# 2, 
Box 480E, Clayton, NC 27520. 

MUSICIANS—NEED INSPIRATION? 
Give yourself “The Creative Edge” with a 
special Personal Programming Cassette—cre¬ 
ated just for you! Guaranteed (no rip-off)-
Free details (S.A.S.E.) Box 111, Newburgh, 
IN 47630. 

GUITARIST NEEDED (18-30) NO SU-
perstars for forming orginal band—leads— 
vocals. Appearance a must. Coachable atti¬ 
tude. Reply: GK, 1118 Kenwyn St., Phila., 
PA 19124._ 

LEAD/RHYTHM GUITAR PLAYER 
seeking to form rock band. Must be dedicat¬ 
ed. Write: 7 West 4650 Sierra Madre #518, 
Reno, NV 89502. 

GUITARIST/VOCALIST WANTED FOR 
one-of-a-kind new wave/hard rock bar trio. 
Expect steady work and good money. Must 
have good equipment and pro attitude. Call 
Rick—(201) 256-6357. 

WANTED: DRUMMER, BASS Gui¬ 
tarist & piano player. Send demo tape along 
with name and address to: K. Nielsen, 23 Vil¬ 
lage View Bluff*, Ballston Lake, NY 12019. 

THE ULTIMATE R&R BAND NOW 
auditioning professional, success-minded vo¬ 
calists in Texas. We want the best. Trade 
tapes or call anytime 806-797-5170. 

GUITARIST/COMPOSER, INDIVIDUAL 
style, seeks immediate blues R&R gig in 
Southwest/Southeast U.S. Experienced, 
working groups can leave message 417-364-
8223, Don. 

R A M. - U.S./U.K. ORIGINAL NEW 
age music rock’n reggae band seeking gigs & 
airplay, tape available. “. . . . an irresistible 
force!” Rolling Stone #362. Box 709, Soquel, 
CA 95073-0709. (408) 476-5235. 

SINGER/GUITARIST OF 6 YEARS, 
prefers country/folk music, seeks established 
band and a place to plug in. Kelly P. Butler, 
7205 Farley, Pinckney, Mich. 48169. 313-
878-5926. 

FEMALE LEAD VOCALIST WANTED 
to front progressive rock band. Write: Jon 
Rose, 2105 Madison Ave., Bridgeport, CT 
06606. 

CHARLES CONSTANTINE, THE GOLD-
en Greek—singer with 8 original recordings, 
20 rock & ballads needs cover band or guitar, 
keys, drums in North Jersey. (201) 992-9455. 

TALENTED LADIES—DRUMMER 
from Dallas area wants to form primarily all 
girl lounge group. Need women who can sing 
and play instrument. Call Ken (214) 235-
6791. 

PRO BASSIST WITH MAJOR LABEL, 
recording and touring experience seeks all¬ 
original rock or pop band. No punks or bar 
bands, please. Rick (914) 896-8944. 

Posters & Photos 
Color Concert Photos! 
HUGE SELECTION, HUNDREDS OF 
performers including rock, country, southern 
bands. Send $1 for beautiful illustrated cata¬ 
log. Mention favorite. 
“Smile” 
Box 15293-RE 
Chesapeake, VA 23320-0293. 

Front row & offstage photos!!! 
AC/DC, ANTS, BENATAR, OZZY, 
Cars F. Mac, Heart, Jimi, Journey, Priest, 
Led Zep, Loverboy, Petty, Police, PiL, 
Queen, REO, Stones, Jett, Van Halen, Who, 
Yes, and 400 other, rock, metal, Southern & 
female performers. Longest in the photo busi¬ 
ness, largest selection, fastest service and 
highest quality by far! Buy the best! Send $2 
for catalog/2 samples. $3 gets 3 samples (list 
3 groups), $4 gets 4 (list 4), etc. Limit $5 for 5 
(list 5). List favorite bands & alternatives for 
samples. 
Pines/Elliot Photos, Ltd. 
P.O. Box 1122, Dept. D 
Madison Square Station 
New York, NY 10159_ 

STAR-FARING WINGS! LEADING design attraction. Color proof-$2. Wind¬ 
shield decal - $7. Wonderwave, Box 219-C 
Malverne, NY 11565. 

FREE! HOTTEST AUCTION LIST ANY-
where! 4 times yearly. Finest Record Stores, 
2400 8th Ave., Greeley, CO 80631. 

GOLDEN OLDIES. THOUSANDS OF 45 
Records available. Send $2 for catalog. Stew¬ 
art Estep Records, Box 10243, Dept. RD, Al¬ 
exandria, VA 22310. 

MUSICIANS, SONGWRITERS, PUB-
lishers: Custom record pressing at unbeatable 
low Canadian dollar prices. Send $2 for our 
information package and price list. Write: 
PMR Distribution, 8-45th Ave. #10, La-
chine, Quebec, Canada H8T 2L7. 

RARE ROCK TAPES FROM 1960s, 1970s, 
1980s. Send for free catalog. Acme, Box 
14438, Dept. RD, Minneapolis, MN 55414. 

METAL MAYHEM STRIKES! FREE 
catalog of the best heavy metal from around 
the world. Write: Metal Mayhem, Box 190, 
Dept. R, Erlanger, KY 41018. 

DIRTY MUSIC? FILTH ROCK? YOU 
bet!!! Extra crude music performed by an ex¬ 
tra funny band. This totally hilarious cassette 
album will really shake up your next party. 
Quality studio production by professional 
band. For more information send $1 for bro¬ 
chure or for cassette tape send $10.50 to 
Wombat Productions, Dept. RS7B, Box 307, 
Sugarland, TX 77478. 

LATIN AMERICAN RECORDS. ALL 
styles. Brazil, Andes, Cuba, Mexico, Argenti¬ 
na, etc. Popular, folk, jazz, salsa, reggae, 
more! Free catalog. Ipanema Records, Box 
49452-R, Austin, TX 78765. 

TAPES CHEAP! 8 TRACKS & CAS-
settes from $1.49. Rock, soul, jazz, el, quad 
and more - Free 36 page tape catalog. Square 
Deal Records, Box 1002, Dept. RR, San Luis 
Obispo, CA 93406. 

LED ZEPPELIN - TRAVELING RIVER-
side Blues ’69/What Is and What—Should 
Never Be (Live)/Thats The Way (Live) (EP 
W/PS) $6.50, (Picture Disc) $16. Robert 
Doyle, Box 152, Pearl River, NY 10965. 

Songwriters 
TOP LINE MUSIC DESERVES TOP 
flight lyrics. Lyrics are our specialty. J. E. 
Granger, Badboy Enterprises, 301 Troy 
Drive, Madison, WI 53704. 

SEVEN STEP SUCCESS FORMULA FOR 
a professional songwriting career: $1, plus 
free song evaluation. Send to: Expression Mu¬ 
sic Group, 652 Hilary Dr., Tiburon, CA 
94920. 

THERE 
IS 
ONLY 
ONE 
MAGA¬ 
ZINE 
FOR 
THE 
ELEC¬ 
TRONIC 
MUSICIAN* 
Introducing 

ROLAND 
USERS 
GROUP 
Featuring 
The incredible success story of 
the BOSS Products Group; Who’s 
using the new Roland Jupiter-8 
and Guitar System and how it’s 
influencing their music; 
A conversation with Jeff Baxter; 
The advantages of interfacing; 
The Roland Synthesizer Tape 
Contest; Song of the Month Club; 
Innovative new products, hot 
off the Roland production line... 
and more! 

*THAT YOU 
CAN GET FREE 
JUST BY 
REQUESTING IT! 

Wanted 

Records & Tapes 
Records/T apes/Imports 
HUGE SELECTION OF IMPORT AND 
American records. New releases, Japanese, 
cutouts. Fast mail and phone order service! 
Charges welcome! Safe delivery! New updated 
catalog $ 1 (refundable w/order). 
Moby Music 
14410 Ventura 
Sherman Oaks, CA 91423 

Imported Records 
HIGH-QUALITY ROCK, NEW MUSIC 
audiophile pressings from Japan, Australia, 
Canada, England, Europe, Mexico. Large se¬ 
lection, 24-hour service. Free catalog. 
Scheherazade Records 
Box 607-RD 
Carrboro, NC 27510 

Japanese and Picture Discs! 
WE'VE GOT THE GOOD STUFF! 
Send $1 (refundable with order) for complete 
catalog! Music For You, Box 595N, Newing-
ton, CT 061 11._ 

Rock ’n’ Roll Party Tapes! 
ALL GROUPS - LOW PRICES - FREE 
catalog: Angel Products, Box 119-RC, Haup¬ 
pauge, NY 11788. 

Rare Rock Specialist! 
LARGEST 50’s & 60 s SELECTION, 
Rockabilly & Psychedelia; reissues & origi¬ 
nals—Latest French pressings of your fave 
80’s artists: Springsteen, E. John, Police, K. 
Bush, O.N.J. etc.—Many are French only! 
Specify interests - Send stamp for list - Retail 
& wholesale (212) 675-2768. Midnight Reds., 
Box 390 R, N.Y., N.Y. 10011._ 

Shane’s Record Finding Service 
FROM ROCK TO FOLK, PUNK TO 
jazz, industrial to easy listening, we can find 
just about anything ever made! Give us a try! 
We aim to please! Send request plus 3-200 
stamps for catalog. Box 6314, San Rafael, CA 
94903._ 

Trade in your old phono 
needle for a new diamond stylus. Send 

old needle and $5.99 ck. or M.O. Some high¬ 
er. Broadway Dists., 4720 Duncannon Rd., 
Baltimore, MD 21208._ 

ELVIS COSTELLO, THE CLASH, DEAD 
Kennedys and more British and American al¬ 
bums, 12”s and singles. Big selection of Brit¬ 
ish and American publications and books. 
Send 200 stamp for list. Cross-Country, Dept. 
716, Box 50416, Washington, DC 20004. 

WORLD’S RECORDS. FEATURING 
Rhythm & Blues/Western Swing/Blues/Ear-
ly Rock and more. For a free copy of our sup¬ 
plement please write: World’s Records, Box 
2613, Dept. Q, San Rafael, CA 94912. 

Wanted: Rock Interviews 
FOR ROLLING STONE MAGAZINE'S 
“Continuous History of Rock A Roll“ radio 
program. Original material only. Must be air 
quality. Payment upon acceptance. Not re¬ 
sponsible for unsolicited tapes! Call or write 
Roxy Myzal at ROLLING STONE Maga¬ 
zine, 745 Fifth Ave., New York, NY 10151; 

WANTED! RECORD RATERS TO RE-
view and rate nationally released record al¬ 
bums. Send $2 for application, postage and 
processing. Music Man, Box 135R, Cudahy, 
WI 53110. 

Get the new ROLAND USERS 
GROUP absolutely free by 
filling out the form below, and 
sending it to RolandCorp US, 
2401 Saybrook Ave., Los Angeles, 
CA 90045. 

Name 

Street 

C‘«y 
State 

Zip_ 
TR 

RAW SPEAKERS 

KITS 
PLANS 
GUITAR 
SPEAKERS [ 

SEAS 
AUDAX 
BECKER 
PHILLIPS 

MANY MORE 

SIZZLING TWEETERS 
SMOKING 

OVER 
WOOFERS 
30,000 PARTS 

FOR OUR NEW 1083 CATALOG INCLUDING 
COMPLETE SUBWOOFER PLANS 

SEND S1.00 TO: SRC AUDIO . DEPT. RRS 
3238 TOWERWOOD DR.. DALLAS. TX 75234 

T-SHIRTS 

IKE CLASSIC T SHIRT in Black, Red or Navy 

with white Rolling Stone logo. Or white "T" shirt 

with red logo. All 100% cotton $6 95 

THE BASEBAU JERSEY in Black body with 

Y< length white sleeves, white logo. Or white 

body, navy sleeves, navy logo. 50-50 poly¬ 

cotton $9 95 

THE SWEAT SHIRT in Black. Red or Navy with 

white logo White sweat with red logo. Or gray 

sweat with black logo S12.95 

THE NIGHTSHIRT V-neck, knee length 

with 2 side slits. In Black or Red with white 

logo $12.95 

FREE! Desk top cigarette lighter with purchase 

of 3 or more items. 

All available in S, M, IA XL 

Add $1.50 per item for postage & handling. 

Send check or money order to: 

MAGNOLIA PRODUCTS. 

M Fairview Drive 

Albertson. N.Y. 11507 

N.Y. State residents add 7% sales tax 

Rock Read, where rock ’n’ roll is 
more than meets the ear, announces 
its latest collection of more than 100 
import books, new books, old books, 
songbooks and hard-to-find books 

on rock music, from AC/DC through 
Zappa with all stops in between! 

Call or write for our FREE CATALOG! 

Rock Read Dept RDl 799 Broadway 
New York, N.Y. 10003 (212) 533-9700 

FREE! 

1982 
Pro-Line Guide 
* Before you buy a Guitar, Amplifier, Mix¬ 

er, Speaker or P.A. System, get the 
FREE 80 page CARVIN Color Catalog! 

★ Compare Garvin's exceptional values 
and see the latest pro equipment Buy 
DIRECT at Pro-Net prices - saving you 
hundreds of dollars 

w Components include JBL. Renkus-
Heinz, Electro-Voice, Celestion, etc 
Also, a complete line of replacement 
parts for your guitar Find out about 

Carvin's new Tri-Amped Sound 
Systems 

Write or Call now! 
CARVIN. Dept. Rceo, 1155 Industrial Ave. 
Escondido, CA 92025. PH 714-747-1 710 
......CARVIN FREE CATALOG- ..... 
□ Enclosed 51 for Rush First Class Mail. 
Name _ 

Address _ 

City _ 

State _ Zip _ RC80 
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TOP TOP TOP 

OF THE CHART NEW ENTRY 

ANCHORED BY THE TERSE, 
sinuous rhythm pulse of Mick Fleet¬ 
wood and John McVie, Fleetwood 
Mac’s singer-songwriters Lindsay 
Buckingham, Stevie Nicks and 
Christine McVie always seem to be 
on the brink of reaching critical 
mass, so different are their concep¬ 
tions. Yet when they blend together 
into one sweet harmony there isn’t a 
sound like it in all of pop. 
Mirage might just as well have 

been called son-of-Rwraours, depict¬ 
ing as it does a singular sense of uni¬ 
ty against a backdrop of discord and 
dissolution. 
The sound is richly tempered and 

detailed, with Mac’s usual wealth of 
airplay anthems, like Buckingham’s 
futuristic ’50s rock (“Can’t Go 
Back” and “Book Of Love”), Stevie 
Nicks’ gruff, sensual country airs 
(“That’s Alright”) and Christine 
McVie’s bluesy lover’s pleas (“Hold 
Me”). The strength of this band is 
the way they accent each other’s 
songs—hopefully Fleetwood Mac 
will continue to grow together, be¬ 
cause the sum is clearly greater than 
the parts. * 

WITH HIS GLASS-SHATTERING 
cry, Plant epitomized arena rock vo¬ 
cals. Now, on his first solo outing, 
Robert Plant has come up with an 
album that’s more consistent than 
Led Zeppelin’s Presence and every 
bit as listenable as In Through The 
Out Door. Guitarist Robbie Blunt is 
no Jimmy Page, but thanks to simi¬ 
lar licks and identical tone you’d 
never know; ditto drummers Phil 
Collins and Cozy Powell, whose pro 
forma thrashings roll out of the mix 
sounding like Bonzo Bonham him¬ 
self. Such effortless triumph of form 
over content doesn’t speak too well 
of Zepomania in the first place, but if 
you worried about that sort of thing 
you probably never got past the first 
album. 

Perhaps the most significant point 
in Pictures At Eleven's favor is that 
everything from the slowed-down 
tempi to the drum mix feels like 
Zeppelin. Yet at the same time, 
there are enough differences that 
the similarities never seem forced. 
Plant sets up a basic outline, de¬ 
fines parameters for the band, and 
lets his voice do the rest. ❖ 

DEBUT ALBUM 

WHETHER YOU POUND OUT 
the rhythm with a flat rock or syn¬ 
thesize it through a Linn Drum 
Computer, there remain certain 
eternal verities—love, lust, money, 
banana daiquiris. It is these truths 
that are affirmed in the debut al¬ 
bum by the Human League, a Brit¬ 
ish synthesized sextet with all 12 
feet on the ground. Though the lyr¬ 
ics are often bland or clumsily sen¬ 
timental, and Philip Oakey is a 
limited lead vocalist, it is hearten¬ 
ing to find anybody out there using 
the high-tech tools of modern re¬ 
cording for something other than 
halfbaked asteroid angst. 

In the opening cut, “The Things 
That Dreams Are Made Of’ (with 
a nod to Shakespeare), the Human 
League insist life on Earth is the 
best of all possible worlds. “Open 
Your Heart” is Billy Joel-like pop, 
with a rich, Spector-ish arrange¬ 
ment, which concludes with the 
thought “there’s no future/with-
out tears.” 

For those inclined to pray to the 
aliens, the Human League is a good 
antidote. ♦ 




