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Greetings to the membership of the IHRS.  It’s been a nice, hot, summer, full of 
activities.   
 
It’s hard to believe that fall is almost upon us.  My wife and I have been hard at 
work rehabbing our second house, which was built by my maternal grandparents, 
from a Sears and Roebuck kit, in 1916.  The home has been uninhabited since 
my grandmother’s death in 1982, but has received basic maintenance, which 
made the place eminently fixable.  It’s a nice getaway from the west side of Indi-
anapolis, where we currently reside.   
 
Our annual Cool Creek Park meet, which was August 13, was about the smallest 

it has ever been. The iffy economy, inflation and high gas prices have evidently 

not spared the IHRS.  We did have about 6 or 7 vendors, and some good stuff 

showed up. The 25 or so that showed up did have an enjoyable 

time….fellowship is always a good thing.   There are no contest results, and 

there was no silent auction, as a snafu with park management and their security 

team did not allow the shelter house to be opened until after 10am.  By that time, 

some had already packed up and left.  However, park management made it right 

with the club, and our fees to rent the park will be applied to next year’s meet-

ing.  Thanks to IHRS Vice President, Mike Feldt, for setting up everything, rent-

ing the facilities, and bringing the donuts and drinks.   

I’m sure that most of you reading this remember the great event in Richmond in 

2019— we had a combined meeting with the Cincinnati Antique Radio Society 

(CARS).  The turnout was about the biggest we had in many years, reminiscent 

of the “good old days” of the 1990s and 80s.  COVID prevented us from gather-

ing in Richmond in 2020 and 2021, but this year we are back, and this one 

should be the best yet.  Both CARS and the Columbus Antique Radio Associa-

tion (COARA) are teaming up with the IHRS to do, as Bill Morris has described 

it, a “Supermeet” on Saturday, October 8.  We will have a contest with two cate-

gories:  “Indiana Made” and “Ohio Made.”  There will also be a donation auc-

tion—further details are described in this issue.  Thanks to Bill Morris and Mike 

Feldt for their help in organizing this show.  Bill has designed a flyer, which will 

be given to the folks at CARS and COARA for distribution to their members.  

We’re all expecting, as Ed Sullivan would say, “a really big show.” 

Once again, I’ll close with the statement that all the IHRS officers are available 

for your questions, comments, suggestions, or if you’d just like to talk about the 

club in general.  Feel free to contact any of us….we want to hear from you.  Re-

member, it’s YOUR CLUB!   

I hope to see a bunch of you at Richmond, on the 8th!  
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I picked up this little Arvin a couple 
of years ago and I finally got around 
to working on it.  The cabinet was in 
pretty good shape; only two small 
pieces of veneer were missing, some 
loose places needed re-gluing and the 
finish was peeling off.  The two front 
feet were missing, but they’re simple 
3/8” triangular pieces of wood. The 
chassis was rust free but dirty.  All 
the tubes were in their places. The 
grill cloth was dirty but in good shape 
along with the original knobs. When I 
removed the speaker, I found it to be 
perfect, free of holes or rips.  This 
was a good radio to restore. 

I have to thank Preserving Arvin at 
preservingarvin.com for the following 
historical information.  Arvin was 
located in Columbus, Indiana and was 
noted for producing parts for the auto 
industry.  Exhaust systems come to 
mind because I have bought Arvin 

mufflers and exhaust systems over 
the years.  They started building car 
radios in the early 30’s and entered 
the home radio market in 1935 with 
the model 41.  
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They also made popular small metal 
radios from the late 30’s to the early 
50’s.  Arvin also made a great line of 
transistor radios starting in the mid 
50’s.   

What did I find when I really looked 
inside?  Lots of stink bug carcasses 
were in front of the chassis.  Out 
came the vacuum cleaner and I 
sucked them up along with the dirt. 
All the tubes were removed as well 
as their shields.  That allowed me 
easier access to vacuum dirt from the 
chassis top.  Both a paintbrush and 
toothbrush assisted in getting into 
hard-to-reach areas.   

Inspecting the underside revealed 
that little had been done to the chas-
sis over the decades. All but one of 
the paper capacitors had an Arvin 
stamp on them. The two filter capaci-
tors had been replaced and needed to 
be replaced again. Otherwise, every-
thing looked original and it was very 
clean.  The line cord was totally shot.  

I took a gamble and replaced the line 
cord, filter capacitors and the audio 
coupling capacitor--they always 
seem to go bad. A meter was con-
nected to the 80 rectifier to monitor 
the B+.  Upon applying power, the 
radio came to life.  No smoke, no 
static, just lots of stations coming in.  
I was happy! 

The Arvin capacitors’ outer jackets 
fascinated me, so I decided to pop 
out their old guts and put new capaci-
tors inside. It’s a little extra work, but 
it maintains the originality of the 
radio. Some of you are thinking, 
“Who’s going to see the underneath 
of the chassis?” Answer: people like 
me.  I checked the old caps and they 
were all very leaky--it made me won-
der how this radio worked so well.  
Oddly, the only capacitor that 
checked good was a blue Solar ca-
pacitor.  Usually they are bad, but in 
any event, it was replaced anyway. 
The resistors looked fine, none need-
ed replacing. 

Upon re-applying power, the radio 
came to life and sounded great on 
strong stations, but squealed and 
howled on weaker stations. It sound-
ed like a bad bypass capacitor. I got 
out my capacitor substitution box, 
suspecting one of the new capacitors 
I put in was bad. When I touched the 
screen grid terminal of the 6A7, the 
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squealing quit.  I traced the wire and 
it went to the screen grid of the 6F7.  
I put the sub box to that point and the 
squealing quit.  What I discovered 
was a capacitor was never installed 
there!  The factory never put one in.  
Upon installing a new cap, the radio 
played fine.  It is C13 in the Riders 
schematic in volume 6-16.  I’m 
guessing whoever bought the radio 
only played it on strong stations and 
would never have noticed that prob-
lem.  If a weak station was tuned in, 
the squealing would stop when the 
volume was reduced-- this was a 
common problem with TRF sets of 
the 30’s, so this may have been con-
sidered acceptable back in 1935-36.   

When a technician has worked on 
thousands of radios, TV’s and other 
electronic equipment--as I have--they 
are bound to find errors made at the 
factory.  Once in a while we will see 
a part come up missing and usually 
in a non-critical area.  The usual 
problems we see are no-solders; a 
direct connection that either didn’t 
get soldered or a part on a printed 
circuit board that didn’t get soldered.  
These no-solders may work fine for a 
few months, even years, then sud-
denly develop either intermittent 
problems or down right failure.  
Flow solder on them and the set 
works again. 

Arvin was trying to save money on 
this set and make it affordable.  In-
stead of five tubes it uses only four, 
but it is still a superheterodyne.  The 
6A7 is a typical mixer/oscillator 
combination, but the 6F7 is a little 
different.  The pentode section is a 
typical IF amplifier, the triode is grid
-bias detector, which also acts as an 
audio amplifier. This was a popular 
circuit in the four-tube TRF radios 
and Arvin decided to use it in this 

set. While this did save money, the 
disadvantage is that there isn’t any 
AVC.  The grid-bias detector also 
has more distortion than the diode 
detector used in most five-tube sets1.  
Overall, the set sounds good.  With a 
good antenna, it picks up lots of sta-
tions. Strong local stations come in 
just fine with a short antenna.  At 
$19.95 it wasn’t a bad deal for 1935. 

While the alignment was very close, 
I touched it up and the set played 
beautifully. 

The cabinet had some loose veneer 
and two small missing pieces, so I 
did a lot of re-gluing and replaced 
the missing pieces with two pieces of 
scrap veneer. I also had to make the 
two front feet--easy to do with the 
band saw and scrap wood. The cabi-
net is now very solid. 
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I took pictures of the cabinet so I 
would have an idea about the color 
configuration.  Removing the bezel 
revealed that the original color was a 
very dark brown.  The website for 
Arvin had some excellent pictures 
and they aided me in my selection of 
stains and toner lacquers. As I con-
sider this a historic radio for Arvin, 
my goal was to get the cabinet as 
close to the original. 

I didn’t use any strong chemical 
stripper; instead I used an orbital 
sander and removed the old finish. 
When I was done, the cabinet was 
very smooth and ready for refinish-
ing. 

The top appeared to have a slight red 
cast to it, so I mixed a dark red stain 
with a dark walnut stain and applied 
it. A red mahogany toner lacquer was 
added to the top and that quickly set 
the stain. 

A dark walnut stain was used for the 
sides and the front.  The veneer in-

serts were very light in color, so I 
used a Gunstock stain for them.  I 
taped off the inserts and sprayed the 
rest of the front with Van Dyke 
brown toning lacquer.  The entire 
cabinet was then sprayed with satin 
lacquer and wet sanded between 
coats. The top had gloss lacquer ap-
plied to it.  

The grill cloth was dirty but the 
backside looked like new so I simply 
reversed it. I put it all back together 
and was rewarded with a great look-
ing and playing radio! 

 

Footnotes: 

1.  RCA Receiving Tube Manual, 
Copyright 1959, by Radio Corpora-
tion of America, pg. 40-42 
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About a week ago, a fellow collector 
sent me some pics of his latest acqui-
sitions.  At the bottom of the email he 
asked me if I was interested in this 
radio.  He said he'd lost interest in it 
and didn't want to just "toss it.”  He 
also said someone had played with 
the transistor configuration, the chas-
sis had powder on it he suspected 
was from cadmium plating.  Thought 
that the radio looked great and I 
asked if he was sure about getting rid 
of it.  He was, so I gratefully accept-

ed his kind & generous offer.  Said I 
could have it for shipping cost. 

What a neat radio!  From what I 
could find on-line, looked like this 
design came out in 1965.  This set 
probably was built in 1969 as Joe 
said there were many date-codes 
from that year. 
 
Pulled the battery tube and saw that 
one of the wires was corroded by 
earlier battery leakage, so I cut all the 
wires off and attached 5" long pig-
tails to which I soldered on a 9V bat-
tery clip.   
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 In future use I’ll use either a 9V bat-
tery or 6 "AA" cells to power the set.  
I’ll clean the factory battery enclo-
sure and put it into storage (always 
try to keep all original parts for future 
owners). 
 

One of the P-P output transistors was 
in the "driver" socket, so after deter-
mining proper pinout, installed in its 
correct place. I had a Japanese 2SB56 
PNP audio transistor in my parts 
drawer, so installed it for testing. 
Believe it or not, the Zenith output 
transistors were made in Holland! 
Found this out after removing 
heatsink. The service info was from 
an earlier version with nearly identi-
cal chassis, but used rectangular 
sockets for its outputs which had in-
line pins. 
 
Powered it up and it works fine on all 
bands.  And the backlight illuminates 
everything---wow!  
 
The chrome is in excellent shape & 
the leather is great--still SMELLS 
like leather! Plan to pull chassis to 
detail clean and flatten the slight 
dents in speaker grille.  Will probably 
recap when apart even though it 
works well as is. 
 
Not to worry about the white powder-
-pretty sure it is zinc from galvaniz-
ing. Have seen ductwork in damp 
crawlspaces with same "stuff" as well 
as on other radios that were in a damp 
environment. 
 
I didn't see a switch for "navigation", 
thought that RF level control had to 
be used at all times.  Looked at the 
service info that Dave sent me and 
saw a switch in schematic.  Found 
that it was part of the RF level con-
trol.  When off, the normal AVC cir-

cuit is active---but when turned it off, 
the radio goes dead. Tried it again 
and it worked great in "off" position 
with AVC functioning! Looked like 
either the switch contacts were a bit 
dirty or spring tension were weak as 
there is a delay before they make 
connection... Something for other 
owners to keep in mind. 

After taking clear pics of antenna 
wiring connections & lead dress, I 
disconnected its lugs, removed knobs, 
jacks, and four screws to pull chassis.  
It's like a "miniature" Trans-Oceanic 
inside.  While searching for the elec-
trolytics, noticed that the positive 
lead of the large "dual" filter cap was 
only loosely bent around chassis ter-
minal and NOT even soldered--AND 
only barely touching (see pic below) ! 
An obvious factory error---amazed it 
worked so well.   

 
Joe was right about that powder on 
chassis and components---fingertips 
were covered with it while handling 
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chassis. Sure hope it is zinc! But am 
being careful to wash hands and 
tools after contact. 
 
Appears that the front panel should 
come off case easily since studs are 
"nutted", so hope that cleaning & 
"flattening" of minor dents in grille 
will be fairly simple. 
 
Disassembled and detail cleaned all 
knobs & case components. Didn't 
realize how much crud had gotten 
into the grille mesh from dirty fin-
gertips ! Took quite a bit of vigorous 
scrubbing with toothbrush & dish-
soap solution to get it clean. Was 
able to work out most of the minor 
denting with fingers.  Was surprised 
to find that the front panel was a 
heavy chrome metal casting—
thought that since this radio was 
newer it would be plated plastic. 

The battery holder had a bit of dried 
leakage residue and rust inside the 
tube, so I scrubbed it first with vine-
gar then dish-soap solution before a 
final rinse and dry.  Was very careful 
not to damage label.  

The clear plastic tuning dial was 
nearly flawless except for a small, 
thin outline of where a splash of 
paint had been. Tried Isopropyl alco-
hol on one of the mounting tabs to 
make sure it was safe to use, then 
carefully wiped off this residue.  It 
left some cloudiness, so I went over 
entire outer surface with Novus-2 
and it appeared better than before. 
While I had the antenna assembly off 
for cleaning, decided to reconnect it 
to chassis and peak the tuning cap 
RF trimmer.  Had the radio tuned on 
my favorite low-power station 
(WSAL 1230) which is around 70 
miles away.  It is the only daytime 
AM station which plays great oldies.  
Grateful that the signal level came 
up significantly, thus putting this set 
into the "more usable" category. 

 
 
Below are the parts pics after clean-
ing.  Note the circular light diffuser 
which mounts under compass. The 
"collector tab" sits over the top of 
dial-lamp---neat engineering. 
 



14  

 

After recapping with new electrolyt-
ics, I was rewarded with an excellent 
performing set.  Sounds MUCH bet-
ter--especially at higher volumes... 
 

Below are the chassis pics. 

 
 

Here is the finished set.  The leather 
hinge back cover is the only cosmet-
ic issue with radio—it has torn even 
more with my handling, unfortunate-
ly.  The rest of case is pliable & ex-
cellent. 
Note the fold-up sights at each end 
of antenna bar. 
 
Wish I could get a good pic of this 
"lit up". the dial-light not only 
brightly illuminates the entire tuning 
dial but the compass rose as well---
sure looks neat! 

The last pic shows this radio next to 
1958 Royal 1000-D for size compar-
ison. As Joe mentioned, this set had 
components with 1969 date codes 
and I found a couple parts dated 
1968. 
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It is with a heavy heart to report that Shirley Gross, 
wife of the late  IHRS Member Herman Gross, died 
on Wednesday, October 20, 2021.  She was 86 years 
old.  Shirley was a devoted wife, mother, grand-
mother, and great-grandmother. 
Shirley met Herman in 1950, and fell so deeply in 
love with him that she wanted to quit school and 
marry him right away.  Herman encouraged her to 
finish high school first.  On September 10, 1955 
they married at St. Mark's Lutheran Church in Wau-
watosa, WI.  They were married 65 years.  
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